

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>		<b>PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS TAMPA, FL</b>					
<b>Original Signature</b>							
		<b>Year I</b>		<b>Option Year II</b>		<b>Option Year III</b>	
		December 1, 2014		December 1, 2015		December 1, 2016	
		November 30, 2015		November 30, 2016		November 30, 2017	
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>							
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG						
	XLG – 3XL						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							

**Non Responsive**  
**Non Responsive**  
**No Samples Included with Submittal**

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>		<b>CPR SAVERS &amp; FIRST AIDE SCOTTSDALE AZ</b>					
<b>Original Signature</b>							
		<b>Year I</b>		<b>Option Year II</b>		<b>Option Year III</b>	
		December 1, 2014		December 1, 2015		December 1, 2016	
		November 30, 2015		November 30, 2016		November 30, 2017	
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>							
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG						
	XLG – 3XL						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							

**Non Responsive**  
**Non Responsive**  
**No Samples Included with Submittal**

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>		<b>HP PRODUCTS ALSIP IL</b>					
<b>Original Signature</b>							
		<b>Year I</b>		<b>Option Year II</b>		<b>Option Year III</b>	
		December 1, 2014		December 1, 2015		December 1, 2016	
		November 30, 2015		November 30, 2016		November 30, 2017	
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>							
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG						
	XLG – 3XL						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							

**Non Responsive**  
**Non Responsive**  
**No Samples Included with Submittal**

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>		<b>TRONEX MOUNT OLIVE NJ</b>					
<b>Original Signature</b>							
		<u>Year I</u>		<u>Option Year II</u>		<u>Option Year III</u>	
		December 1, 2014		December 1, 2015		December 1, 2016	
		November 30, 2015		November 30, 2016		November 30, 2017	
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>							
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG						
	XLG – 3XL						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							

**Non Responsive**  
**Non Responsive**  
**No Samples Included with Submittal**

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

**Date: 10/16/14**  
**Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves**

<b>Vendor City/State</b>		<b>MIDWEST MEDICAL DAYTONA FL</b>					
<b>Original Signature</b>		<b>YES</b>					
		<b>Year I</b>		<b>Option Year II</b>		<b>Option Year III</b>	
		December 1, 2014		December 1, 2015		December 1, 2016	
		November 30, 2015		November 30, 2016		November 30, 2017	
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>		<b>YES</b>					
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG	\$6.70	\$67.00	\$6.83	\$68.30	\$6.97	\$69.70
	XLG	\$6.70	\$67.00	\$6.83	\$68.30	\$6.97	\$69.70
Brand/Mfg #:		Digicare Optigrip					
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	XLG	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	XLG	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG	\$8.04	\$80.40	\$8.20	\$82.00	\$8.37	\$83.70
	XLG	\$8.04	\$80.40	\$8.20	\$82.00	\$8.37	\$83.70
Brand/Mfg #:		Digicare Frontline 9"					
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	XLG – 3XL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG	\$10.00	\$100.00	\$10.20	\$102.00	\$10.40	\$104.00
Brand/Mfg #:		Digicare					

Sent to **20** potential bidders. Submittals received from **28**.

INTERNAL USE ONLY

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>		<b>HENRY SCHEIN IRMO SC</b>					
<b>Original Signature</b>		<b>YES</b>					
		<u>Year I</u>		<u>Option Year II</u>		<u>Option Year III</u>	
		December 1, 2014		December 1, 2015		December 1, 2016	
		November 30, 2015		November 30, 2016		November 30, 2017	
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>		<b>YES</b>					
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG						
	XLG – 3XL						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:		Microflex Safe Grip SG375L					

**Non Responsive**  
**Non Responsive**  
**No Product Sheets Included with Submittal**

Sent to **20** potential bidders. Submittals received from **28**.

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>		<b>GARDEN STATE MEDICAL LAKEWOOD NJ</b>					
<b>Original Signature</b>		<b>YES</b>					
		<u>Year I</u>		<u>Option Year II</u>		<u>Option Year III</u>	
		December 1, 2014		December 1, 2015		December 1, 2016	
		November 30, 2015		November 30, 2016		November 30, 2017	
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>		<b>YES</b>					
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG						
	XLG – 3XL						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							

*Non Responsive*  
*Non Responsive*  
*No Product Sheets Included with Submittal*

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>		<b>BOUNTREE MEDICAL DUBLIN OH</b>					
<b>Original Signature</b>		<b>YES</b>					
		<u>Year I</u>		<u>Option Year II</u>		<u>Option Year III</u>	
		December 1, 2014		December 1, 2015		December 1, 2016	
		November 30, 2015		November 30, 2016		November 30, 2017	
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>		<b>YES</b>					
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG						
	XLG – 3XL						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							

**Non Responsive**  
**Non Responsive**  
**No Product Sheets Included with Submittal**

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.



**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

**Date: 10/16/14**  
**Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves**

<b>Vendor City/State</b>	<b>HUTCHINS &amp; HUTCHINS WAYNESBOR VA</b>						
<b>Original Signature</b>	<b>YES</b>						
	<b>Year I</b>	<b>Option Year II</b>	<b>Option Year III</b>				
	December 1, 2014	December 1, 2015	December 1, 2016				
	November 30, 2015	November 30, 2016	November 30, 2017				
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>				<b>YES</b>			
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG	\$6.25	\$62.50	\$6.44	\$64.40	\$6.64	\$66.40
	XLG	\$6.25	\$62.50	\$6.44	\$64.40	\$6.64	\$66.40
Brand/Mfg #:		Innovative Healthcare 153100 → 153350					
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG	\$3.52	\$35.20	\$3.63	\$36.30	\$3.74	\$37.40
	XLG	\$3.52	\$35.20	\$3.63	\$36.30	\$3.74	\$37.40
Brand/Mfg #:		Innovative Healthcare 153100 → 153350					
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG	\$7.06	\$70.60	\$7.27	\$72.70	\$7.49	\$74.90
	XLG – Only	\$7.06	\$70.60	\$7.27	\$72.70	\$7.49	\$74.90
Brand/Mfg #:		Amercare 1400-1 → 1400-4					
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
Brand/Mfg #:							

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>		<b>A DAIGGER &amp; CO VERNON HILLS IL</b>					
<b>Original Signature</b>		<b>YES</b>					
		<u>Year I</u>		<u>Option Year II</u>		<u>Option Year III</u>	
		December 1, 2014		December 1, 2015		December 1, 2016	
		November 30, 2015		November 30, 2016		November 30, 2017	
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>		<b>YES</b>					
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG						
	XLG – 2XL						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							

*Non Responsive*  
*Non Responsive*  
*Non Responsive*

*No Product Sheets Included with Submittal*

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>	<b>PRO2 PINOLE CA</b>						
<b>Original Signature</b>	<b>YES</b>						
	<u>Year I</u>	<u>Option Year II</u>	<u>Option Year III</u>				
	December 1, 2014	December 1, 2015	December 1, 2016				
	November 30, 2015	November 30, 2016	November 30, 2017				
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>		<b>YES</b>					
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG	\$4.85	\$48.50	\$5.14	\$51.40	\$5.45	\$54.50
	XLG	\$4.85	\$48.50	\$5.14	\$51.40	\$5.45	\$54.50
Brand/Mfg #:		CRANBERRY CONTOUR 3116-S; 3117-M; 3118-L; 3119-XL					
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	XLG – 3XL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brand/Mfg #:							

Sent to **20** potential bidders. Submittals received from **28**.

INTERNAL USE ONLY

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>	<b>PROFESSIONAL MEDICAL &amp; SURGICAL SUPPLY NEW LENOX IL</b>						
<b>Original Signature</b>	<b>YES</b>						
	<b>Year I</b>	<b>Option Year II</b>	<b>Option Year III</b>				
	December 1, 2014	December 1, 2015	December 1, 2016				
	November 30, 2015	November 30, 2016	November 30, 2017				
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>			<b>YES</b>				
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG						
	XLG – 3XL						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							

**Non Responsive**  
**Non Responsive**  
**No Product Sheets Included with Submittal**

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>		<b>NEOGEN LANSING MI</b>					
<b>Original Signature</b>		<b>YES</b>					
		<b><u>Year I</u></b>		<b><u>Option Year II</u></b>		<b><u>Option Year III</u></b>	
		December 1, 2014		December 1, 2015		December 1, 2016	
		November 30, 2015		November 30, 2016		November 30, 2017	
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>		<b>YES</b>					
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG						
	XLG – Only						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							

*Non Responsive*  
*Non Responsive*  
*No Product Sheets Included with Submittal*

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>	<b>STAPLES BROOMFIELD CO</b>						
<b>Original Signature</b>	<b>YES</b>						
	<b>Year I</b>		<b>Option Year II</b>		<b>Option Year III</b>		
	December 1, 2014		December 1, 2015		December 1, 2016		
	November 30, 2015		November 30, 2016		November 30, 2017		
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>							<b>YES</b>
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Box	Case	Box
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG – 3XL						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG	\$8.76	\$87.60	\$8.76	\$87.60	\$8.76	\$87.60
Brand/Mfg #:		AMBITEX L620					

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

**Date: 10/16/14**  
**Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves**

<b>Vendor City/State</b>	<b>MISSION MEDICAL EATONTOWN NJ</b>						
<b>Original Signature</b>	<b>YES</b>						
	<b>Year I</b>	<b>Option Year II</b>	<b>Option Year III</b>				
	December 1, 2014	December 1, 2015	December 1, 2016				
	November 30, 2015	November 30, 2016	November 30, 2017				
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>		<b>YES</b>					
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG	\$4.40	\$39.00	\$4.50	\$40.00	\$4.60	\$41.00
	XLG	\$4.40	\$39.00	\$4.50	\$40.00	\$4.60	\$41.00
Brand/Mfg #:		VIBRANT 98225-98229 AURELIA/SUPERMAX					
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG	\$3.90	\$34.00	\$4.00	\$35.00	\$4.10	\$36.00
	XLG	\$3.90	\$34.00	\$4.00	\$35.00	\$4.10	\$36.00
Brand/Mfg #:		VINTAGE 28826-28829 AURELIA/SUPERMAX					
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG	\$2.90	\$27.00	\$3.00	\$28.00	\$3.10	\$29.00
	XLG	\$2.90	\$27.00	\$3.00	\$28.00	\$3.10	\$29.00
Brand/Mfg #:		SYNTHETICVARE PVE5600-5604 EMERALD GLOVES					
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG	\$7.60	\$69.00	\$7.80	\$71.00	\$8.00	\$73.00
	XLG – 3XL	\$7.60	\$69.00	\$7.80	\$71.00	\$8.00	\$73.00
Brand/Mfg #:		SEMPERFORCE BKNF104-106 SEMPERMED GLOVES					
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
Brand/Mfg #:							

Sent to **20** potential bidders. Submittals received from **28**.

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>	<b>EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS CUDAHY WI</b>						
<b>Original Signature</b>	<b>YES</b>						
	<b>Year I</b>		<b>Option Year II</b>		<b>Option Year III</b>		
	December 1, 2014		December 1, 2015		December 1, 2016		
	November 30, 2015		November 30, 2016		November 30, 2017		
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>				<b>YES</b>			
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG	\$6.96	\$69.60	\$7.14	\$71.40	\$7.32	\$73.20
	XLG	\$6.96	\$69.60	\$7.14	\$71.40	\$7.32	\$73.20
Brand/Mfg #:		MICROFLEX FM0150S, FM0150M, FM0150L, FM0150XL					
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG	\$61.17	\$61.70	\$6.33	\$63.30	\$6.50	\$65.00
	XLG	\$6.17	\$61.70	\$6.33	\$63.30	\$6.50	\$65.00
Brand/Mfg #:		DYNAREX 6502, 6503, 6504, 6505					
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	XLG – 3XL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brand/Mfg #:							

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.



**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>	<b>LABSOURCE NORTHLAKE IL</b>						
<b>Original Signature</b>	<b>YES</b>						
	<b>Year I</b>		<b>Option Year II</b>		<b>Option Year III</b>		
	December 1, 2014		December 1, 2015		December 1, 2016		
	November 30, 2015		November 30, 2016		November 30, 2017		
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>				<b>YES</b>			
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG						
	XLG – 3XL						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							

Non Responsive  
 Non Responsive  
 No Product Sheets Included with Submittal

Sent to **20** potential bidders. Submittals received from **28**.

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

**Date: 10/16/14**  
**Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves**

<b>Vendor City/State</b>	<b>INTERBORO PACKAGING MONTGOMERY NY</b>						
<b>Original Signature</b>	<b>YES</b>						
	<b>Year I</b>	<b>Option Year II</b>	<b>Option Year III</b>				
	December 1, 2014	December 1, 2015	December 1, 2016				
	November 30, 2015	November 30, 2016	November 30, 2017				
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>				<b>YES</b>			
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG	\$3.38	\$33.80	\$3.88	\$38.80	\$4.46	\$44.60
	XLG	\$3.38	\$33.80	\$3.88	\$38.80	\$4.46	\$44.60
Brand/Mfg #:		AURELIA LP-E					
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG	\$6.29	\$31.45*	\$7.23	\$36.15*	\$8.31	\$41.58*
	XLG – 3XL	\$6.97	\$34.85*	\$8.02	\$40.10*	\$9.22	\$46.10*
Brand/Mfg #:		SAFETY ZONE					
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brand/Mfg #:							

\*We can only ship 100/box; 10 boxes/case

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

INTERNAL USE ONLY

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>		<b>SOUTHLAND MEDICAL ORANGE CA</b>					
<b>Original Signature</b>		<b>YES</b>					
		<u>Year I</u>		<u>Option Year II</u>		<u>Option Year III</u>	
		December 1, 2014		December 1, 2015		December 1, 2016	
		November 30, 2015		November 30, 2016		November 30, 2017	
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>		<b>YES</b>					
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG						
	XLG – 2XL						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:		SMCBLUE SMCBS					

*Non Responsive*  
*Non Responsive*  
*No Product Sheets Included with Submittal*

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>		<b>CICERO MFG GLENVIEW IL</b>					
<b>Original Signature</b>		<b>YES</b>					
		<b>Year I</b>		<b>Option Year II</b>		<b>Option Year III</b>	
		December 1, 2014		December 1, 2015		December 1, 2016	
		November 30, 2015		November 30, 2016		November 30, 2017	
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>		<b>YES</b>					
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG						
	XLG – 3XL						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							

*Non Responsive*  
*Non Responsive*  
*No Product Sheets Included with Submittal*

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>		<b>CCP INDUSTRIES RICHMOND HEIGHTS OH</b>					
<b>Original Signature</b>		<b>YES</b>					
		<b><u>Year I</u></b>	<b><u>Option Year II</u></b>	<b><u>Option Year III</u></b>			
		December 1, 2014	December 1, 2015	December 1, 2016			
		November 30, 2015	November 30, 2016	November 30, 2017			
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>		<b>YES</b>					
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG						
	XLG – 3XL						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							

*Non Responsive*  
*Non Responsive*  
*No Product Sheets Included with Submittal*

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

**Date: 10/16/14**  
**Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves**

<b>Vendor City/State</b>	<b>MEDLINE MUNDELEIN IL</b>						
<b>Original Signature</b>	<b>YES</b>						
	<b>Year I</b>		<b>Option Year II</b>		<b>Option Year III</b>		
	December 1, 2014		December 1, 2015		December 1, 2016		
	November 30, 2015		November 30, 2016		November 30, 2017		
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>				<b>YES</b>			
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG	\$4.20	\$42.00	\$4.326	\$43.26	\$4.456	\$44.56
	XLG	\$4.20	\$42.00	\$4.326	\$43.26	\$4.456	\$44.56
Brand/Mfg #:		MEDLINE CUR					
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG	\$4.10	\$41.00	\$4.223	\$42.23	\$4.350	\$43.50
	XLG	\$4.10	\$41.00	\$4.223	\$42.23	\$4.350	\$43.50
Brand/Mfg #:		MEDLINE MG					
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG	\$3.00	\$30.00	\$3.09	\$30.90	\$3.183	\$31.83
	XLG	\$3.00	\$30.00	\$3.09	\$30.90	\$3.183	\$31.83
Brand/Mfg #:		MEDLINE HOME					
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG	\$6.00	\$60.00	\$6.18	\$61.80	\$6.365	\$63.65
	XLG	\$6.00	\$60.00	\$6.18	\$61.80	\$6.365	\$63.65
Brand/Mfg #:		MEDLINE MDS					
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
	XLG – 3XL	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG	\$8.00	\$80.00	\$8.24	\$82.40	\$8.487	\$84.87
Brand/Mfg #:		MEDLINE 485602-03-04					

Sent to **20** potential bidders. Submittals received from **28**.

INTERNAL USE ONLY

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>	<b>SHEPARD MEDICAL PRODUCTS ROSELLE IL</b>						
<b>Original Signature</b>	<b>YES</b>						
	<b>Year I</b>		<b>Option Year II</b>		<b>Option Year III</b>		
	December 1, 2014		December 1, 2015		December 1, 2016		
	November 30, 2015		November 30, 2016		November 30, 2017		
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>				<b>YES</b>			
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box -100ct	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG	\$5.30	\$53.00	\$5.30	\$53.00		
	XLG – 3XL	\$5.30	\$53.00	\$5.30	\$53.00		
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box -50ct	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG	\$6.19	\$61.90	\$6.19	\$61.90	No Bid	No Bid
Brand/Mfg #:		ULTIMATES 05342080, 05343080, 05385080					

Sent to **20** potential bidders. Submittals received from **28**.

INTERNAL USE ONLY

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>		<b>GOLF STAR SUPPLY LARO FL</b>					
<b>Original Signature</b>		<b>YES</b>					
		<b>Year I</b>		<b>Option Year II</b>		<b>Option Year III</b>	
		December 1, 2014		December 1, 2015		December 1, 2016	
		November 30, 2015		November 30, 2016		November 30, 2017	
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY</b>		<b>YES</b>					
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	XLG	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:		SEMPERMED SEMPERSURE					
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG – 3XL						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brand/Mfg #:							

Sent to **20** potential bidders. Submittals received from **28**.



**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>		<b>ELKHORN CHEMICAL ELKHORN WI</b>					
<b>Original Signature</b>		<b>YES</b>					
		<u>Year I</u>		<u>Option Year II</u>		<u>Option Year III</u>	
		December 1, 2014		December 1, 2015		December 1, 2016	
		November 30, 2015		November 30, 2016		November 30, 2017	
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY ONLY FOR SECTION I &amp; II</b>							
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG						
	XLG – 3XL						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							

*Non Responsive*  
*Non Responsive*  
*No Product Sheets Included with Submittal*

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

**Date: 10/16/14**  
**Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves**

<b>Vendor City/State</b>	<b>PERFORMANCE SAFETY GROUP FENTON MO</b>						
<b>Original Signature</b>	<b>YES</b>						
	<b>Year I</b>	<b>Option Year II</b>	<b>Option Year III</b>				
	December 1, 2014	December 1, 2015	December 1, 2016				
	November 30, 2015	November 30, 2016	November 30, 2017				
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY ONLY FOR SECTION I, II, III, IV</b>							
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG	\$4.989	\$44.98	\$4.989	\$44.98	\$4.989	\$44.98
	XLG	\$4.989	\$44.98	\$4.989	\$44.98	\$4.989	\$44.98
Brand/Mfg #:	PSG SKINTEX						
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG	\$4.298	\$42.98	\$4.298	\$42.98	\$4.298	\$42.98
	XLG	\$4.298	\$42.98	\$4.298	\$42.98	\$4.298	\$42.98
Brand/Mfg #:	PSG SKINTEX						
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG	\$2.498	\$24.98	\$2.498	\$24.98	\$2.498	\$24.98
	XLG	\$2.498	\$22.98	\$2.498	\$24.98	\$2.498	\$24.98
Brand/Mfg #:	PSG SKINTEX						
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG	\$4.498	\$44.98	\$4.989	\$44.98	\$4.989	\$44.98
	XLG	\$4.498	\$43.98	\$4.989	\$43.98	\$4.989	\$43.98
Brand/Mfg #:	PSG SKINTEX						
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG	<b>Non-Responsive Full Box of Samples not received</b>					
	XLG – 3XL						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG	<b>Non-Responsive Full Box of Samples not received</b>					
Brand/Mfg #:							

Sent to **20** potential bidders. Submittals received from **28**.

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>		<b>TRU MED JACKSONVILLE FL</b>					
<b>Original Signature</b>		<b>YES</b>					
		<b><u>Year I</u></b>	<b><u>Option Year II</u></b>	<b><u>Option Year III</u></b>			
		December 1, 2014	December 1, 2015	December 1, 2016			
		November 30, 2015	November 30, 2016	November 30, 2017			
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY ONLY FOR SECTIONS I, II, III, IV AND V</b>							
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG	\$5.00	\$50.00	\$5.00	\$50.00	\$5.00	\$50.00
	XLG	\$5.00	\$50.00	\$5.00	\$50.00	\$5.00	\$50.00
Brand/Mfg #:		DURASENSE					
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG	\$5.00	\$50.00	\$5.00	\$50.00	\$5.00	\$50.00
	XLG	\$5.00	\$50.00	\$5.00	\$50.00	\$5.00	\$50.00
Brand/Mfg #:		DURASENSE					
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG	<b>Glove did not meet specs</b>					
	XLG – 3XL						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG	<b>Non-Responsive Full Box of Samples not received</b>					
Brand/Mfg #:							

Sent to 20 potential bidders. Submittals received from 28.

**SUMMARY SHEET**  
**County of McHenry Purchasing**

Date: 10/16/14  
 Bid/RFP: Disposal Gloves

<b>Vendor City/State</b>		<b>ICS JAIL SUPPLIES WACO TX</b>					
<b>Original Signature</b>		<b>YES</b>					
		<b>Year I</b>		<b>Option Year II</b>		<b>Option Year III</b>	
		December 1, 2014		December 1, 2015		December 1, 2016	
		November 30, 2015		November 30, 2016		November 30, 2017	
<b>SAMPLES INCLUDED?: One (1) box for each glove style offered is MANDATORY ONLY ON SECTIONS I, II, III, AND V</b>							
<b>Description</b>	<b>Size</b>						
<b>Section I</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex, Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section II</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Latex Low-Powdered	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section III</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Non-Latex Vinyl	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section IV</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Gloves, Nitrile Safety-Powder Free	SM-LG						
	XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section V</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Black Nitrile Powder Free 6 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	SM-LG						
	XLG – 3XL						
Brand/Mfg #:							
<b>Section VI</b>		Box	Case	Box	Case	Box	Case
Autopsy Gloves – extended cuff 15 mil Textured grip Puncture & abrasion resistant	M-XLG						
Brand/Mfg #:							

*Non Responsive*  
*Non Responsive*  
*No Product Sheets Included with Submittal*

Sent to **20** potential bidders. Submittals received from **28**.