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Company and The Toledo Edison
Company).

This is an abbreviated filing limited to
an amendment to a coordination rate to
reflect the cost of emissions allowances
incurred by CEI in compliance with the
requirements of Title IV of the Clean Air
Act Amendments of 1990.

CEI will commence recovery of
emissions allowance costs in rates
effective January 1, 1995 subject to
refund pending the Commission’s order
accepting the filing.

Comment date: February 17, 1995, in
accordance with Standard Paragraph E
at the end of this notice.

13. Atlantic City Electric Co.

[Docket No. ER95–500–000]

Take notice that on January 30, 1995,
Atlantic City Electric Company (ACE),
tendered for filing an Agreement for
Short-Term Energy Transactions
between ACE and Citizens Power and
Light Corporation. ACE requests that the
Agreement be accepted to become
effective January 31, 1995. Copies of the
filing were served on the New Jersey
Board of Regulatory Commissioners.

Comment date: February 17, 1995, in
accordance with Standard Paragraph E
at the end of this notice.

14. Allegheny Power Service
Corporation on behalf of Monongahela
Power Company, The Potomac Edison
Company, and West Penn Power
Company (the APS Companies)

[Docket No. ER95–510–000]

Take notice that on January 31, 1995,
Allegheny Power Service Corporation
on behalf of Monongahela Power
Company, The Potomac Edison
Company and West Penn Power
Company (the APS Companies) filed a
Standard Generation Service Rate
Schedule under which the APS
Companies will offer standard
generation and emergency service to
customers on an hourly, daily, weekly,
monthly or yearly basis.

Copies of the filing have been
provided to the Public Utilities
Commission of Ohio, the Pennsylvania
Public Utility Commission, the
Maryland Public Service Commission,
the Virginia State Corporation
Commission, the West Virginia Public
Service Commission, and all parties of
record.

Comment date: February 17, 1995, in
accordance with Standard Paragraph E
at the end of this notice.

15. Northeast Utilities Service Co.

[Docket No. ER95–513–000]

Take notice that on January 31, 1995,
Northeast Utilities Service Company

(NUSCO), tendered for filing, on behalf
of The Connecticut Light and Power
Company, Western Massachusetts
Electric Company, Holyoke Water
Power Company (including Holyoke
Power and Electric Company), and
Public Service Company of New
Hampshire (together, the NU System
Companies), a Third Amendment to
System Power Sales Agreement
(Amendment) and Bozrah Light and
Power Company (BL&P) and a Service
Agreement between NUSCO and the NU
System Companies for service under
NUSCO’s Short-Term Firm
Transmission Service Tariff No. 5. The
transaction extends the System Power
Sale from February 1, 1995 through
March 31, 1995.

NUSCO requests that the rate
schedule become effective on February
1, 1995. NUSCO states that copies of the
rate schedule have been mailed or
delivered to the parties to the
Amendment.

Comment date: February 17, 1995, in
accordance with Standard Paragraph E
at the end of this notice.

16. New England Power Service Co.

[Docket No. ER95–515–000]

Take notice that on January 31, 1995,
New England Power Company (NEP),
tendered for filing a notice of
termination of transmission services
provided under NEP’s FERC Electric
Tariff, Original Volume No. 3, from CPC
Lowell Cogeneration Unit to
Commonwealth Electric Company.

Comment date: February 17, 1995, in
accordance with Standard Paragraph E
at the end of this notice.

17. New England Power Service Co.

[Docket No. ER95–516–000]

Take notice that on January 31, 1995,
New England Power Service Company,
tendered for filing a revised Service
Agreement between New England
Power Service Company and UNITIL
Power Corporation for transmission
service under NEPS’s FERC Electric
Tariff, Original Volume No. 3.

Comment date: February 17, 1995, in
accordance with Standard Paragraph E
at the end of this notice.

18. Southwestern Public Service Co.

[Docket No. ER95–517–000]

Take notice that Southwestern Public
Service Company (Southwestern), on
January 31, 1995, tendered for filing the
proposed amendments to its rate
schedule for service to Cap Rock
Electric Cooperative, Inc. (Cap Rock).

The proposed amendments relate to
agreements between Southwestern and
Cap Rock in connection with

Southwestern’s guarantee of certain
finance arrangements obtained by Cap
Rock. The agreements will be used by
Cap Rock to construct additional
transmission facilities on its system to
increase its reliability and to facilitate
purchases of full requirements power
and energy from Southwestern.

The two amendments reallocate
funding available to different
construction segments and increases the
overall guarantee of the loan.

Comment date: February 17, 1995, in
accordance with Standard Paragraph E
at the end of this notice.

19. Tucson Electric Power Co.

[Docket No. ER95–518–000]

Take notice that on January 31, 1995,
Tucson Electric Power Company
(Tucson), tendered for filing a
Wholesale Power Supply Agreement,
dated January 9, 1995 (the Agreement)
between Tucson and Citizens Utilities
Company (Citizens). The Agreement
provides for the sale by Tucson to
Citizens of firm capacity and energy in
amounts not to exceed Citizens loads in
a specified service area of southern
Arizona. The Agreement provides for
service beginning February 1, 1995 and
ending on the date that Citizens places
in service certain distribution facilities.
Tucson requests an effective date of
February 1, 1995 and therefore requests
waiver of the Commission’s regulations
with respect to notice of filing.

Copies of this filing have been served
upon all parties affected by this
proceeding.

Comment date: February 17, 1995, in
accordance with Standard Paragraph E
at the end of this notice.

20. Commonwealth Edison Co.

[Docket No. ER95–519–000]

Take notice that on January 31, 1995,
Commonwealth Edison Company
(ComEd), submitted addenda, dated
January 31, 1995, to Com Ed’s
interconnection agreements with
Central Illinois Light Company (CILCO),
Central Illinois Public Service Company
(CIPS), Illinois Power Company (IP),
Indiana and Michigan Electric Company
(I&M), Iowa-Illinois Gas and Electric
Company (IIGE), Northern, Indiana
Public Service Company (NIPSCO) and
Commonwealth Edison Company of
Indiana, Inc. (CECI), Wisconsin Electric
Power Company (WEPCO) and
Wisconsin Power and Light Company
(WP&L). The addenda change ComEd’s
transmission adder for purchase and
resale transactions to ‘‘up to’’ rates, the
ceiling being the existing approved rate.

Edison requests an effective date of
January 30, 1995 and accordingly seeks


