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(ii) Continuation plans. Discuss the
likelihood of, or plans for, continuation
or expansion of the project beyond
USDA support. For example, does the
institution’s long-range budget or
academic plan provide for the realistic
continuation or expansion of the
initiative undertaken by this project
after the end of the grant period, are
plans for eventual self-support built into
the project, are plans being made to
institutionalize the project, are plans
being made to institutionalize the
program if it meets with success, and
are there indications of other continuing
non-Federal support?

(iii) Innovation. Describe the degree to
which the proposal reflects an
innovative or non-traditional approach
to solving a higher education problem or
strengthening the quality of higher
education in the food and agricultural
sciences.

(iv) Products and results. Explain the
expected products and results and their
potential impact on strengthening food
and agricultural sciences higher
education in the United States.

(2) Overall approach and cooperative
linkages.—(i) Proposed approach.—(A)
Objectives. Cite and discuss the specific
objectives to be accomplished under the
project.

(B) Plan of operation. (1) Describe
procedures for accomplishing the
objectives of the project.

(2) Describe plans for management of
the project to ensure its proper and
efficient administration.

(3) Describe the way in which
resources and personnel will be used to
conduct the project.

(C) Timetable. Provide a timetable for
conducting the project. Identify all
important project milestones and dates
as they relate to project start-up,
execution, evaluation, dissemination,
and close-out.

(ii) Evaluation plans. (A) Provide a
plan for evaluating the accomplishment
of stated objectives during the conduct
of the project. Indicate the criteria, and
corresponding weight of each, to be
used in the evaluation process, describe
any data to be collected and analyzed,
and explain the methodology that will
be used to determine the extent to
which the needs underlying the project
are met.

(B) Provide a plan for evaluating the
effectiveness of the end results upon
conclusion of the project. Include the
same kinds of information requested in
§ 3405.11(e)(2)(ii)(A).

(iii) Dissemination plans. Discuss
plans to disseminate project results and
products. Identify target audiences and
explain methods of communication.

(iv) Partnerships and collaborative
efforts. (A) Explain how the project will
maximize partnership ventures and
collaborative efforts to strengthen food
and agricultural sciences higher
education (e.g., involvement of faculty
in related disciplines at the same
institution, joint projects with other
colleges or universities, or cooperative
activities with business or industry).
Also explain how it will stimulate
academia, the States, or the private
sector to join with the Federal partner
in enhancing food and agricultural
sciences higher education.

(B) Provide evidence, via letters from
the parties involved, that arrangements
necessary for collaborative partnerships
or joint initiatives have been discussed
and realistically can be expected to
come to fruition, or actually have been
finalized contingent on an award under
this program. Letters must be signed by
an official who has the authority to
commit the resources of the
organization. Such letters should be
referenced in the plan of operation, but
the actual letters should be included in
the Appendix section of the proposal.
Any potential conflict(s) of interest that
might result from the proposed
collaborative arrangements must be
discussed in detail.

(3) Institutional commitment and
resources.—(i) Institutional
commitment. Discuss the institution’s
commitment to the project. For
example, substantiate that the
institution attributes a high priority to
the project, discuss how the project will
contribute to the achievement of the
institution’s long-term (five- to ten-year)
goals, explain how the project will help
satisfy the institution’s high-priority
objectives, or show how this project is
linked to and supported by the
institution’s strategic plan.

(ii) Institutional resources. Document
the commitment of institutional
resources to the project, and show that
the institutional resources to be made
available to the project, when combined
with the support requested from USDA,
will be adequate to carry out the
activities of the project. Discuss
institutional facilities, equipment,
computer services, and other
appropriate resources available to the
project.

(f) Key personnel. A Form CSRS–708,
‘‘Summary Vita—Teaching Proposal,’’
should be included for each key person
associated with the project.

(g) Budget and cost-effectiveness.—(1)
Budget form. (i) Prepare Form CSRS–
713, ‘‘Higher Education Budget,’’ in
accordance with instructions provided
with the form. Proposals may request
support for a period to be identified in

each year’s program announcement. A
budget form is required for each year of
requested support. In addition, a
summary budget is required detailing
the requested total support for the
overall project period. Form CSRS–713
may be reproduced as needed by
proposers. Funds may be requested
under any of the categories listed on the
form, provided that the item or service
for which support is requested is
allowable under the authorizing
legislation, the applicable Federal cost
principles, and these administrative
provisions, and can be justified as
necessary for the successful conduct of
the proposed project.

(ii) The approved negotiated
instruction rate or the rate allowed by
law should be used when computing
indirect costs. If a reduced rate of
indirect costs is voluntarily requested
from USDA, the remaining allowable
indirect costs may be used as matching
funds.

(2) Matching funds. When
documenting matching contributions,
use the following guidelines:

(i) When preparing the column of
Form CSRS–713 entitled ‘‘Applicant
Contributions To Matching Funds,’’
only those costs to be contributed by the
applicant for the purposes of matching
should be shown. The total amount of
this column should be indicated in item
M.

(ii) In item N of Form CSRS–713,
show a total dollar amount for Cash
Contributions from both the applicant
and any third parties; also show a total
dollar amount (based on current fair
market value) for Non-cash
Contributions from both the applicant
and any third parties.

(iii) To be counted toward the
matching requirements stated in
§ 3405.5 of this part, proposals must
include written verification of any
actual commitments of matching
support (including both cash and non-
cash contributions) from third parties.
Written verification means—

(A) For any third party cash
contributions, a separate pledge
agreement for each donation, signed by
the authorized organizational
representatives of the donor
organization and the applicant
institution, which must include:

(1) The name, address, and telephone
number of the donor;

(2) The name of the applicant
institution;

(3) The title of the project for which
the donation is made;

(4) The dollar amount of the cash
donation; and


