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any employee. With the exception of the
single Shell Oil director, Shell Oil shall
not remove directors of the New Board
except for cause.

h. Except as permitted by this
Agreement, the Shell Oil New Board
member shall not in his or her capacity
as a New Board member receive
Material Confidential Information and
shall not disclose any such information
received under this Agreement to Shell,
Montedison or Montell or use it to
obtain any advantage for Shell,
Montedison or Montell. Any Shell Oil
director, officer, employee or agent who
obtains or may obtain confidential
information under this Agreement shall
enter a confidentiality agreement
prohibiting disclosure of confidential
information until the day after the
divestitures required by the Consent
Order have been completed.

i. Except as required by law and
except to the extent that necessary
information is exchange in the course of
defending investigations or litigation,
obtaining legal advice, acting to assure
compliance with this Agreement or the
Consent Order (including
accomplishing the divestitures), or
negotiating agreements to dispose of
assets, Shell, Montedison and Montell
shall not receive or have access to, or
the use of, any Material Confidential
Information of Polyco, except as such
information would be available to
Montedison in the normal course of
business if the Acquisition had not
taken place. Any such information that
is obtained by Shell Oil pursuant to this
Paragraph shall only be used for the
purposes set out in this Paragraph.
Provided, however, until divestiture of
Polyco, hourly personnel assigned to
Polyco plant operations may continue to
be covered by existing contracts
between Shell Oil and any unions
representing such employees; and Shell
Oil may assign Shell Oil personnel to
perform the accounting, analytical
chemistry, human resources,
information systems, transportation
services and tax functions for Polyco
provided that such Shell Oil personnel
shall enter into confidentiality
agreements in accordance with the
provisions in Paragraph 5.h hereof and
provided further that those Shell Oil
personnel working with Material
Confidential Information of Polyco shall
not be involved in Montell’s PP
Technology, Catalyst Technology, PP
Catalyst or Propylene Polymers
business, as defined in Paragraph I. of
the Consent Order for the period that
Shell must comply with Paragraph 5
hereof. Provided further that the New
Board (as defined in subparagraph 5.b
hereof) may designate and contract with

Shell Oil as a nonexclusive sales agent
for sales of PP Catalyst or Propylene
Polymers by Polyco outside the United
States, provided that all Shell Oil
personnel with access to Material
Confidential Information of Polyco in
connection with such contract or agency
shall, prior to gaining such access, enter
into confidentiality agreements in
accordance with the provisions of
Paragraph 5.h hereof.

j. All earnings and profits of Polyco
shall be retained separately in Polyco.

k. Should any transfer to Polyco of an
agreement, contract or license required
to be included in the Properties to Be
Divested not be possible after reasonable
effort by Shell Oil due to another party
withholding its consent to the transfer,
Shell Oil shall enter into an agreement
with Polyco the purpose of which
agreement is to realize the same effect
as such transfer. Further, Shell Oil shall
secure, at its expense, patent licenses, or
assignments of patent licenses,
extending to Polyco rights and royalty
rates with respect to the manufacture
and sale of Propylene Polymers and PP
Catalyst, and rights to expand
production and sale, no less favorable
than those held by Shell Oil as of the
date of transfer to Polyco of the
Properties to Be Divested.

6. Prior to, or concurrently with,
transfer to Montell of the Shell Merged
Assets, Royal Dutch and Shell T&T shall
ensure that companies of the Shell
Group shall:

a. Take such actions as are necessary
to establish and maintain separate and
apart from Montell the Koninklijke/
Shell Laboratorium Amsterdam
(‘‘KSLA’’) research and development
laboratory of Shell Research B.V., a
company of the Shell Group; and

b. Take such actions as are necessary
to ensure that no Shell research
personnel who have had access to
Unipol PP Technology (other than
Catalyst Technology received by Shell
Oil from other companies of the Shell
Group) within one (1) year prior to the
date of the formation of Montell engage
in research at facilities of Montell.

7. Shell Oil’s Pecten international
marketing organization shall not market
or distribute products of Montell but
may, as requested by Polyco, market and
distribute products produced by Polyco.

8. Prior to, or concurrently with,
transfer to Montell of the Montedison
Merged Assets, Montedison shall

a. transfer to Technipol as an ongoing
business:

i. PP research and development
facilities in the Giulio Natta Research
Center in Ferrara, Italy, by outright
transfer or lease, including transfer of its
PO3 pilot plant, equipment, rights-of-

way, easements, and other rights and
assets appropriate and sufficient to
preserve the Viability and
Competitiveness of the Montedison PP
Technology business.

ii. The irrevocable worldwide right,
for a period not to expire prior to the
divestiture of the Properties to be
Divested, to grant to any person
perpetual Montedison PP Technology
licenses subject to any lawful rights
previously granted to persons not
parties to this Agreement. This right
shall be exclusive subject to the right of
Montell to license Montell Affiliates.

iii. Existing Montedison Licenses and
Montedison’s PP Catalyst supply
contracts with persons other than
Montell Affiliates. Should any such
transfer not be possible after reasonable
effort by Montedison due to the other
party withholding its consent to the
transfer, Montedison or Montell shall
enter into an agreement with Technipol
to service the licenses not transferred to
Technipol and account for revenues
from such licenses strictly for the
benefit and account of Technipol, the
purpose of which agreement is to realize
to the extent possible the same effect of
a transfer of such licenses.

iv. Montedison’s PP Catalyst sales
business.

v. Personnel who possess the specific
skills and experience required by
Technipol sufficient to support, conduct
and preserve the Viability and
Competitiveness of the Montedison
Properties to Be Transferred.
Montedison shall appoint Technipol’s
managers on the basis of demonstrated
ability and specific experience in the
Montedison PP Technology field.

vi. Such other assets (including cash
and working capital) and personnel as
may be required to effectuate the
remedial purpose of this Order and to
assure that Technipol will be capable of
operating independently at the same
level of research, development and
licensing of PP Technology, and sale of
PP Catalyst as existed in the Montedison
Properties to Be Transferred on average
during the two (2) years prior to the
Transfer Date.

b. Physically separate, to the extent
feasible, the assets, personnel, offices
and facilities transferred or leased to
Technipol from those retained in
Montedison and from those transferred
to Montell so as to assure the
independence of Technipol from
Montell and to assure that Material
Confidential Information that is not to
be made available to another person
pursuant to the Consent Order and this
Agreement is not accessible to such
person.


