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1. To preserve the viability of the
MoneyGram Business pending the divestiture
of the Assets To Be Divested as a viable and
ongoing enterprise,

2. To remedy any anticompetitive effects of
the Acquisition, and

3. To preserve the MoneyGram Business as
an ongoing and competitive Consumer
Money Wire Transfer Service until
divestiture is achieved; and

Whereas, First Data’s entering into this
Agreement shall in no way be construed as
an admission by First Data that the
Acquisition is illegal; and

Whereas, First Data understands that no act
or transaction contemplated by this
Agreement shall be deemed immune or
exempt from the provisions of the antitrust
laws or the Federal Trade Commission Act by
reason of anything contained in this
Agreement.

Now, therefore, the parties agree, upon the
understanding that the Commission has not
yet determined whether the Acquisition will
be challenged, and in consideration of the
Commission’s agreement that, at the time it
accepts the Consent Order for public
comment it will grant early termination of
the Hart-Scott-Rodino waiting period, and
unless the Commission determines to reject
the Consent Order, it will not seek further
relief from First Data with respect to the
Acquisition, except that the Commission may
exercise any and all rights to enforce this
Agreement to Hold Separate and the Consent
Order to which it is annexed and made a part
thereof, and in the event the required
divestiture is not accomplished, to appoint a
trustee to seek divestiture of the Western
Union Assets pursuant to the Consent Order,
as follows:

1. First Data agrees to execute and be
bound by the attached Consent Order.

2. First Data agrees that from the date this
Agreement is accepted until the earliest of
the dates listed in subparagraphs 2.a. – 2.b.,
it will comply with the provisions of
Paragraph 3. of this Agreement:

a. three business days after the
Commission withdraws its acceptance of the
Consent Order pursuant to the provisions of
Section 2.34 of the Commission’s rules;

b. the day after the divestiture required by
the Consent Order has been completed.

3. To ensure the complete independence
and viability of the MoneyGram Business and
to assure that no competitive information is
exchanged between the MoneyGram Business
and First Data, First Data shall hold the
MoneyGram Business separate and apart on
the following terms and conditions:

a. First Data will appoint three individuals
to manage and maintain the MoneyGram
Business. These individuals (‘‘the
management team’’) shall manage the
MoneyGram Business independently of the
management of First Data’s other businesses.
The individuals on the management team
shall not be involved in any way in the
marketing, selling or management of any
other First Data business, including the
Western Union Business.

b. The management team, in its capacity as
such, shall report directly and exclusively to
an independent auditor/manager, to be
appointed by First Data. The independent

auditor/manager shall have expertise in
management and marketing. The
independent auditor/manager shall have
exclusive control over the operations of the
MoneyGram Business, with responsibility for
the management of the MoneyGram Business
and for maintaining the independence of that
business.

c. First Data shall not exercise direction or
control over, or influence directly or
indirectly the independent auditor/manager
or the management team or any of its
operations relating to the operations of the
MoneyGram Business; provided, however,
that First Data may exercise only such
direction and control over the independent
auditor/manager, management team and
MoneyGram Business is necessary to assure
compliance with this Agreement and with all
applicable laws.

d. First Data shall maintain the
Marketability, Viability, and Competitiveness
of the MoneyGram Assets and shall not sell,
transfer, encumber (other than in the normal
course of business), or otherwise impair their
Marketability, Viability or Competitiveness.

e. Except for the management team, sales
and marketing employees involved in the
MoneyGram Business, and support service
employees involved in the MoneyGram
Business, such as Human Resource, Legal,
Tax, Accounting, Insurance, and Internal
Audit employees, First Data shall not permit
any other First Data employee, officer, or
director to be involved in the management of
the MoneyGram Business. Sales and
marketing employees involved in the
MoneyGram Business, shall not be involved
in any other First Data business, including
the Western Union Business. Support service
employees involved in the MoneyGram
Business shall not be involved in the Western
Union Business.

f. Except as required by law, and except to
the extent that necessary information is
exchanged in the course of evaluating the
Acquisition, defending investigations or
litigation, or negotiating agreements to divest
assets, First Data, other than sales and
marketing employees involved in the
MoneyGram Business, or support service
employees involved in the MoneyGram
Business, shall not receive or have access to,
or the use of, any material confidential
information about the MoneyGram Business,
the activities of the management team, sales
and marketing employees involved in the
MoneyGram Business, or support service
employees involved in the MoneyGram
Business in managing that business not in the
public domain, nor shall the management
team, sales and marketing employees
involved in the MoneyGram Business, or
support service employees involved in the
MoneyGram Business receive or have access
to, or the use, any material confidential
information about the Western Union
Business or the activities of First Data in
managing the Western Union Business not in
the public domain. Any such information
that is obtained pursuant to this
subparagraph shall be used only for the
purpose set forth in this subparagraph.
(‘‘Material confidential information,’’ as used
herein, means competitively sensitive or
proprietary information not independently
known to:

(a) First Data, with regard to the
MoneyGram Business, from sources other
than the management ream, sales and
marketing employees involved in the
MoneyGram Business, or support service
employees involved in the MoneyGram
Business; or

(b) the management team, sales and
marketing employees involved in the
MoneyGram Business, or support service
employees involved in the MoneyGram
Business with regard to the Western Union
Business and includes but is not limited to
customer lists, price lists, marketing
methods, patents, technologies, processes, or
other trade secrets.)

g. First Data shall not change the
composition of the management team unless
the independent auditor/manager consents.
The independent auditor/manager shall have
the power to remove members of the
management team and to require First Data
to appoint replacement members to the
management team in the same manner as
provided in Paragraph 3.a. of this Agreement
to Hold Separate.

h. First Data shall circulate to all its
employees involved with the MoneyGram
Business, Western Union Business, or the
data processing services provided to either
the MoneyGram or Western Union
Businesses, and appropriately display, a
notice of this Hold Separate Agreement and
Consent Order in the form attached hereto as
Attachment A.

i. First Data shall make available for use in
the MoneyGram Business until divestiture of
the Assets To Be Divested is accomplished an
amount of money for advertising and trade
promotion of the MoneyGram Service not
lower than $24 million annually, with no less
than $10 million for any two consecutive
quarters. First Data shall pay all direct costs
and indirect overheads for the MoneyGram
Business. The MoneyGram Business shall not
be charged with the compensation and
expenses of the independent auditor/
manager.

j. First Data shall make available for use in
the MoneyGram Business until divestiture of
the Assets To Be Divested an amount of
money needed to provide an additional 20
percent sales commission to the MoneyGram
Business sales force on all MoneyGram agent
renewals and MoneyGram agent recruitments
above and beyond the 1995 sales commission
rate for MoneyGram agent renewals and
MoneyGram agent recruitments.

k. The independent auditor/manager shall
serve at the cost and expense of First Data.
First Data shall indemnify the independent
auditor/manager against any losses or claims
of any kind that might arise out of his or her
involvement under this Agreement to Hold
Separate, except to the extent that such losses
or claims result from misfeasance, gross
negligence, willful or wanton acts, or bad
faith by the independent auditor/manager.

l. If the independent auditor/manager
ceases to act or fails to act diligently, a
substitute auditor/manager shall be
appointed in the same manner as provided in
Paragraph 3.b. of this Agreement to Hold
Separate.

m. The independent auditor/manager shall
have access to and be informed about all


