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Subpart C—Take Reduction Plan
Regulations and Emergency
Regulations [Reserved]

[FR Doc. 95–14828 Filed 6–15–95; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 3510–22–W

50 CFR Part 227

[Docket No. 950427119–5149–03;
I.D.060195E]

RIN 0648–AH98

Sea Turtle Conservation: Restrictions
Applicable to Shrimp Trawling
Activities; Additional Turtle Excluder
Device Requirements Within Certain
Statistical Zones; Hearings

AGENCY: National Marine Fisheries
Service (NMFS), National Oceanic and
Atmospheric Administration (NOAA),
Commerce.
ACTION: Proposed rule; notice of
hearings.

SUMMARY: NMFS is proposing to impose,
for a 30-day period beginning with the
reopening of the waters off Texas,
additional restrictions on shrimp
trawlers fishing in Gulf of Mexico
offshore waters out to 10 nautical miles
(nm)(18.5 km) from the COLREGS line,
along a portion of the Texas coast,
between the Texas-Louisiana border and
the line along 27° N. lat. This area
includes nearshore waters in shrimp
fishery statistical Zones 18, 19, and 20
and the westernmost portion of Zone 17
east to Sabine Pass, TX. The restrictions
would include prohibitions on the use
by shrimp trawlers of soft turtle
excluder devices (TEDs), bottom-
opening TEDs, flaps completely
covering the escape opening of TEDs,
and try nets with a headrope length
greater than 12 ft (3.6 m) or a footrope
length greater than 15 ft (4.5 m), unless
the try nets are equipped with approved
TEDs other than soft or bottom-opening
TEDs. These restrictions would prevent
the reoccurrence of high levels of
mortality and strandings of threatened
and endangered sea turtles documented
in Texas after the waters off Texas are
reopened to shrimping.
DATES: Comments on this proposed rule
must be submitted by July 3, 1995.

The hearings are scheduled as
follows:
1. June 19, 1995, at 7 p.m., Galveston,

TX
2. June 20, 1995, at 5 p.m., Rockport, TX
ADDRESSES: Comments on this proposed
rule and requests for a copy of the
environmental assessment (EA) or
supplemental Biological Opinion
prepared for this proposed rule should

be addressed to the Chief, Endangered
Species Division, Office of Protected
Resources, NMFS, 1315 East-West
Highway, Silver Spring, MD 20910.

The hearings will be held at the
following locations:
1. Texas-Galveston County Court House,

(Jury room, 1st floor), 722 Moody
Street, Galveston, TX 77550

2. Texas-Aransas County Court House
(Commissioners Courtroom), 301
North Live Oak Street, Rockport, TX
78382.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:
Charles A. Oravetz, 813–570–5312,
FAX: 813–570–5300 or Russell J.
Bellmer, 301–713–1401.

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION:

Background
All sea turtles that occur in U.S.

waters are listed as either endangered or
threatened under the Endangered
Species Act of 1973 (ESA). The Kemp’s
ridley (Lepidochelys kempi), leatherback
(Dermochelys coriacea), and hawksbill
(Eretmochelys imbricata) are listed as
endangered. Loggerhead (Caretta
caretta) and green (Chelonia mydas)
turtles are listed as threatened, except
for breeding populations of green turtles
in Florida and on the Pacific coast of
Mexico, which are listed as endangered.

The incidental take and mortality of
sea turtles as a result of shrimp trawling
activities have been documented in the
Gulf of Mexico and along the Atlantic
seaboard. Under the ESA and its
implementing regulations, taking sea
turtles is prohibited, with exceptions set
forth at 50 CFR 227.72. The incidental
taking of turtles during shrimp trawling
in the Gulf and Atlantic Areas is
excepted from the taking prohibition, if
the sea turtle conservation measures
specified in the sea turtle conservation
regulations (50 CFR part 227, subpart D)
are employed. The regulations require
most shrimp trawlers operating in the
Gulf of Mexico and Southeast U.S.
Atlantic to have a NMFS-approved TED
installed in each net rigged for fishing,
year round.

Recent Events

On April 30, 1995 (60 FR 21741, May
3, 1995), the sea turtle conservation
measures were revised, for a 30-day
period expiring on May 30, 1995, for
shrimp trawlers fishing in nearshore
waters along two sections of the Texas
and Louisiana coast (statistical Zones 18
and 20, and a portion of Zone 17) in
order to ensure that ongoing shrimp
fishing would not likely jeopardize the
continued existence of listed species of
sea turtles and that the incidental take
level identified in the incidental take

statement (ITS) accompanying the
Biological Opinion issued November 14,
1994 (BO) on shrimp fishing would not
be exceeded, which would require
reinitiation of consultation pursuant to
50 CFR 402.16. The revisions were
imposed as temporary additional
restrictions pursuant to 50 CFR
227.72(e)(6). This provision states that
such restrictions may be imposed upon
the determination of the Assistant
Administrator for Fisheries, NOAA
(AA), that continued takings of sea
turtles by shrimp fishing are
unauthorized, because they would
violate the restrictions, terms and
conditions of the ITS issued with the
BO or would likely jeopardize the
continued existence of a listed species.
The BO specifically requires that such
restrictions be imposed immediately
when sea turtle takings, indicated or
documented, reach 75 percent of the
established incidental take levels. The
restrictions imposed were necessitated
by the continued high rates of sea turtle
strandings occurring along areas of the
Texas coast, and were consistent with
the BO and the NMFS Shrimp Fishery
Emergency Response Plan (ERP).

The BO required the development of
a plan to respond to elevated stranding
levels. The ERP provides a general
statement of policy with respect to
NMFS’ enforcement practice and use of
future rulemaking in response to
elevated sea turtle strandings associated
with shrimping effort and ensures
compliance with sea turtle conservation
regulations. The ERP was signed by the
AA on March 14, 1995, and was
immediately distributed widely among
industry and environmental groups. A
notice of availability of the ERP was
published in the Federal Register on
April 21, 1995 (60 FR 19885), and
comments are being accepted. In
addition, NMFS distributes weekly
reports of stranding events and notices
of enforcement efforts and restrictions
being implemented. NMFS is currently
in the process of revising the ERP based
on comments received.

A complete discussion of sea turtle
strandings in Texas was contained in
the temporary restrictions published on
May 3, 1995 (60 FR 21741), and only a
summary of strandings is provided here.
For the 3 consecutive weeks from April
9 through April 29, strandings in Zone
18 were 12, 16, 6 turtles per week,
respectively. The temporary restrictions
went into effect on April 30, and
strandings for the 2 consecutive weeks
beginning April 30 through May 13
were 8, and 8 turtles per week,
respectively. Forty of the 50 total turtles
stranded during this 5-week period were
Kemp’s ridleys. Texas offshore waters


