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The FHWA is soliciting public
comments and suggestions concerning
this proposal.

(32) Request VI–88(C)—Emergency
Flashers

Southern Bell requested that section
6F–7c of Revision 3 to the MUTCD be
amended to allow the use of emergency
flashers on maintenance vehicles during
normal daytime maintenance
operations.

Southern Bell operates a large number
of small service vehicles that provide
telecommunication services to

businesses and residential homes.
Southern Bell feels that the operation of
emergency flashers, in addition to
rotating domes and strobe lights, are
appropriate for these vehicles.

After review of this matter, the FHWA
has found no research or operational
experience that shows emergency
flashers create an unsafe condition.
Accordingly, the FHWA proposes to
allow the use of emergency flashers on
maintenance vehicles during normal
daytime maintenance operations. This
would give public agencies an

alternative method for displaying
flashing beacons.

(33) Request VII–2(C)—School Bus Stop
Ahead Symbol Sign

The North Carolina Department of
Transportation has submitted a symbol
sign for use as an alternate to the
‘‘School Bus Stop Ahead’’ word
messsage sign. The proposed warning
sign depicts a bus with the extended
signal arm with the Stop Sign as shown
below.
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