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1.3 Possession

No one other than an authorized
manufacturer may possess a postage
meter without a valid USPS meter
license and a rental agreement with the
meter manufacturer and until the USPS
sets, seals (if applicable), and checks the
meter into service. Other parties in
possession of a meter must immediately
surrender it to the manufacturer or
USPS.
* * * * *

1.8 Meter Documentation, Markings,
and Endorsements

Unless excepted by standard, a
mailing of pieces bearing meter stamp
postage must be accompanied by
documentation meeting the standards in
P012 if the mailing contains
nonidentical-weight pieces or pieces
without the full correct postage at the
applicable rate. Each piece bearing
meter postage must show the markings
and endorsements required for the rate
claimed and any special service
requested.

2.0 METER LICENSE

2.1 Procedures

An applicant wanting to be licensed
to lease and use a meter must provide
an original signed Form 3601–A to the
post office where the applicant intends
to deposit metered mail. A meter
manufacturer may, on behalf of the
applicant, electronically transmit the
information requested on Form 3601–A
to the designated USPS license
application central processing center in
USPS-specified format. A single license
covers all meters licensed to the same
applicant by the same post office, but a
separate application must be submitted
for each post office where the applicant
wants to deposit metered mail. There is
no fee for this application and license.
After approving an application, the
USPS issues a license (Form 3601–B)
and one Form 3602–A for each meter
checked into service. The use of Form
3602–A is voluntary, but its use
supports refunds in the case of meter
register malfunctions. If a meter
manufacturer transmits the application
on behalf of the applicant, the USPS
notifies the manufacturer when a
license is issued.

2.2 Licensee Agreement

By submitting an application, the
licensee agrees that the license may be
revoked immediately and the meter
removed by the manufacturer or the
USPS in these cases: the meter is used

in any fraudulent or unlawful scheme or
enterprise; the meter is unused during
any consecutive 12-month period; the
licensee fails to exercise sufficient
control of the meter or fails to comply
with the standards for meter care or use;
or a meter is taken outside the United
States, its territories, or its possessions
(without written permission by the
manager of Retail Systems and
Equipment, USPS Headquarters).

2.3 Refusal to Issue Meter License

The USPS may refuse to issue a meter
license for these reasons: the applicant
submitted false or fictitious information
on the license application; within 5
years preceding submission of the
application, the applicant violated any
standard for the care or use of a meter
that resulted in the revocation of that
applicant’s meter license; or there is
sufficient reason to believe that the
meter is to be used in violation of the
applicable standards. When an
application for a license to lease and use
meters is refused, the USPS sends the
licensee written notice of the reason. If
the license application is electronically
transmitted to the USPS by a
manufacturer on behalf of the applicant,
the USPS notifies the manufacturer of
the refusal. An applicant refused a
meter license may appeal the decision
under 2.5.

2.4 Revocation of License

The USPS notifies the licensee in
writing of the reasons why the meter
license is to be revoked. The USPS also
notifies the licensee’s meter
manufacturer of the revocation so that
the manufacturer can cancel the lease
agreement and remove the meter from
service. Revocation takes 10 days
thereafter unless, within that time, the
licensee appeals the decision under 2.5.
A license is subject to revocation for any
of these reasons:

a. A meter is used for any illegal
scheme or enterprise.

b. The license or licensee’s meter is
not used for 12 consecutive months.

c. Sufficient control of a meter is not
exercised or the standards for its care or
use are not followed.

d. The meter is kept or used outside
the boundaries of the United States or
those U.S. territories and possessions
where the USPS operates (except as
specified in 2.2).

e. Metered mail is deposited at other
than the licensing post office (except as
permitted by 5.0 or D072).

2.5 Appeals

An applicant who has been refused a
meter license, or a licensee who has had
a license revoked, may file a written

appeal with the manager of Retail
Systems and Equipment (RSE), USPS
Headquarters, within 10 calendar days
of receipt of the decision. A licensee
appealing decisions on postage
adjustments may file the appeal with
the same official within 60 days of the
date that the manufacturer submitted
the postage recommendation to the
USPS.

2.6 Licensee Responsibilities

The meter licensee’s responsibilities
for the care and use of a meter include
the following:

a. After a meter is delivered to a
licensee, the licensee must keep the
meter in the licensee’s custody until it
is returned to the authorized
manufacturer or the licensing post
office.

b. Each day of operation, the licensee
may record the readings of the
ascending and descending registers on
Form 3602–A (except that licensees
using metering systems that record these
readings electronically may use system-
generated printed records of the
preceding 12 months of meter activity as
a substitute for manual entry of daily
readings on Form 3602–A). The licensee
may bring Form 3602–A to the post
office when the meter is reset or
examined.

c. The licensee must make meters in
the licensee’s custody and records on
meter transactions immediately
available for review and audit on
request by the USPS or the meter
manufacturer.

d. The licensee must present meters
not reset within a 3-month period to the
licensing post office for examination.
Remote-set meters that are reset at least
once every 3 months need be presented
for examination only annually. Failure
to present a meter for examination as
required following notification can
result in revocation of the licensee’s
authorization to lease and use meters.

e. The licensee must immediately
notify the licensing post office and
manufacturer’s representative of any
change in the licensee’s name, address,
or telephone number, or the location of
the meters, or any other information
contained on the original Form 3601–A.
The USPS thereafter issues a modified
meter license reflecting the updated
information. The licensee must verify
and update license information on a
periodic basis as well as following any
event that indicates the need to update
this information immediately (e.g.,
billings returned to a meter
manufacturer or failure of a
manufacturer to locate a meter for
inspection).


