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narrative describing the budget process,
staffing support, and equipment needed
to implement the program. This
description together with the original
submittal satisfies 40 CFR 51.354.

D. Test Frequency and Convenience
The original submittal did not fully

satisfy 40 CFR 51.355 due to the fact
that Wisconsin’s adopted legislation had
not yet been formally submitted to the
EPA. In its supplemental submittal
WDNR officially submitted its 1993
Wisconsin Act 288, enacted on April 13,
1994, which provides the necessary
authority to enforce the test frequency
requirements of the program.

E. Vehicle Coverage
The original submittal did not fully

satisfy 40 CFR 51.356 for several
reasons: (1) The State had not submitted
its final, signed contract containing
detailed procedures for identifying
subject vehicles; (2) the submittal did
not contain estimates of registered and
unregistered vehicles in the area; (3) the
State had not yet finished final
modifications on its TRANS 131 rule to
establish requirements for the testing of
fleets; and (4) the State had not yet
submitted final performance standard
modeling to account for vehicles that
are exempt from program requirements.
The State’s supplemental submittal
contains final performance standard
modeling runs that demonstrate the
impact of exemptions on the program.
Estimates of registered and unregistered
vehicles will be contained in the final,
signed I/M contract. In its supplemental
submittal, the State included a
commitment to adopt and submit the
final I/M contract and final rule
revisions to TRANS 131 within 1 year
of the EPA’s conditional approval.

F. Test Procedures and Standards
The original submittal did not fully

satisfy 40 CFR 51.357, because the State
had not submitted its final, signed
contract containing detailed test
procedures for the I/M program. In
addition, the State is in the process of
amending its NR 485 rule to establish
specific program cutpoints. In its
supplemental submittal, the State
included a commitment to adopt and
submit the final I/M contract and final
rule revisions to NR 485 within 1 year
of the EPA’s conditional approval.

G. Test Equipment
The original submittal did not fully

satisfy 40 CFR 51.358, because the State
had not submitted its final, signed
contract detailing specifications for
program test equipment. In its
supplemental submittal, the State

commits to submit its final, signed
contract addressing these requirements
to the EPA within 1 year of the EPA’s
final conditional approval. General
provisions for test equipment
specifications are contained in the
State’s Request for Proposal (RFP).

H. Quality Control
The original submittal did not fully

satisfy 40 CFR 51.359, because the State
had not submitted its final, signed
contract detailing its quality control
procedures. In its supplemental
submittal, the State commits to submit
its final, signed contract addressing
these requirements to the EPA within 1
year of the EPA’s final conditional
approval.

I. Waivers and Compliance via
Diagnostic Inspection

The original submittal did not fully
satisfy 40 CFR 51.360, because the State
had not submitted its final, signed
contract detailing procedures for the
granting of waivers, including cost
limits, tampering, warranty related
repairs, quality control and
administration. The State also failed to
include a description of corrective
actions to be taken if the waiver rate
exceeds 3 percent. In addition, the State
had not completed changes to its
TRANS 131 rule to reflect changes that
had been made in the Wisconsin
Statutes regarding the issuance of
waivers.

In its supplemental submittal, the
State commits to submit its final, signed
contract and its amended TRANS 131
rule addressing these requirements to
the EPA within 1 year of the EPA’s final
conditional approval. The State has
included a waiver rate of 3 percent in
all subject areas and has used this
waiver rate in its modeling
demonstration. The State has committed
to this waiver rate and has committed to
take specific corrective action if this rate
is not achieved. The proper criteria,
procedures, quality assurance and
administration regarding the issuance of
waivers will be ensured by the State and
managing contractor and are contained
in general detail in the SIP narrative and
RFP and will be more fully developed
in the final contract.

J. Motorist Compliance Enforcement
The original submittal did not fully

satisfy 40 CFR 51.361, because it failed
to include a detailed description of the
penalty schedule for noncompliance
and a formal commitment to a 96
percent compliance rate. In its
supplemental submittal, the State
commits to submit revisions to its
TRANS 131 rule to establish a more

thorough penalty schedule within 1 year
of the EPA’s final conditional approval.
The State has chosen to use registration
denial as its primary enforcement
mechanism in both basic and enhanced
I/M areas. Motorists will be denied
vehicle registration unless the vehicle
has complied with the I/M program
requirements. Penalties for failure to
register and failure to have vehicles
tested are contained in the Wisconsin
Statutes, sections 341 and 110,
respectively. The legal authority to
implement and enforce the program is
included in the Wisconsin statutes and
regulations contained and cited in the
SIP. In addition, the State has
committed to a compliance rate of 96
percent and has used this compliance
rate in its modeling demonstration.

K. Motorist Compliance Enforcement
Program Oversight

The original submittal did not fully
satisfy 40 CFR 51.363, because the State
had not submitted its final, signed
contract detailing procedures for quality
control of its enforcement program and
the establishment of an information
management system. In its
supplementary submittal, the State
commits to submit its final, signed
contract addressing these requirements
to the EPA within 1 year of the EPA’s
final conditional approval.

L. Enforcement Against Contractors,
Stations, and Inspectors

The original submittal did not fully
satisfy 40 CFR 51.364, because the State
had not submitted its final, signed
contract detailing specific penalty
schedules for stations, contractors, and
inspectors. In its supplementary
submittal, the State commits to submit
its final, signed contract addressing
these requirements to the EPA within 1
year of the EPA’s final conditional
approval. The Wisconsin SIP includes
the legal authority for establishing and
imposing penalties. Contractual
enforcement mechanisms will be
established by the final, signed contract.

M. Data Collection

The original submittal did not fully
satisfy 40 CFR 51.365, because it did not
include a detailed description of
specific data to be collected on
individual tests and data related to
quality control checks. In its
supplemental submittal, the State
commits to submit its final, signed
contract addressing these requirements
to the EPA within 1 year of the EPA’s
final conditional approval.


