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One

Central Bank Independence: Why the Interest?

COUNTRIES ranging from Eritrea to Malta, France, Kazahkstan, New
Zealand, England, and Chile have recently approved, or contemplated,
new central bank legislation. Between 1990 and 1995 at least thirty
countries, spanning five continents, legislated increases in the statutory
independence of their central banks. This represents a rate of increase
in central bank independence many times greater than in any other
decade since World War II (see Table 1.1).

Central banks shape monetary policy, affect exchange rates, and
guard financial stability. They condition economic variables crucial to
national development and growth. Central banks also play a role in
determining the nature of international financial and monetary cooper-
ation. The independent authority of central banks can enhance or cir-
cumscribe democratic governance. Central banks are clearly important
economic and political institutions. The adage among international
observers is “New nations acquire a flag, write a national anthem,
and constitute a central bank.” Why, then, has concern with central
banks, central banking, and independence reached new heights in the
1990s?

The answer lies in several different real world events: the end of the
fixed exchange rate system devised at Bretton Woods, the seeming in-
effectiveness of monetary policy in regulating the trade-off between
inflation and unemployment, the globalization of financial markets,
and European economic transformation, including integration and
post-Communist transition. The rationalist revolution in some of the
social sciences has also contributed theoretical reasons to study central
banking. Growing interest in central banking has fueled normative de-
bate about independence that has, in turn, sparked further interest.

Early research on the political economy of central banking focused
on the consequences of central bank independence, particularly for in-
flation and growth. But recent trends have spurred research on why
and when government politicians delegate authority to central banks.
Central banks have great potential to influence national economies.
Why would government politicians give up control over the economy,
especially when economic performance influences political popularity?
Most answers to this question assume a political economy isolated
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TABLE 1.1
Change in Legal Central Bank Independence by Decade

OverallAverage Overall Average
Decade Increase DecreaseNo. of + MagnitudeMagnitude No. of −

.106 0.601960s 5 .07 0.35
.0870.48 0.56.061970s 8

.12 0.36 3 .06 0.1831980s

.26 2.86 N.A. N.A. N.A.301990s

Source: Calculated from data in Alex Cukierman, Steven B. Webb, and Bilin Neyapti,
“Measuring the Independence of Central Banks,” World Bank Economic Review, 6, 3 (Septem-
ber 1992), and coding of post-1989 charters.

Note: “No. of +” refers to the number of central banks with positive changes in their legal
independence; “no. of −” refers to negative changes. N.A. = Not available.

from its international context. In a world of global financial markets,
however, this assumption is false. In most developing countries na-
tional and international financial circumstances are inseparable. The
following chapters argue that financial events are an important part of
the story of politicians’ decisions to cede authority to central banks or
to honor and protect previous decisions regarding central bank discre-
tion. In short, of the events spurring interest and debate over central
banking, this book suggests that one, the globalization of financial mar-
kets, is of central importance.

The argument, elaborated in Chapter 3, is that politicians use central
bank independence to try to signal their nation’s creditworthiness to
potential investors. The more global financial markets become, the
more politicians must concern themselves with signaling investors.
Specifically, this book argues that the likelihood politicians will use
central bank independence to try to signal creditworthiness is greater
(1) the larger their country’s need for balance of payments support,
(2) the greater the expected effectiveness of signaling, (3) the more se-
cure their tenure as politicians, and (4) the fewer their country’s restric-
tions on international financial transactions.

This chapter outlines what central banks typically do and then sum-
marizes the events and debates that have led both policymakers and
academics to a heightened concern with central banking. In addition to
the events noted above, two debates, one meta-theoretical and one nor-
mative, have also played a role: the debate over rational expectations
models in the social sciences and concern over the economic and politi-
cal beneficence of central bank independence. Chapter 2 surveys re-
search on central bank politics and lays out the domain of possible
explanations for variations in central bank independence, and Chapter
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3, as noted, outlines the argument of the book. Chapters 4 through 9
present results from three different empirical exercises designed to
probe the investor-signaling argument by “triangulating” (attacking
the problem from different angles).1 Chapter 4 summarizes cross-re-
gional variation in central bank politics in the 1990s and suggests that
it is consistent with an argument emphasizing politicians’ perceptions
of international financial pressures. Chapters 5–8 examine the investor-
signaling argument in the context of central bank history in Thailand,
Mexico, South Korea, and Brazil. The final chapter presents the results
of an indirect econometric “test” of the investor-signaling explanation
for central bank independence.

What Does a Central Bank Do?

Much of the politics of central banking arises from the central banks’
role in making monetary policy. Monetary policy, efforts to control the
supply and price (interest rate) of money, can limit or aggravate eco-
nomic fluctuations, inflation, unemployment, and growth. Each of
these affects different groups in society differently. Political concerns
arise because politicians often delegate considerable discretion over
monetary policy to experts, typically in the central bank. In their deci-
sions about central bank discretion, government leaders have to think
about how monetary policy can be both guided by experts and respon-
sive to its varying impact throughout society.

Central banks not only seek to control the money supply but also
perform other functions; they aim to protect financial stability, guaran-
tee the domestic and international payments system, and provide some
range of financial services to the government. Compared with mone-
tary policy, financial stability is easier to portray as equally important
to all groups in society, at least in countries where most individuals
have bank accounts. In the extreme, financial instability involves a pub-
lic rush to withdraw assets from deposit institutions (banks) because
individuals fear these institutions do not have sufficient assets to cover
potential withdrawals. (Bank deposits are among a bank’s “liabilities,”
because the bank is liable to produce cash on demand for the deposi-
tor.) To guard against financial instability, a situation in which banks
cannot produce cash to back deposits, central banks regulate commer-
cial bank licensing, set standards for minimum bank capital, and super-
vise at least a portion of the financial system through the use of in-
house examiners or auditors hired from an outside firm. Supervision
usually involves periodic inspections of commercial banks. When su-
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pervision has failed to detect early warnings of commercial bank fail-
ure, the central bank can serve as lender of last resort. One of the trick-
iest decisions central bankers face concerns whether to lend to a trou-
bled bank in the hope that a small loan can speed recovery, or to refuse
to lend and thus oversee liquidation of the bank. In other words, cen-
tral bankers have to decide if a financial institution’s problems are
short-term cash-flow or “liquidity” problems, or more fundamental
“solvency” problems. To make this decision they must also consider
the impact of one bank’s troubles on the entire banking system.

The task of preserving financial stability overlaps partially with the
task of guaranteeing an effective payments system. An effective pay-
ments system is one in which individuals willingly accept money and
money substitutes in exchange for goods and services. In addition to
actions designed to protect financial stability, the central bank bolsters
the payments system by establishing reserve accounts for commercial
banks, aiding in the check clearing process, and replacing worn-out
currency. The central bank may also play a role in the international
payments system. The central bank often manages foreign exchange
reserves and, in some cases, has some degree of responsibility for the
regulation of foreign exchange rates and procedures.

As fiscal agent for the government, the central bank typically re-
ceives deposits and issues checks for government agencies, issues and
redeems government securities, and contributes to international ex-
change rate management, at least to the extent of conducting official
reserve transactions with other countries. The central bank’s role as
fiscal agent for the government is also politically charged. As banker to
the government, the central bank is in a position to cover the govern-
ment’s overdrafts. A central bank can finance the government in sev-
eral ways: it can buy government securities, it can make unsecured
loans from its reserves, it can print money. Theoretically, the central
bank can impose fiscal discipline on the government.

Central bank independence can have varied meaning and impor-
tance depending on the category of central bank functions. The extent
of independence from the government has the greatest direct impact on
the central bank’s ability to control the money supply. It is difficult, for
example, to control the money supply if the government makes exces-
sive demands for financing that the central bank feels it cannot deny.
Independence from commercial banks is more important than inde-
pendence from the executive for effective regulation and supervision of
financial institutions.

The primary concern in this book is with the relationship between
central bank authority vis-à-vis government, on the one hand, and
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price stability, on the other. The key components of authority are the
ability to freely choose instruments to pursue the primary objective of
price stability and to command government respect for central bank
advice on government finance and fiscal policy. When central bank
independence is high, fiscal policy should be partly influenced by mon-
etary policy.2 Chapter 2 says more about conceptualizing and measur-
ing central bank independence. This chapter turns next to the events
and debates that have given rise to heightened interest in central bank
independence in the 1990s.

Exchange Rate Rules and the Importance of
Central Bank Independence

To control inflation policymakers seek an anchor for prices. The ex-
change rate system devised in Bretton Woods, New Hampshire, at a
global economic summit after World War II provided an exchange rate
anchor. The rules of the Bretton Woods agreement set a fixed rate for
exchanging nondollar currencies to dollars and dollars to gold. Prices
were anchored to a fixed dollar exchange rate. When President Richard
Nixon devalued the U.S. dollar relative to gold in 1971, the global fixed
exchange rate regime fell apart. As the price of the dollar floated,
policymakers searched for new price anchors. Policymakers viewed
central bank independence as one of several possible ways to limit
price instability in a floating exchange rate world. Yet change in the
international exchange rate regime in the 1970s, though an important
part of the context of growing interest in central bank independence, is
not an adequate explanation for the dramatic rise in central bank inde-
pendence in the 1990s. We must also review other considerations.

Central Banking and the End of the Long-Run
Inflation-Unemployment Trade-Off

For many government politicians the value of directly controlling mon-
etary policy themselves shapes the decision to increase or protect exist-
ing central bank discretion over monetary policy. That value has de-
clined since the 1970s, in part because monetary policy is no longer an
effective tool for determining national employment levels. If control-
ling monetary policy does not buy politicians the ability to generate
desired levels of employment, why not cede more discretion over mon-
etary policy to the central bank?
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At the same time, there is another twist to the connection between
monetary policy effectiveness and central bank discretion. Poli-
cymakers may hope that by creating a world of independent central
banks, they may return to the world in which monetary policy is effec-
tive in fine-tuning employment levels. Both factors, a decline in mone-
tary policy effectiveness that therefore lowers the value of government
discretion over monetary policy, and a desire to reconstitute monetary
policy effectiveness, may be behind the current wave of interest in cen-
tral banking. There is a difference between them, however. The former
suggests that the current trend of increased central bank independence
may continue over the long term; the latter indicates the potential for a
reversal of current trends as the value politicians assign to controlling
monetary policy themselves rises again.

Although this is not the place to recount the history of macroeco-
nomic theory, some discussion is necessary to clarify the connection
between the unemployment-inflation trade-off, monetary policy effec-
tiveness, and current interest in central banking.3 In 1958 the economist
A. William Phillips showed that there had been a consistent relation-
ship between unemployment and inflation in the United Kingdom for
more than a century.4 Over the long run, an increase or decrease in
employment yielded a predictable change in inflation. Other econo-
mists studied the long-run trade-off between inflation and unemploy-
ment in other countries and generated similar results. Once this rela-
tionship was hypothesized, policymakers believed monetary policy
could be used to reach a desired level of inflation and unemployment.
Control over monetary policy was therefore quite valuable to govern-
ment politicians, who could thereby respond to constituents’ demands
or tolerance for unemployment and inflation.

In the 1970s belief in the effectiveness of monetary policy to fine-tune
long-run inflation and unemployment levels began to unravel, both
because academic economists changed their theories and because poli-
cymakers found that monetary policy was not working as expected.
The introduction of rational expectations into economic theory led aca-
demic economists to question the underlying micro-level logic of the
models associating monetary policy tools with inflation and unem-
ployment. The logic of the Phillips curve works, went the economists’
thinking, only if inflation is unexpected. But rational individuals antici-
pate government manipulation of monetary policy and its impact on
inflation and unemployment.

Perhaps more important than theoretical developments was the
practical experience of policymakers. By the 1970s it seemed that to buy
lower inflation policymakers would have to pursue very tight mone-
tary policy and suffer the political consequences of very large increases
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in unemployment. Economists coined the term “stagflation” to refer to
this new world in which inflation stayed the same no matter how great
unemployment. By the 1980s this persistent inflation lowered the value
of government discretion over monetary policy.5 But this was not the
only change in economic reality that contributed to the wave of interest
in central banking.

Central Banking and the Globalization of
Financial Markets

A further reason for growing interest in central banks lies in the conse-
quences of financial globalization. Financial globalization raises the
cost of poor monetary policy and increases the value of central bank
independence. As barriers to the international movement of currency
and other financial assets decline and as national governments increas-
ingly permit free international operation of financial institutions, na-
tional financial markets are becoming more and more integrated into
one large international market. In this context, currency sales creating
pressures for devaluation and/or sale of equity or bond holdings that
can negatively affect the price of these assets and often the financial
health of the issuers (companies or governments) quickly penalize na-
tional governments that follow economic policies distasteful to finan-
cial market actors.

Currency traders and investors in emerging market securities tend to
observe central bank actions closely and take them as signals of future
national economic policy and asset performance. Forbes magazine, for
example, exhorts investors to “watch the central banks . . . [as a] rough
rule of thumb for avoiding the carnage . . . [that can] prove treacherous
to emerging stock markets.”6 Interest in central banking has risen with
the internationalization of finance, and particularly with the growth of
global securities markets.

From the point of view of government politicians, the internationali-
zation of securities markets is influential in a very specific way. When
domestic financial regulation and controls on international capital
flows limit the investment options of a country’s national residents,
governments can sell debt at relatively low interest rates. Internation-
ally isolated and “repressed” financial markets can create artificially
high demand for government securities. Especially when other sources
of government revenue are low relative to government expenditures,
as is typically the case in developing countries, the cost of raising funds
through the sale of government bonds is very important. When finan-
cial markets are deregulated and become increasingly internationally
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integrated, government politicians no longer enjoy a captive market
for government securities. When the government has to compete with
myriad other investment vehicles to sell its securities, the value of
central bank independence rises because it can serve as a signal to in-
vestors. In this way, if no other, the internationalization of securities
markets has increased investor and issuer interest in central bank
independence.

This particular source of interest in central bank independence, spe-
cific to the internationalization of securities markets in the 1990s, is
the basis for the more general argument derived in this book. Yet it is
instructive to explore other reasons for the rising interest in central
bank politics in the 1990s as well.

European Integration and Transition

Another reason for the explosion of interest in central banks stems
from the stipulation of central bank independence criteria for joining
the European Union under the terms of the Maastricht Treaty. The
Maastricht Treaty makes central bank independence a requirement for
accession. This stipulation has engendered considerable national de-
bate as European countries try to bring their central bank laws into line
with Maastricht requirements. In this regard we see the connection be-
tween central banking and nationhood quite clearly. British concern
about the central bank provisions of the Maastricht Treaty does not
center on fear that Bundesbank leadership of union monetary policy
will be inflationary. It is rather, in Paul Volcker’s terms, “about Queen
and sovereignty and parliament and . . . [being] in control of things.”7

The association of central banking with national sovereignty is also
part of the reason for the flurry of central bank legislation in the transi-
tional economies of Central and Eastern Europe. Nonetheless, nations
trying to make the transition from centrally guided to market econo-
mies also have a variety of more mundane reasons to be concerned
with central banking. One is inflation, which is among the primary
problems confronting transitional economies. Policymakers perceive
independent central banks with a strong mandate to achieve price sta-
bility as bulwarks against inflation. This is part of the reasoning, correct
or not, that has given rise to a wave of new central bank legislation
across Central and Eastern Europe (and in countries of other regions
with transitional economies).8

Other reasons for interest in central banking in transitional econo-
mies relate to the central bank functions already discussed. Eastern and
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Central European countries, in particular, face the challenge of creating
efficient payments systems and effective, competitive, sound, private
banking sectors. As governments privatize state-owned banks and as
new commercial banks arise to meet ballooning credit demands associ-
ated with the growth of the market economy, the importance of the
central bank’s role as commercial bank supervisor, regulator, and
lender of last resort grows. The traditional central bank role in estab-
lishing and maintaining an effective payments system also focuses
special attention on the importance of central banking in the transi-
tional economy nations of Eastern and Central Europe.

Individual Rationality and Equilibrium
in the Social Sciences

Debate over the Phillips curve was part of a rationalist revolution in the
social sciences. The social world consists of equilibrium, according the
rational expectations view, best explained by modeling the behavior of
interest-maximizing, that is, rational, individuals. For example, the
Phillips curve suggestion of a predictable long-run trade-off between
inflation and employment falls apart if we assume that workers are
rational and adjust their wage demands to expectations about govern-
ment policy.

The rationalist revolution spurred interest in central banks among
economists in the following way. The original Phillips curve story ig-
nored the possibility of rational expectations and the related problem
that the best strategy for a rational actor to achieve his or her goals may
vary over time in response to the actions of others. In the rational ex-
pectations story about inflation and output, policymakers have goals
for the state of the economy. Policymakers choose the best policies for
achieving their goals. Public actions in response to government policy
affect the optimality of the chosen policies. Public reactions are based
on expectations about future government policy actions. The public
expects the government to change its policy course. Citizens know that
rational government leaders will have every incentive to try to espouse
a commitment to low inflation in the long run, while violating it in the
short term when electoral needs demand.

Economists refer to this as the “time inconsistency” problem.9 The
best government policy choice prior to policy implementation is not
necessarily consistent with the best policy choice after implementation,
because the public responds anticipating a change in government pol-
icy. Concretely, there is inconsistency between the politician’s optimal
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long-run interest-maximizing strategy of commitment to low inflation
and the optimal short-run strategy once citizens have taken actions
(like wage bargaining) on the basis of the announced long-run policy.

Economists began to focus on central banks because they viewed
turning policy discretion over to an autonomous institution as a way to
minimize the policy problems resulting from public expectations of in-
consistent government policy. Rational expectations models focused
attention on how central bank independence could increase the credi-
bility of government commitment to a particular policy path by mak-
ing it more costly for the government to cede to short-run temptations
for cheating.10

Political scientists as well as economists model a multitude of politi-
cal outcomes as equilibrium resulting from the aggregation of interest-
maximizing behavior. From this viewpoint central bank independence
is a puzzle. Why would interest-maximizing politicians cede discretion
over monetary policy, which has widespread economic—and therefore
political—effects, to a central bank? Credibility and improved policy
effectiveness is an answer easily borrowed from the economists. But
scholars have gone beyond this answer, searching for explanations that
make central bank independence consistent with a rationality-based
equilibrium view of politics. One argument is that politicians want to
be able to deny responsibility for unpopular monetary policy.11 An-
other is that legislators want a highly informed third party (the central
bank) to help them monitor the monetary policy of a government they
mistrust.12 Still another story, told in the context of the founding of the
Bank of England, is that government leaders seek creditworthiness.13

Finally, political scientists also argue that central bank independence
results when leaders of a party losing office want to make it difficult
for the incoming party to change monetary policy.14 The next chapter
discusses these arguments in more detail. The point here is that the
introduction of rational expectations to social science spurred academic
interest in institutions, particularly central banks.

Normative Arguments for and against
Central Bank Independence

The interest of academics and policymakers in central banking both
reinforces and is reinforced by a broader normative debate about the
social value of central bank independence. Some arguments demon-
strate the beneficence of central bank independence; others proclaim its
malevolence. The main argument for central bank independence is
improved economic performance. The two arguments frequently in-
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voked against central bank independence are that it hinders policy co-
ordination, which has a negative impact on the economy, and that it
contravenes democratic governance.

Improved Economic Performance

Many central bankers propagate the idea that central bank indepen-
dence is a key to a healthy economy. Alan Greenspan, chair of the
Federal Reserve Bank in the mid-1990s, argued before Congress that
“the independence of central banks is an element in keeping inflation
down, and just as importantly, the lower rates of inflation, the higher
the growth rate in productivity.”15 Nonetheless the empirical evidence
supporting this claim is mixed.

Early research on central banks focused predominantly on the rela-
tionship between their independence and economic performance.
While evidence suggests that central bank independence is associated
with low inflation, at least in highly industrialized economies, there is
less corroboration of a hypothesized connection between central bank
independence and overall economic health. And in non-OECD coun-
tries, empirical support is also mixed for the argument that central
bank independence improves economic performance.

Quantitative studies of inflation in OECD (Organization for Eco-
nomic Cooperation and Development) countries find that countries
with more nearly independent central banks, as defined legally, have
lower and less variable inflation than countries with less legally auton-
omous central banks.16 Clark and his colleagues find that OECD coun-
tries with more independent central banks are less prone to political
business cycles.17 But other studies find that although legal central bank
independence is associated with lower inflation, it does not produce
faster or less volatile growth or greater employment.18 And one study
of political business cycles in OECD countries partially contradicts the
Clark et al. findings. Alesina and Summers find no evidence of political
manipulation of economic policy leading to electoral cycles in growth
or unemployment.19

These mixed results are difficult to interpret. For example, one ap-
proach to uncovering the impact of central bank independence on out-
put and employment focuses on “sacrifice” ratios. The argument is that
legal central bank independence should help return us to a world
where individuals expect steady, low inflation. This should be a short-
run Phillips curve world where changes in inflation rates are unusual
and surprising and have an inverse relationship to change in employ-
ment and output. Inflation reduction is inevitably associated, to a mod-
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erate degree, with recession. If central bank independence increases
faith in government policy commitments, we would expect greater cen-
tral bank independence to have an impact on the amount of output the
central bank must sacrifice in order to achieve the desired level of infla-
tion. A country with a dependent central bank might have to give up
two units of employment and output to gain one unit of price stability,
whereas a country with an independent central bank might only suffer
a one-unit output penalty for each unit of price stability. Empirical evi-
dence suggests that legally independent central banks in OECD coun-
tries suffer a greater “sacrifice ratio” than dependent central banks.20

But this result is questionable on several grounds.21 It may be possible
that while the average sacrifice level is higher, lower variance in infla-
tion suggests that the sacrifice is borne less frequently. Another possi-
bility is that the impact of monetary contraction and monetary expan-
sion is different; research failing to distinguish between the two cases
is not an adequate test of the “improved performance” argument.

The strength of empirical support for the case that central bank inde-
pendence improves economic performance becomes more complex
once we turn away from studies based on OECD countries. Legal inde-
pendence in non-OECD countries is not significantly correlated with
low inflation or high growth. Yet regressions run using the central
banks’ governor turnover as a measure of their independence do find
an association with improved economic performance, both lower infla-
tion and higher growth.22

In sum, the evidence does not clearly support an argument for cen-
tral bank independence in OECD countries based on protecting growth
and employment performance. But proponents of central bank inde-
pendence for OECD countries are on firm ground in arguing that it
protects against price inflation. In non-OECD countries there is no
growth-enhancing or inflation-controlling rationale for legal central
bank independence. But the empirical evidence does support a central
bank autonomy argument, whether legally enshrined or not, on the
grounds that behavioral independence in developing countries pro-
tects against inflation.23 Researchers have not demonstrated a clear
negative link between growth and central bank independence in devel-
oping countries.24

Policy Coordination

Opponents of central bank independence sometimes argue that effi-
cient fiscal and monetary policy formulation and implementation re-
quire coordination. Central bank independence, the argument goes,
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undermines fiscal and monetary policy coordination. In his popular
critique of the U.S. Federal Reserve Bank, Greider used the analogy of
a “car with two drivers.”25 Central bank independence, he argued,
leads to “over-steering” because the fiscal policy driver compensates
for anticipated monetary policy and vice versa. The result is an out-
come that is suboptimal from the standpoint of social welfare maximi-
zation in neoclassical economics. Analysts describe the coordination
dilemma as a strategic game over economic policy between two
equally powerful players. If the central bank is independent and has a
preferred macroeconomic outcome different from that of the fiscal au-
thority, the strategic game that ensues might take the form of “chicken”
or Stackelberg warfare.26 For example, if the central bank anticipates a
more expansionary fiscal policy than it believes desirable, it might
implement tighter monetary policy than otherwise called for, in turn
leading the fiscal authority to hold fast to its expansionary path.

During the Reagan administration, opponents of central bank inde-
pendence have argued, lack of coordination led to unnecessarily tight
monetary policy and loose fiscal policy. One of several socially subopti-
mal outcomes was that, fearing expansionary fiscal policy, the central
bank instituted policies that pushed interest rates up, arguably inhibit-
ing capital formation. Another negative consequence of lack of policy
coordination in the Reagan years was currency overvaluation, which
in turn contributed to the United States’ growing trade deficit in those
years. Some have argued that overvaluation induced firm behaviors
that were largely irreversible and left the United States with a perma-
nent tendency toward trade deficit.27

A final problem with lack of coordination, and the game of policy
“chicken” that can result, is a decline in the credibility of both monetary
and fiscal policies. If each party in this strategic, noncooperative game
holds fast to a relatively extreme policy position, the public may cease
to believe in the policy commitments made by either.

There is relatively little empirical research on this topic. But the logic
of the argument itself raises some concerns. Most important, policy co-
ordination is necessary to maximize social welfare because of the small
number of policy instruments, such as monetary, fiscal, or exchange
rate policy, available to policymakers trying to achieve many different
economic targets: inflation, savings, investment, growth, and so on. Yet
lack of policy coordination can stem from a variety of factors other than
central bank independence. Furthermore, depending on how analysts
structure the payoffs in a strategic game model of an uncoordinated
macroeconomic policy process, they can construe the net social cost as
relatively small, especially compared with the potential social costs as-
sociated with political control of the central bank.28
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Democratic Accountability

Typically, central banks are accountable to voters only indirectly,
through their accountability to the executive. Giving central banks
greater independence from the executive and greater policy jurisdic-
tion, opponents of independence argue, weakens voters’ ability to
influence the economic policymaking process. U.S. Representative
Henry B. Gonzalez, for example, has proposed legislation to require
greater popular access to Federal Reserve Board decision making
through virtually immediate public release of videotapes of Fed delib-
erations.29 Even Republicans on the House Banking Committee appear
to feel some change is necessary in U.S. central banking procedures in
order to increase democratic control of the Fed.30 Complaints about the
Fed’s lack of democratic ability have been voiced periodically in both
the House and Senate since the Fed’s founding in 1917. The possibility
that a European central bank might be created before the creation of a
“symmetrical political authority” has also raised concern about a po-
tential “democracy deficit” in Europe.31

Concretely, the dilemma arises from the supposition that central
bankers will always prefer more monetary restraint than the median
voter. “Shielded as they are from public opinion, cocooned within an
anti-inflationary temple,” warns one well-known economist, “central
bankers can all too easily deny . . . that there is a short-run tradeoff
between inflation and unemployment.”32 What is to prevent an inde-
pendent central bank from pursuing an excessively anti-inflationary
policy that is either suboptimal from a social welfare standpoint or sim-
ply far from the preferences of the electorate?

One response to this concern starts from the contention that central
bank independence is not legally determined; rather, politics, through
the strength of a hard-money group or a coalition, or the form of polit-
ical institutions, or the process of wage bargaining or party competi-
tion, determines both independence and monetary policy.33 Central
bank independence is not usually enshrined constitutionally; this
heightens the likelihood that politics overrides law.34 Another point
relevant to this argument is that some have modeled the situation so
that the median voter actually wants the central bank to choose a policy
more conservative than her own “ideal point.”35

Those arguing that central bank independence and the globalization
of financial markets go hand in hand, and effectively contribute to a
shift in central bank accountability from domestic political actors to
international market actors, construe central bank independence as the
rise of potentially undemocratic technocracy.36 The current trend to-
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ward central bank independence, Freeman contends, “is antithetical to
popular sovereignty” because independent central banks and the own-
ers of mobile capital they essentially “represent” are usurping national
power to “decide the distribution of power and wealth.”37 Epstein ar-
gues that the growth of international financial integration has in-
creased central banks’ power and independence and that independent
central banks can “thwart a Keynesian coalition of labor and industry
that supports expansionary policy; . . . it can veto expansionary power
that a labor-led government might support.”38 Central bankers often
add fuel to this fire with their rhetoric. For example, Carlos Ciampi of
the Bank of Italy justified central bank independence on the grounds
that “a sound currency is a cornerstone of just democracy.”39 The
Bundesbank, the central bank of Germany, has also made this claim.

These are important concerns and later chapters address them more
fully. At least for OECD countries, however, the weak empirical rela-
tionship between independence, on the one hand, and employment
and growth, on the other, suggests that fears that central bank indepen-
dence will strangle social democracy may be misplaced for the present.
For developing countries the evidence is less clear. In these countries
concern that central bank independence may heighten the tensions
national politicians face between the demands of internationally mo-
bile capital and the exigencies of domestic politics, especially where
national, expansion-oriented political coalitions are strong, may be
more valid.

Conclusion

To varying degrees, central banks control monetary policy. They also
protect financial stability and facilitate domestic and international
financial payments. Central banks serve as fiscal agents to the gov-
ernment. Independence is important in different ways and extents de-
pending on the central bank task in question. This book focuses primar-
ily on central bank independence from executive branch pressure that
would interfere with the bank’s monetary policy and inflation perfor-
mance goals. While it is important to recognize that independence has
different meanings and varying importance depending on the task
under consideration, to some extent conditions for effective perfor-
mance of all central bank tasks are intertwined. Erosion of monetary
control can jeopardize financial stability and the payments system.
Conversely, central banks carry out monetary policy through the finan-
cial system. Central banks control the money supply either directly or
indirectly. Central bankers exercise direct control through interest
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rates, reserve requirements, or credit controls. They can indirectly con-
trol the money supply through the sale and purchase of government
securities, known as open market operations, or regulation of credit
provision for use in stock purchases (margin requirements). The most
efficient method of money supply control is through the open market
for government securities. The more robust and stable the national fi-
nancial markets, other things equal, the more likely the central bank
can maintain price stability. And of course financial stability is more
likely if price stability can be achieved.40 This circularity aside, distinc-
tions among central bank tasks are important to keep in mind when
debating and analyzing central bank independence.

Three “world-historical” events contributed to heightened interest in
central banking in the 1990s: the rise of stagflation, the globalization of
financial markets, and European transition. The preceding pages dis-
cuss these events in roughly chronological order, but as the next two
chapters outline, this book’s argument places great causal weight on
the globalization of finance. The rational expectations revolution
helped put central banking on the agenda within the ivory tower, while
global trends raised normative issues for debate outside the ramparts.
The normative debate centers on two issues. The first is whether central
bank independence improves economic performance or whether it pre-
cludes policy coordination and negatively affects the economy. The
second concern is that central bank independence is less than demo-
cratic. These are important issues for our times; they are revisited in the
conclusion. The intervening chapters return to the central question of
this book, which is positive, rather than normative. That is, why and
when do politicians give discretion to, and respect the authority of,
their country’s central bank? The next chapter surveys the literature
attempting to answer this question, pointing out an important lacuna.
Where most existing explanations assume a closed economy, this book
argues that international financial pressures are an important part of
the cost-benefit calculations leading politicians to grant and/or protect
central bank discretion and authority.



Two

The Political Sources of Central Bank
Independence

THE INITIAL FOCUS in literature on central banks was on the economic
consequences of central bank independence. More recently the litera-
ture has begun to explore the political sources of central bank indepen-
dence. We know that central bank independence affects economic per-
formance to some extent, but when and why do government politicians
give discretion to central banks? Under what circumstances do they
honor and protect previous decisions to cede authority to central
banks? Answers to these questions focus on (1) the political strength of
different sectoral groups with varying preferences for employment and
price stability, (2) the nature of political institutions and party systems,
and (3) the financial needs of government. The relative weight of these
factors and the nature of their interaction is still unclear. Comparison of
empirical results is challenging because authors use different defini-
tions of independence and different methodologies. What is clear from
recent scholarship is that first, central bank independence does not
come from the legislators’ pen alone. Laws stipulating independence
may be necessary, but they are certainly not a sufficient condition for
central bank independence. Second, the sources of central bank inde-
pendence vary with levels of economic development. Results that hold
for OECD countries are typically not robust for non-OECD countries. A
third point stems from the closed-economy assumptions characteristic
of most existing models and arguments about the sources of central
bank independence. The literature on central banks makes the increas-
ingly false assumption that national and international financial consid-
erations are separable. This book builds on these conclusions and tries
to move beyond them by exploring the interaction between domestic
political and financial conditions for de facto central bank indepen-
dence in developing countries.

Definitions and Measures of Central Bank Independence

Most typically, central bank independence refers to independence from
the executive branch of government. But it can also refer to indepen-
dence from the legislature or protection from “capture” by the com-
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mercial banks it must regulate.1 Even if we accept the most common
conceptual usage of central bank independence vis-à-vis the executive
branch, definitions and indicators still vary considerably. An important
distinction is between independence from and freedom to. Analysts
separate freedom from the executive branch from the freedom to
choose policy instruments. At its extreme, freedom from the executive
implies that the central bank need not comply with stipulations for
monetary policy designed to keep economic outcomes in line with
voter preferences. This might more accurately be termed central bank
discretion following Calvert and his colleagues’ definition of discretion
as “the departure of agency decisions from the positions agreed upon
by the executive and the legislature at the time of delegation and ap-
pointment.”2 Yet an important distinction in the conceptual under-
standing of central bank independence is between discretion over the
goals of monetary policy and discretion over the tools with which to
reach goals set by others. The latter captures the more widely accepted
definition of central bank independence: freedom to choose policy in-
struments with which to conduct policy that accords with directly or
indirectly determined electoral mandates for economic policy.

Another issue concerns whether the term “independence” captures
the situation of mutual consultation between the monetary and fiscal
authority. In particular, fiscal authorities consult closely with many of
the central banks thought of as most independent. For example, during
much of its history the Bank of Thailand has enjoyed a virtual veto over
government fiscal policy.3 The conceptual distinction here is whether
or not the central bank has the authority to shape decisions tangential
to, but nonetheless affecting, its discretion over the goals or tools of
monetary policy. In this book central bank independence refers to dis-
cretion over both goals and tools of monetary policy and authority, as
just defined (see Table 2.1).

Quantitative indicators used to measure central bank independence
also vary widely. Japan’s ranking places it anywhere from the bottom
to the third quartile, depending on which set of legal independence
measures one follows.4 The standard components of legal indepen-
dence include some or all of the following, equally or differentially
weighted, categories of statutory stipulations: personnel appointment
(most important, the proportion of central bank policy board members
appointed by the government and the length of term), government fi-
nance (nature of limits), policy process (specifically, relations with gov-
ernment), policy objectives and instruments, mechanisms for resolving
bank–executive branch conflict, and extent of constitutional guarantee.
Inconsistency in quantitative measures of legal central bank indepen-
dence stems in part from emphasis on different aspects of central bank
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TABLE 2.1
Conceptual Definitions of Central Bank Independence

Discretion over Tools of Monetary Central bank has discretion to choose
Policy tools with which to try to meet

monetary policy goals set by the
government.

Discretion over Goals and Tools of Central bank has discretion to set
Monetary Policy goals of monetary policy and

choose tools.

Authority Central bank is consulted, and its
views are seriously considered re-
garding policy tangential to, but
potentially effecting, monetary
policy.

legislation, leading scholars to code the same legal texts differently.
In reality, it may not be possible to identify the most important legal
specifications for independence without understanding the political
context. For example, the Dutch cite their legislation’s provision for the
resolution of disputes between the central bank and government, re-
quiring the government to report to parliament any decision to over-
ride the central bank, as an important source of central bank indepen-
dence. However, the protection this provides the central bank is a
function of the Dutch political context. In a parliamentary system with
no clear majority party, the cost of politicizing monetary policy is se-
vere: a likely vote of no confidence, bringing down the government.

Quantitative measures of central bank independence can also be
based on calculations of the extent of central bank action beyond that
predicted by economic fundamentals (called a “reaction function”), or
the coding of qualitative responses by economic policymakers, includ-
ing central bankers themselves. Incidence of change in the central bank
governorship, particularly relative to change in government leader-
ship, is another measure. This measure is known as “governor turn-
over,” and it suffers from the obvious shortcoming that central bank
governors can last a long time in their positions precisely because they
are highly subservient to politicians.

De jure independence is a questionable proxy for behavioral inde-
pendence. History is replete with cases of formally independent central
banks, like Weimar Germany’s Reichsbank, that presided over gallop-
ing inflation because politicians demanded it. Johnson and Siklos use
the deviation of interest rates from underlying market forces (the reac-
tion function) as a measure of central bank independence in OECD
countries.5 The rankings they derive are not consistent with those
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based on the coding of legal statutes, leading the authors to comment
that “statutorily independent central banks behave as dependent enti-
ties while statutorily dependent central banks seem to act indepen-
dently within government.”6 Many central bankers themselves empha-
size the disjuncture between formal and informal independence.
Governor Eddie George, for example, protested during the debate over
increasing Bank of England independence in 1993 that increasing
the formal independence of the bank would be a “poisoned chalice”
unless accompanied by strong political support for an independent
central bank.7

Important theoretical findings are implicit in the different results ob-
tained by scholars using different concepts and indicators of central
bank independence. Although never complete, law, for example, ap-
pears to be a better explanation of behavioral central bank indepen-
dence in OECD countries than in non-OECD countries. Cukierman and
his colleagues find that the correlation between legal independence
and central bankers’ subjective evaluations of the central banks for
which they worked was only .06 for developing countries, while it was
.33 for developed countries.8

The assumption that law is an important determinant of central bank
independence suggests that we should see change in central bank au-
thority only after the law changes; yet the country histories in this book
suggest that this is not the case. The non-OECD country central bank
histories delineated in Chapters 5–8 show more variation in central
bank independence than in central bank law. The role of law is one of
several differences between developed and developing countries ap-
parent in the literature on the political economy of central banking.
These differences become even more evident in the survey of literature
on the political sources of central bank authority that follows.

Sectoral Groups as Political Constituencies

The first constellation of arguments about sources of central bank inde-
pendence focuses on the organization and political strength of different
sectoral groups with different relative preferences for employment and
price stability. The assumption is that these groups’ preferences for
macroeconomic policy translate into preferences for central bank inde-
pendence. Groups favoring price stability will also favor central bank
independence. Groups preferring full employment will argue for polit-
ical control of the central bank. The financial sector is most likely to
support central bank independence, and labor-intensive industry and
labor are most likely to oppose central bank independence. Goodman
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shows that in 1981 government actors and private financiers pushed
for an increase in Italian central bank independence. They succeeded in
part thanks to labor’s quiescence.9 Posen recently extended this argu-
ment.10 His regression analysis, for example, purports to show that
financial sector strength predicts inflation and legal central bank inde-
pendence in OECD countries. Although methodological problems
leave Posen’s findings open to question, others have tried to improve
on his research.

Clark tests the sectoral argument for a country sample including
both OECD and developing countries and uses both behavioral and
legal measures of central bank independence.11 He explores the inverse
argument implied by Posen’s association of financial sector strength
and central bank independence. Clark postulates that where labor and
heavy industry are strong, central bank independence will be low.
When he conducts separate analyses of developing and advanced in-
dustrial countries, Clark finds that the sectoral argument explains cen-
tral bank independence in developing countries, but not in advanced
industrial countries.

Of course these researchers recognize that there are multiple causal
influences on central bank independence. Those making the case for
the strength of different sectors as determinants of central bank inde-
pendence typically focus on the way political institutions shape the
varying policy influence of different sectoral groups. Viewed this way,
these arguments shade into the arguments discussed in the next sec-
tion, which focus on political institutions and party competition. What
distinguishes those here is the relative weight attached to sectoral pref-
erences and partisanship versus how party institutions and political
competition shape the time horizons and strategic choices of govern-
ment leaders. One could say that the former is more “society-oriented”
and latter more “statist” or that the former corresponds more closely to
partisan versions of political business cycle theory and the latter to op-
portunistic versions of political business cycle theory.

In any case, Posen rightly suggests that the size of the financial sec-
tor, the extent of its intra-sector coherence and its links to industry,
are insufficient indication of a sector’s ability to influence policy and
institutional design. Sectoral influence is a function of the extent to
which political authority is vulnerable to interest group pressure.
Posen finds that the influence of the financial sector, and therefore cen-
tral bank independence, is greater when there are few political parties
of relatively equal strength (low party fractionalization) in a federalist
system. Why? Because, argues Posen, this combination of political in-
stitutions and party characteristics yields high national government
decisiveness about and commitment to issues, such as central bank
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independence, deemed important enough to be put above the inter-
regional fray.

Clark hypothesizes slightly differently about how political institu-
tions and party characteristics mediate between sectoral preferences
and central bank independence. Like Posen, Clark finds the centraliza-
tion and insulation of government decision making a significant medi-
ating variable in both developing and advanced industrial countries.
But its impact on central bank independence is negative, rather than
positive as Posen claims. According to Clark’s results, the more politi-
cal competition, measured by the frequency of democratic regimes and
the rarity of large electoral mandates, the more independent the central
bank.12 The seemingly contradictory findings could be reconciled in
several ways. Regime type could be a significant intervening variable
determining the sign of the impact of political competition on central
bank independence. The relationship between political competition
and central bank independence could also be non-linear. Both too little
or too much political competition could be threatening to indepen-
dence. For both Posen and Clark the characteristics of political competi-
tion are mediating variables.

Franzese’s perspective about the political economy of inflation im-
plies a different sectoral argument about sources of central bank inde-
pendence.13 He argues that the employment and output costs associ-
ated with central bank independence will be lower the larger the
traded goods sector and the more centralized the wage bargaining. The
exchange rate appreciation that monetary contraction can induce hurts
producers of traded goods. The more independent the central bank, the
less likely it is that it will have to induce sharp monetary contraction.
Extrapolating from Franzese’s model we should expect more support
for central bank independence in countries where large traded goods
sectors coexist with coordinated wage bargaining systems. Franzese
derives his results from a study of OECD countries. Notice that his
ideal conditions for central bank independence rarely exist among non-
OECD countries.

While these sectoral arguments rely on a causal logic extending sec-
toral preferences for macroeconomic policy to preferences for central
bank independence, there is another, arguably more plausible, causal
link between strong financial sectors and central bank independence.
Most students of central bank independence would agree with central
bankers when they point to technical expertise and credibility as the
most important determinants of central bank authority. This, in turn, is
arguably a function of the depth of domestic financial markets. Central
banks most efficiently achieve money supply control through open
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market operations. Open market operations are in turn most efficient
when there are primary and secondary markets for government bonds.
The more sophisticated the markets, the more necessary technical ex-
pertise and information are to predict market behavior. The quality of
the central bank’s personnel and information become more valuable
the more difficult it is for the layperson, average politician, or even the
Treasury Department to understand how financial and money markets
move. Bank of Japan staff, for example, note that the higher quality of
their staff and information is an important resource in policy debates
with the Ministry of Finance. Central bank authority grows as the cen-
tral bank gains a reputation for understanding and being able to lead
financial markets efficiently and effectively.14

Institutions and the Nature of Political Competition

In a direct challenge to sectoral arguments, Hall argues that even
where labor and industry are strong, central bank independence and
low inflation are possible if corporatist political institutions exist.15

A focus on political institutions typifies the second set of perspectives
on central bank independence. Like Franzese, Hall focuses on one
corporatist political institution in particular: coordinated wage bar-
gaining. Coordinated wage bargaining lowers the costs of inflation
control; it allows central banks to control inflation with lower rates of
unemployment than in countries without coordinated wage bargain-
ing. Coordinated wage bargaining essentially alters the political envi-
ronment in which central banks operate, making tight monetary policy
less unpopular.

Hall’s is the exception to the rule among the “institutionalist” argu-
ments about sources of central bank independence. Most depart from
the notion that central bank independence is somehow related to the
costs associated with institutional change. Sectoral arguments essen-
tially posit that central banks are an epiphenomenon of sectoral forces
and assume that politicians bear no cost in changing central bank dis-
cretion or authority. Most so-called institutionalist studies focus on
how the extent of political competition shapes the cost of change. The
conclusion that more, rather than less, political competition is good for
central banks’ legal independence is rapidly becoming the accepted
wisdom for institutionalist scholars studying OECD countries. None-
theless, political competition has a variety of components, and some
confusion exists about which are most important. There is also discord
over whether political competition is important regardless of different
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parties’ substantive economic objectives. These controversies reinforce
the importance of distinguishing between legal versus de facto inde-
pendence and OECD versus non-OECD country contexts.

Studies concluding that the extent of political competition is a pri-
mary determinant of central bank independence in OECD countries
focus to varying degrees on government politicians’ time horizons or
perspective on their tenure in office, the size of electoral mandates, the
number of political parties and their positions in policy space, and the
number of “veto gates” or procedural hurdles in the process of legisla-
tive change. There is agreement that the more veto gates, the weaker
the threat of legally undermining central bank independence. The
weaker the legal threat, the less need for the central bank to comply
with informal political pressure from the government. If the indepen-
dent central bank is willing to risk a public appeal to preserve its auton-
omy in the face of executive pressure, then the smaller the govern-
ment’s electoral mandate, the less likely it is that the government will
succeed in undermining central bank independence. This combination
of factors leads Lohmann to argue that Bundesbank independence is
rarely threatened because divided party control of a federalist system
yields a large number of veto gates and weak party control of govern-
ment.16 The regression results of Banaian and his colleagues showing
correlation between federalism and central bank independence sup-
port this conclusion.17

Others note that the more equal political parties’ strengths, the more
likely it is that any given party’s electoral mandate will be low.
Goodman makes the parsimonious, and related, argument that central
bank independence in advanced industrial countries is simply a
function of government politicians’ time horizons.18 The longer their
time horizon, the more government politicians will desire the greatest
possible economic policy flexibility, which implies low central bank
independence.

There is less agreement about the implication of distance between
parties’ economic policy preferences and about the substance of the
governing party’s preferences for the argument that political competi-
tion is a necessary condition of central bank independence in industri-
alized democracies. Bernhard, for example, argues that in a two-party
system central bank independence will only occur if the two parties are
“catch-all” parties and share similar policy preferences (that is, lie close
together in policy space).19 This is because the executive is able to pur-
sue policies that might harm its party’s legislative supporters. (A catch-
all party that lies close in general policy space to its competitor has
incoherent preferences about monetary policy and can appeal to the
second party to support whichever monetary policy it decides to pur-
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sue.) When the executive has this option, legislators will seek a legally
independent central bank to help them prevent the government from
pursuing monetary policy contrary to their interests. The independent
central bank does this by monitoring and providing legislators infor-
mation about government actions.

Bernhard argues that the United States and Austria fit this model. In
the United States the Democratic and Republican parties share rela-
tively similar ideologies, compared with the differences between Brit-
ain’s Labor and Conservative parties, for example. The Federal Reserve
Bank governor regularly testifies to Congress about economic policy,
thereby providing information Congress can use in policy debates with
the executive. Bernhard stresses appointment procedures in his defini-
tion of central bank independence. Independent central banks have
appointment procedures guaranteeing that appointees reflect the dis-
tribution of economic policy preferences in the legislature. In the
United States the Federal Reserve Bank’s decision-making body in-
cludes a balance of regional interests similar to those in Congress. This
leads Congress to trust the information provided regularly to it by the
Federal Reserve governor.

Bernhard argues that central bank independence is more likely the
less party polarization there is. Alesina, Clark, and Cukierman argue
the opposite.20 Alesina and Cukierman claim that in constitutional de-
mocracies central bank legal independence is more likely the greater
the party polarization, in other words, the greater the difference in the
parties’ macroeconomic policy preferences. The potential for large fluc-
tuations in economic policy, and therefore for poor economic perfor-
mance, is high in this situation. The two parties have an incentive to
agree on a legally independent central bank that will pursue a consis-
tent policy roughly halfway between the two parties’ preferred poli-
cies. Although hardly an institutionalized democracy, Chile in 1989
illustrates this argument. The outgoing right-wing government of
General Pinochet and the more social democratic coalition expecting to
succeed him agreed to central bank independence. Pinochet wanted to
prevent a complete policy change after he left office.21 The incentive for
the party in power to cheat on the agreement is high, however, mean-
ing that behavioral independence will be low unless other aspects of
the political situation raise the penalty for cheating. For example, in a
parliamentary system where the governing party has a narrow elec-
toral mandate, cheating could lead to a vote of no confidence.

Notice that this literature usually abstracts from the monetary policy
preferences of the party in power. Goodman’s statement is typical.
The longer politicians’ time horizons, the greater their tenure security;
“regardless of their economic objectives, they will be unlikely to favor an
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increase in central bank [legal] independence.”22 Others disagree.
Clark not only emphasizes the importance of distance between parties,
but also suggests that the impact of longer time horizons on composite
measures of actual and legal central bank independence is indeter-
minate without specification of the governing party’s preferences re-
garding expected central bank policy.23 The higher the governing poli-
tician’s subjective evaluation of his or her reelection probability, the
more likely is political interference with the central bank if he or she
dislikes expected central bank policy. Zielinski adopts this line of
argument.24 In his view, an increase in central bank independence is
most probable if a right-wing (fiscally conservative) party is in power
facing poor reelection prospects in a contest with a left-wing party
whose macroeconomic policy ideal is very distant from that of the
governing party.

In countries without institutionalized democracy, conclusions re-
garding the contribution of political competition to central bank inde-
pendence are less clear. In contrast to Boylan’s conclusions, which are
based on two observations, Cukierman and Webb’s “large-n” study
suggests that the impact of short time horizons on central bank inde-
pendence is negative in developing countries, especially when short
time horizons reflect a history of frequent changes in the type of regime
(authoritarian versus democratic).25 This finding is consistent with
work showing that political instability has a negative impact on eco-
nomic performance, particularly inflation, in developing countries.26

Cukierman and Webb find that central bank independence is at great-
est risk in non-OECD countries experiencing frequent regime changes.
Short of regime change, the probability of politicians’ rescinding au-
thority delegated to the central bank after a change in the head of gov-
ernment or party in government is twice as great in non-OECD coun-
tries as in OECD countries.27

Clark finds that tenure security or insecurity, measured as the size of
the governing party’s majority or plurality in the legislature, bears no
statistically significant relationship to central bank independence in de-
veloping countries.28 But Clark’s results are not necessarily inconsistent
with those of Cukierman and Webb for at least two reasons. First, it is
possible that tenure security measured through party dominance in the
legislature may be significant for the subset of developing countries
with stable democracies. Second is the possibility that tenure security is
positively related to central bank independence as Cukierman and
Webb suggest, but that it is not adequately captured through party
dominance of the legislature in a set of countries where party systems
and legislative power are only recently becoming consistent, stable, in-
fluential features of domestic politics.
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While popular sentiment in the United States often sees central bank
independence as threatening democracy, democracy can create incen-
tives for politicians to delegate authority to the central bank. Shifting
monetary policy authority to a separate institution allows politicians to
avoid at least some of the responsibility and blame for economic per-
formance. But this is an untested hypothesis. Explaining differences in
central bank independence among well-functioning democracies will
remain difficult until we have conclusive empirical results that pin-
point the precise causal story linking political competition to central
bank independence. Scholarship to date also suggests that political
competition in the absence of well-established democratic rules is not
healthy for central bank independence. Cukierman and Webb find that
central bank independence measured through governor turnover rela-
tive to change in government leadership was highest among those non-
OECD countries under firmly established authoritarian regimes.29

Until democratic governance becomes fully institutionalized in non-
OECD countries, these results suggest that we should continue to
expect reversals of central bank independence.

Government Financial Needs and
Central Bank Independence

The third main set of arguments about central bank independence
focuses on the incentives created by government needs for finance.30

North and Weingast argue that the English government founded the
Bank of England because it sought new loans to continue its war with
France. This is consistent with Cukierman’s more ahistorical formaliza-
tion, concluding that “the delegation of authority to the central bank is
used as a device to reduce interest charges on new government debt.”31

I find a version of this argument illustrative in the histories of central
bank independence in newly industrializing countries.32

The logic of this financial incentives argument is clear in the history
of the Bank of England. In the early 1690s the government of William
III found itself out of money and uncreditworthy “due to previous re-
pudiations of debts and confiscations of wealth.”33 Government credi-
bility was so low that creditors were hesitant to lend at any interest
rate. To raise funds in these circumstances governments and their po-
tential creditors devised a novel exchange that involved creating a cen-
tral bank or, as it was called at the time, a state bank. Creditors would
subscribe to a large new government loan in exchange for the govern-
ment’s granting monopoly privileges to a new bank incorporated by
the creditors. By statute this new bank would handle government ac-
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counts and issue notes. This provided the creditors a guarantee of re-
payment and monopoly rents. The Bank of England statute also pro-
hibited lending money to the Crown or buying Crown land without
parliamentary approval (creditors dominated Parliament).

A central bank was founded, but its independence by contemporary
standards is questionable. The bank made repeated loans to the gov-
ernment throughout the eighteenth century, usually in return for reit-
eration of its monopoly privileges. The onset of the Napoleonic Wars
coincided with an end to specie convertibility, and the government pre-
vailed “on the Bank to help finance the wars through inflation.34 The
fixed but freely convertible exchange rates of the gold standard years
bolstered the central bank’s inflation-fighting capacity, perhaps more
than its legal charter. The role played by the gold standard in this his-
tory suggests the need to integrate domestic and international forces in
the political economy of central bank independence.

Similar stories could be told about the origins of many state banks
in other advanced industrial countries and in developing countries.35

In most cases the state bank’s lack of independence is clear. The need
for government finance calls forth a quasi-central bank through an ex-
change of monopoly privilege for bank loans to the government. Typi-
cally, under government pressure, bank loans far exceed statutory
limits, if these exist. These state banks become fonts of inflationary
government finance, as did the Bank of England during and after the
Napoleonic Wars.

Brazil illustrates this logic. The Portuguese colonial government
founded the first Banco do Brasil to finance the costs of the Portuguese
court, which had been transplanted in the 1820s from Lisbon to Rio de
Janiero because of war in Europe. Legal stipulations aside, the bank
extended credit to the government virtually on demand. Not surpris-
ingly, the Banco do Brasil failed and was reincarnated several times
throughout the nineteenth and twentieth centuries. In the twentieth
century it became an important source of finance for the government
subsidy of coffee exporters. An alternate institution, with more poten-
tial for independence, was not founded until the 1960s. Debate over
central bank independence and the inflationary role of the Banco do
Brasil still rages today.

If we try to extend this argument to explain variation over time in the
authority of contemporary central banks, ambiguity arises in the logic
connecting government revenue imperatives to central bank indepen-
dence. The creation of a central bank or greater independence accorded
an existing central bank can reduce the cost of government borrowing
by raising government credibility, lowering expectations of inflation,
and lowering risk premia charged the government. This is the logic of
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the Bank of England story and that of Cukierman, who argues that
central bank independence is higher the larger the amount of funds
that the government plans to borrow on the capital market.36 Alterna-
tively, the creation of a central bank that lacks independence or a de-
crease in the authority of an existing central bank permits government
to inflate away its existing debt burden and raise the portion of revenue
earned through the seignorage that is earned by having a monopoly to
print money.

The impact of government need for finance on central bank authority
is clearly significant. But as with politicians’ time horizons, its positive
or negative relation to central bank independence depends on govern-
ment interest in inflationary versus noninflationary finance. Such inter-
est is a function of the relative economic and political costs political
leaders associate with different financing options. To date the revenue
imperative argument for central bank independence has been explored
largely in a closed-economy context. In protected domestic financial
systems with considerable government regulation, governments can
“force” investment in government bonds. When investors have few
options other than buying government debt, the cost of inflationary
policy and the commensurate need for central bank independence is
low. Presumably the internationalization of capital markets heightens
the costs of inflationary finance and should increase the probability of
central bank independence. This causal mechanism is one of several in
the open-economy argument about central bank independence out-
lined in the next chapter. Before turning to a detailed discussion of this
book’s argument, however, there are two other explanations of central
bank independence to address.

Leadership and Ideology

One further argument seeking to explain central bank independence
rests on the quality of the leadership exercised by the governor of the
central bank.37 A second is that economic ideology explains the creation
and re-creation of independent central banks.

To the reader familiar only with central banking in the United States,
the issue of central bank independence may bring to mind the sup-
posed collaboration of Federal Reserve Board governor Arthur Burns
with President Richard Nixon’s electorally motivated interest in expan-
sionary monetary policy in 1972. This cooperation contrasted sharply
with the tight monetary policy central bank governor Paul Volcker
pursued to the detriment of Jimmy Carter’s reelection efforts in 1979.
Observers often attribute this difference in Fed behavior to the particu-
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lar personalities of the two Fed governors. But there are several prob-
lems with the “great man or woman” theory of central bank power.38

First is the problem of “endogeneity” in governor appointment. In
many cases governors are appointed by the president or prime minis-
ter. Those presidents or prime ministers who want an authoritative
central bank may appoint a governor with leadership potential. The
source of leadership skill poses a different problem. Leadership skills
may be hard to identify a priori; in many cases they are honed through
praxis. In the case of central bank governors it may be the protection
that is or is not afforded them by government politicians that shapes
the opportunity for strong leadership to emerge. Leadership argu-
ments are weak because they neglect the underlying importance of the
motives of government politicians.

Another argument often employed to explain choice of economic
policy could easily be extended to politicians’ choice of central bank
independence: the weight of economic ideology. The problem is that
this type of explanation does not identify why and when policymakers
adopt particular ideologies. For example, in a book ostensibly about
the force of ideas in shaping economic policy patterns, Hall argues that
ultimately the likelihood of political leaders’ adoption of Keynesian
economic ideas and policies was shaped by “the kind of financial in-
struments that each state developed to fund its debt, the regulatory
regime imposed on the banking sector and the general character of the
capital markets.”39 Of course prevailing economic ideologies will shape
politicians’ estimates of the costs and benefits of central bank indepen-
dence. In this sense they contribute to temporal trends in the indepen-
dence of that institution. The challenge is to specify the relative weight
of economic ideology compared with market forces as explanations of
overall trends in central bank authority.

Toward an International Political Economy
of Central Bank Independence

International conditions will increasingly influence macroeconomic
policy choices in both OECD and non-OECD countries, yet most of the
models of central banking just reviewed are closed-economy models.
These assume we can understand the dynamics of authority delegation
to central banks without consideration of a country’s international situ-
ation. Yet the link between international conditions and central bank
authority seems evident in the history of the founding of central banks
in many developing countries. In many instances in developing coun-
tries, official central banks, as opposed to the quasi-central banks often
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referred to as state banks, were founded when international financial
pressures tipped the political scale in favor of those national actors ar-
guing for a central bank. In the 1920s, for example, the League of Na-
tions, the Federal Reserve Bank of New York, and the Bank of England
actively promoted the founding of central banks throughout Eastern
Europe and Latin America.40 These actors, writes Simmons, “along
with prominent members of the American and British financial sectors,
often conditioned their stabilization assistance on improvements in the
institutional independence of national central banks.”41 A similar pat-
tern is evident in the 1950s and 1990s. The founding and bolstering of
central banks appears to come in waves associated with periods when
foreign capital inflows are highly prized and the leverage of interna-
tional creditors and their domestic allies rises commensurably.

Adding an international component to the story of central bank au-
thority helps clarify some of the puzzles that emerge from the existing
research. Take the sectoral argument, for example. A potential explana-
tion for the contradictory findings reported above is that financiers’
abilities to exploit a nation’s international economic vulnerabilities
shape the effectiveness of financial sector demands on government to
protect central bank independence. When government leaders prize
foreign capital inflows highly, domestic proponents of central bank in-
dependence, usually in the financial sector, can use the exclusivity of
their links to international financiers to bolster the proposition that in-
ternational capital inflows will follow from the creation of, or improve-
ment in, central bank independence.

The economic history of Latin America since World War II provides
many examples. In Mexico the relative influence of private domestic
bankers and their allies has varied with the nation’s international fi-
nancial situation. In the 1920s Mexico was in default on its international
debts but needed to renegotiate and receive fresh funds. In this period
the bankers were relatively successful in imposing their preferences for
tight monetary and fiscal policy on the government. The bankers were
less successful in the following two decades, when Mexico once again
fell into default but could not hope to gain much by restructuring its
debt when international markets were in chaos. As multilateral lending
rose in the 1950s and access to these funds took on corresponding im-
portance, the fortunes of the bankers improved. Excess global liquidity
in the 1970s once again eroded the bankers’ influence over government
economic policy, while the debt crisis restored it.42

Similarly, the extent of international integration of domestic financial
markets (partly a function of capital account openness) and the mix of
outstanding financial obligations can explain whether a government’s
need for finance translates into more or less central bank indepen-
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dence. On the assumption that the behavior of domestic creditors fol-
lows that of international ones, the more internationally financially in-
tegrated the economy, the more likely it is that government need for
finance will yield central bank independence, because it is taken as
both a sign of government commitment to desirable economic policies
and an opportunity for increased creditor influence over government
policy via a more independent central bank. The argument is simple.
Creditors and politicians are rational and have long understood what
academic research has seemingly discovered only recently: “That
which buttresses the credibility of the central bank, then, will dampen
the inflationary monetary bias . . . and encourage capital inflows.”43 Such
an argument would lead us to expect identifiable temporal trends in
central bank authority across the globe. Johnson and Siklos, for exam-
ple, find that “central bank behavior is significantly different in the
post–Bretton Woods period relative to the Bretton Woods era.”44 As the
authors note, the OECD-oriented studies that aim almost exclusively to
explain cross-national variations in (assumed to be constant) levels of
legal independence “mask subtle changes in central bank behavior
over time” that are related to changing objective and subjective interna-
tional financial conditions. This book takes up the challenge left by the
existing literature on central banking to try to illuminate the interaction
and relative weight of increasingly inseparable national and interna-
tional financial factors, along with domestic political considerations, in
government politicians’ calculations about central bank independence,
particularly in non-OECD countries.
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International Capital Flows and the Politics
of Central Bank Independence

We have to learn about these capital flows and
how they might actually matter to governments
and national interests.

—John Woolley

The only way to ensure . . . [central bank] inde-
pendence is to create laws and institutions which
act to tie the hands of both the government and
the central bank. . . . The adoption of IMF
standby agreements is an important traditional
way to achieve this result.

—Mart Laar, Prime Minister of Estonia

THE WAVE of central bank reform during the 1990s in countries all over
the globe lends credibility to the argument that global financial forces
are at work.1 This chapter sketches an argument suggesting that the
financial pressures on politicians in middle-income developing coun-
tries shape their decisions regarding central bank independence in
several specific ways. The 1990s witnessed a wave of increase in legal
central bank independence because government leaders were trying to
attract and retain capital. Put telescopically, the likelihood that politi-
cians in middle-income developing countries will attempt to signal
creditworthiness by increasing central bank independence is an in-
creasing function of their nation’s objective need for balance of pay-
ments support, the expected effectiveness of signaling, and politicians’
tenure security. It is a decreasing function of the extent of financial
regulation in the politician’s country.2 Chapter 4 suggests that the pat-
tern of cross-regional variation in central bank reform in the 1990s is
consistent with this argument.

This book argues that actual central bank independence in middle-
income developing countries varies with a country’s need for credit
and investment, as perceived by government politicians. Politicians try
to signal their country’s creditworthiness by ceding central bank dis-
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cretion and recognizing central bank authority.3 International financial
asset holders should be more willing, ceteris paribus, to invest in coun-
tries with independent central banks for two reasons. First, investors
expect central banks with discretion and authority to help keep na-
tional economic policy on a stable, consistent course. Therefore central
bank independence increases the extent to which international inves-
tors can predict their relative returns. International investors view the
costs politicians pay to reverse central bank independence as a partial
guarantee of stable, consistent economic policy.

Central bank independence may also increase the confidence of
some international investors in a second way. Concerned about host-
country policies that threaten anticipated returns, international inves-
tors may believe that their ability to influence policy is greater the more
independent the central bank is from the executive branch. Foreign in-
vestors read central bank independence as a signal of the strength of
domestic proponents of sound monetary policy, both within the gov-
ernment and among domestic social groups, with whom the investors
might implicitly or explicitly ally in an effort to influence policy.

Obviously politicians’ use’ of central bank independence to signal
creditworthiness in middle-income developing countries will rise
with the objective need for international financial resources measured
through the balance of payments. This objective need is discussed
briefly at the end of the chapter. Objective balance of payments condi-
tions equal, three other factors increase the likelihood that the need
for international financial resources will lead politicians to increase
central bank discretion and government recognition of central bank
authority. The expected responsiveness of investors partially guides
politicians’ use of central bank independence to increase credit-
worthiness. If the global supply of financial resources vastly exceeds
demand, as in the 1970s, costly efforts to signal creditworthiness will
be foolish. Furthermore, not all international investors will be equally
responsive to central bank independence. One of the main objectives
of this chapter is to delineate how and why investor responsiveness
varies by asset type (foreign direct investment, international bank
loans, foreign bonds, foreign equity shares). The following section ex-
plains how and why investor responsiveness varies with four charac-
teristics: asset-specificity, risk structure, access to local information,
and number of investors. Politicians’ use of central bank independence
to increase creditworthiness also rises with more extensive financial
liberalization for the host country and longer effective time horizons
and tenure security for its leaders. Subsequent sections explain these
mechanisms in turn.
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The Effectiveness of Signaling Creditworthiness

Politicians seek creditworthiness in the eyes of international investors
to improve the quantity and price of financial resources offered to their
country. The effectiveness of efforts to increase creditworthiness will
vary with the characteristics of international financial markets. Two
characteristics are important: the relationship between supply and de-
mand for international financial resources and the predominant form
of international financial intermediation. This section evaluates the
latter and explores how the nature of the assets through which interna-
tional funds flow to middle-income developing countries affects how
and to what extent political leaders will try to build creditworthiness.4

Asset-specificity, mobility, or liquidity, all references to the same
asset characteristic, are crucial to understanding the international fi-
nancial pressures government politicians face.5 If an investment such
as foreign direct investment in a factory is “stuck” in a recipient coun-
try there is little the investor can do if host-country policy changes
threaten to lower anticipated returns. The recipient country has consid-
erable leeway to deviate from policies expected by the investor ini-
tially; it is difficult to liquidate a factory. Of course, new foreign inves-
tors may become wary of investing in the country. But the point is that,
other things equal, pressure on recipient countries to stick to the policy
path “promised” at the time an investment is made rises with the li-
quidity of the investment stock.6 International investors in government
bonds or equities, for example, can normally sell them immediately on
news of an unfavorable change in the policy environment. This liquid-
ity increases pressure on political leaders who desire international
investment to maintain a favorable policy environment. The predomi-
nant form of capital flow from “north” to “south” will shape the mar-
ginal benefit from efforts to signal improved creditworthiness.

Another way to say this is that the greater the elasticity of supply and
price of international funds, the more valuable are politicians’ marginal
efforts to increase creditworthiness. Other things equal, the elasticities
are low for foreign direct investment, moderate for commercial bank
loans, and great for bond and equity investments.

In the world of more liquid investments, the distribution and nature
of risk on returns should also shape investor responsiveness to signals
about the future investment environment. The more risk borne by the
investor, the more responsive the investor should be to market signals.7

The greater the default risk, the more responsive the investor should
be.8 This helps us distinguish between government bonds and equi-
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ties.9 The return on government securities is fixed, which is why gov-
ernment bonds are called “fixed-income” securities. The return on an
equity investment is variable, and risk is shared between investor and
borrower. But because government bonds mature on a specific date,
the investor runs a risk that the government will not have funds to
liquidate the security. (A security in this case is literally a piece of
paper, or “note.”) Default risk is thus lower for equity shares than for
fixed-income securities because an equity borrower facing liquidity
problems can lower the dividend paid, while a government facing a
liquidity problem may have to default. Cross-border investment com-
plicates the analysis. Unless they insure themselves, investors in for-
eign securities expose themselves to exchange risk. If a government
issues bonds denominated in a foreign currency (like dollars), investors
should be very responsive to changes in the policy environment affect-
ing the supply of foreign exchange. If a government issues bonds de-
nominated in the local currency, investors should be very responsive to
policies threatening exchange rate stability. A corporate equity issued
on a foreign market denominated in a foreign currency is usually
backed by a commitment from a sponsoring bank to provide the for-
eign currency. (This is how American Depository Receipt issues work
on the New York Stock Exchange.)10 The investor is exposed to a de-
cline in the exchange-adjusted price of the stock but faces less risk of
outright default than the investor in foreign government bonds.

The risks and policy sensitivities of commercial banks making loans
to governments, “sovereign” loans, are similar to those of investors in
government securities. Both should be more sensitive to changes in the
macroeconomic policy environment than equity investors, who will be
more sensitive than investors in debt instruments to sectorally oriented
policies. But international bank lenders tend to be fewer in number
than holders of government securities. The comfort in numbers and
large exposure lower international bank sensitivity to the policy envi-
ronment. The small community of international bankers, in its efforts
to directly pressure the borrowing country government for policy
changes or to appeal to home country governments or multilateral in-
stitutions such as the IMF to intervene on the investors’ behalf, can
hold out greater hope of success than the typically larger community of
bondholders.11

Asset-specificity, risk structure, access to local information, and
numbers all may shape the responsiveness of international investors to
particular kinds of signals of creditworthiness. We consider four types
of international investors: foreign direct investors, equity investors, in-
ternational bank lenders, and purchasers of foreign government bonds
(see Table 3.1).
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Foreign Direct Investment

Foreign direct investors should not be very responsive to changes in
the general macroeconomic policy environment, which is what change
in central bank independence signals. Foreign direct investments can-
not be quickly liquidated, although they can be abandoned. Foreign
direct investors will find their influence over policy limited once they
have invested in physical plant.12 The interests of foreign direct inves-
tors vis-à-vis recipient countries are likely to be somewhat heterogene-
ous, depending on the sector they operate in and their point along the
investment-recovery time line. They should be most sensitive to
changes in the regulatory environment for foreign corporations, in sec-
toral policies, and in trade restrictions.13 Trade freedom guarantees
profit repatriation opportunities through under- and over-invoicing
even if capital account regulations otherwise limit it. Foreign direct in-
vestors have a physical presence in the host country. Generally speak-
ing, they are closer to local information sources and have less need
than arm’s length investors to rely on signals of policy direction that
are more easily observed from afar, such as central bank independence.
If the policy environment changes, foreign direct investors are likely to
lobby to try to protect their sunk costs. Their responsiveness to signal-
ing via change in central bank authority should be low.

Foreign Equity Shares

International equity investment involves no time commitment. Inter-
national equity investments are very fungible compared with foreign
direct investments.14 They are usually more liquid than commercial
bank loans. Yet the decision to divest at any given moment can be ex-
pensive, because returns vary and risk is shared by investor and bor-
rower. International equity investors are fairly responsive to changes
in the policy environment and have more need to rely on signals of
change in the policy environment than do foreign direct investors. Yet
their responsiveness to central bank independence should only be
moderate because, as already noted, they are more concerned with
sectoral than with overall macroeconomic policy.15 An important ex-
ception occurs when international equity investors hold shares in fi-
nancial sector institutions. Equity investors in general should be very
sensitive to regulation of the capital account, especially as it affects
their repatriation and liquidation options. It is possible that equity in-
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vestors would read central bank independence as a signal of the capital
account policy environment.

Foreign investors purchasing equity shares in developing country
corporations rely on signals to forecast returns because acquiring ac-
cess to local information is costly. But these investors are likely to
search for signals specific to particular sectors. Individual investors’
responsiveness to market signals should also be high because the num-
ber of investors is large. But the number of individual shareholders
makes organization to pressure governments an unlikely strategy for
protecting investments. The relatively large number of actors and the
premium on speed would make bilateral or multilateral bargaining
over policy with the host-country government a poor strategy for eq-
uity investors.16 As Frieden emphasizes, asset specificity is the prime
determinant of asset-holders’ choice of strategy in response to threat-
ened changes in the investment environment. The less specific the as-
sets are, the more likely it is that the investor will chose to exit rather
than try to influence the course of change.17

Apart from investment in the financial sector, equity investors’ inter-
est in the overall macroeconomic environment as signaled by central
bank independence should thus be moderate. Central bank indepen-
dence may induce some response to the extent that equity investors
view it as a signal of commitment to a liberal capital account policy.

Debt: International Bank Loans

Debt is extended for a fixed time period: bonds or bank loans typically
commit principal for at least several years. International sovereign
loans involve explicit negotiation of a contract, usually specified in
lender-country currency. Interest rates are often variable over the life
of loan, but the time frame is less flexible. Borrowers may repay early,
but lenders may not demand early repayment. Although loans can be
resold, the extent of the market for them varies, as it does with all as-
sets. The secondary market for developing country loans has never
been very liquid; this spurred loan conversion to bonds through the
Brady program.18

Commercial bank lending involves relatively few actors with rela-
tively homogeneous interests; syndications (formal groups of inter-
national banks) may specify terms of seniority and subordination
for individual member institutions. As a comparatively small group
often facing large exposure, commercial bank lenders can afford to
be less responsive to market signals than equity or government bond-
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holders. In other words, moral hazard operates in the case of bank
lending.19 The promise of home government support induces greater
risk-taking than market conditions warrant. Typically international
banks facing borrower country default receive third-party assistance
for efforts to secure the promise of repayment as debt is rescheduled.20

Through the organization of market or government actors or multilat-
eral intervention, “conditionality” is applied. International or multilat-
eral organizations make loans or loan-term renegotiation conditional
on borrower governments’ committing themselves to a particular set
of policies.21

To the extent they feel a need to respond to market signals, bank
lenders should be concerned with the overall macroeconomic policy
environment signaled by central bank independence. International
bank lenders are more likely than international equity investors to
have a local presence. Local information could be channeled through
correspondent banks in the borrowing country or, in some cases,
through branches or subsidiaries operating in the country. Yet this
local presence generally does not generate information used by loan
officers to the extent expected.22 This gives greater weight to the need
for signals about the macroeconomic policy environment, such as
central bank independence, that can be observed from abroad.

Despite this paucity of local information and a concern with the
macroeconomic policy environment, the likelihood of market actor or
third party intervention and the relatively low liquidity of secondary
loan markets both lower international banks’ responsiveness to market
signals, such as central bank independence.

Debt: Foreign Government Bonds

On the far end of the responsiveness continuum from foreign direct
investors lie investors in foreign government bonds. As financial as-
sets, the specificity of bonds and bank loans is a function of market
demand. In the post–World War II era there was virtually no interna-
tional demand for government bonds issued by developing countries
until the 1980s. The market boomed in the 1990s.23 In contrast, demand
for repackaged and resold international bank loans was virtually non-
existent in the 1980s; it revived slightly in the 1990s.24

Holders of foreign government bonds must respond to market sig-
nals because there is no comfort in numbers. International bondholders
are much more numerous than international bank lenders. The like-
lihood of home government intervention or of successful organized
action to pressure issuing governments for policy change is low. Evi-
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dence from the 1930s, when bond sales dominated international invest-
ment, supports this conclusion. In fact, bonds were floated by a rela-
tively small number of syndicates and then sold through “traveling
salesmen” to small public investors.25 The collective action problems
arose from the dispersion of owners, not issuers. The issuing syndicates
did not have their own money at stake and were only partially moti-
vated by trying to maintain their reputations with bond purchasers.
Bondholders’ committees were formed to help creditors present a uni-
fied front in negotiations with debtors, both in the 1860s in Britain
and in the 1930s in the United States. Because of the large number of
owners involved, these committees appear to have suffered more from
collective action problems than did the loan renegotiation committees
representing bank lenders in the 1980s.26 Cooperation among the bond
committees of different nations, especially across the Atlantic, also ap-
pears to have been less frequent than cooperation among loan syndi-
cates in the 1980s.

International government bondholders should be especially con-
cerned with macroeconomic conditions and have no special advantage
in obtaining local information; they look for signals of the future policy
environment. Other things equal, holders of foreign government secu-
rities are more likely than any other international investors to be
responsive to central bank independence as a signal of credit-
worthiness. The signals the market relies on may change as time proves
them more or less accurate. But in the early 1990s the conventional
wisdom was that inflation induced by a government’s deficit spending
was less likely to the extent that the government relinquished the pre-
rogative for unlimited borrowing from the central bank. The more au-
thority the central bank had in determining interest rates and money
supply growth, went the average mutual fund manager’s thinking,
the less likely these policy instruments were to be used by politicians
in accord with their electoral concerns, rather than to further the goal of
price stability. Earlier, in the heyday of bond lending between the two
world wars, international advisory committees also frequently sug-
gested the creation of central banks or strengthening their indepen-
dence in addition to the kinds of stabilization policies typically sought
by creditors.

The evidence suggests that, other things equal, trying to signal credit-
worthiness via central bank independence should be least effective
when foreign direct investment is the predominant form of “north-
south” capital flow and most effective when the predominant form is
investment in developing country government bonds. One important
determinant of the effectiveness of signaling cuts across asset type. The
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relationship of the global supply and demand for international re-
sources shapes the need for capital-scarce countries to compete for cap-
ital. If global capital supply greatly exceeds demand, as it did in the
1970s, the need to signal creditworthiness is lower.

Financial Regulation

The likelihood that politicians will try to signal creditworthiness via
central bank independence is a decreasing function of financial regula-
tion in three ways. When the restrictions on international capital mobil-
ity are fewer, national financial markets are more integrated and global
financial markets are more encompassing. In general, the more encom-
passing global financial markets are, the greater the competition for
investment.

Although the international investors’ preferred signals of credit-
worthiness may vary, when one—such as central bank indepen-
dence—is in vogue with international investors, capital mobility dic-
tates that the politician desirous of attracting and keeping capital
cannot ignore it. The more international financial integration is the
more mobile international financial resources are in general. The need
for creditworthiness will grow with international financial integration.
Cerny highlights this point when he argues that international financial
integration has led to the development of the “competition state,”
vying for capital.27

Yet the claim of growing global openness is controversial. While
there is little doubt that governments have dismantled many post–
World War II regulatory barriers to international capital movement
over the last twenty years, considerable controversy surrounds the
quantitative measurement of international capital mobility and inter-
national financial integration. In the early 1980s Feldstein and Horioka
found a high correlation between changes in national savings and in-
vestment rates which they took to be a sign of low capital mobility.
Many criticized the Feldstein-Horioka findings.28 There is a stronger
theoretical rationale, critics argue, for using interest rate convergence
as a measure of international financial integration. Analysts find differ-
ent degrees of integration depending on the type of interest rates com-
pared.29 Currency variability aside, it appears that interest rates are
increasingly convergent.30

The volume of international financial transactions has certainly
grown and investors’ decision frameworks are increasingly interna-
tional.31 This is true of investors in both capital-rich and capital-scarce
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countries. One study concludes, “capital moves in and out of [develop-
ing] countries, both legally and by evasion of controls, with much
greater ease than one would expect.”32 In fact, while one would expect
foreign investors in developing countries to follow the capital alloca-
tion choices of resident nationals, the latter increasingly mimic the
portfolio decisions of foreign investors in their countries. In middle-
income developing countries the determinants of domestic and inter-
national investment are increasingly similar.33

Nonetheless, there are important cross-national and cross-regional
differences in the extent of international financial openness that facili-
tate or hinder international capital mobility. The likelihood that
government politicians in a particular country will take actions that
augment central bank independence increases with the reduction of
restrictions on domestic and international financial transactions. De-
veloping countries have historically imposed controls on cross-border
capital movements.34 In the 1980s a growing number of developing
countries have opened their financial systems by liberalizing capital
flows, though to varying extents.35 National capital account regula-
tions, therefore, are an important determinant of the possibilities for
capital mobility. The need for creditworthiness in middle-income de-
veloping countries rises with the deregulation of international financial
transactions.

In addition, domestic financial deregulation creates a very particular
pressure for creditworthiness noted in Chapter 1. When domestic fi-
nancial regulations and controls on international capital flows limit the
investment options of country nationals, governments can sell debt at
relatively low interest rates. Internationally isolated and “repressed”
financial markets can create artificially high demand for government
securities.36 Especially when other sources of government revenue are
low relative to government expenditures, as is typically the case in de-
veloping countries, the cost of raising funds through the sale of govern-
ment bonds is very important.37 When financial markets are deregu-
lated and become increasingly internationally integrated, politicians
no longer enjoy a captive market for government securities. Domestic
deregulation also reduces possibilities of raising revenue through
seignorage.38 When the government has to compete with myriad other
investment vehicles to sell its securities, the value of central bank inde-
pendence rises because it can serve as a signal to investors. A recent
comment by Donald Brash, governor of the Bank of New Zealand, cap-
tures this phenomenon. Observers herald the Bank of New Zealand as
one of the most independent central banks in the world in the 1990s.
Questioned about the possibility that even with its great statutory au-
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tonomy the bank could be weakened by the appointment of a compli-
ant governor or by pressure on an incumbent hoping for reappoint-
ment, Brash said, “The openness of the system, combined with the dis-
cipline of the financial markets, make it unlikely that any government
would take the risk.”39

Politicians’ Tenure Security

National leaders’ tenure security will also affect the decision to pursue
creditworthiness. As noted in Chapter 2, theory about the impact of
time horizons and tenure security on governing politicians’ prefer-
ences about monetary policy and monetary institutions is contradic-
tory, while empirical evidence is limited. For OECD countries, theory
suggests that the effect of time horizons and tenure security on central
bank independence is indeterminate without specification of govern-
ing party preferences. This is consistent with Simmons’s empirical re-
sults from a study of the relationship between time horizons, monetary
policy, and preferences for capital inflow. On the basis of evidence
for Western countries during the interwar years Simmons argues that
stable, right-wing governments are more likely to be “monetary inter-
nalizers,” seeking international capital inflows at the cost of domestic
policy flexibility, than unstable, left-wing governments.40

For non-OECD countries, Cukierman and Webb’s empirical work
suggests that central bank independence is a positive function of politi-
cians’ time horizons, regardless of party preferences.41 The importance
of party preferences in OECD countries and their irrelevance outside
the OECD world is logical. In most non-OECD countries party systems
are only recently beginning to play a consistent and important role in
national politics. To explain monetary policy choices in developing
countries, Haggard and Kaufman focus on the extent to which party
systems, in authoritarian or democratic environments, are “aggrega-
tive” or fragmented. “Aggregative party systems are those in which
governments can consistently mobilize electoral support through one
or two broadly based centrist parties.”42 Fragmented systems are
“more likely to generate coalition governments held together by exten-
sive, and costly, side-payments.” Aggregative party systems are likely
to yield stable, relatively low inflation because they limit the need for
side-payments and the strain these can place on fiscal resources. They
also encourage policy continuity, “diminish the freedom of maneuver
of opposition forces outside of the broad center,” and lengthen political
leaders’ time horizons.
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The rule for developing countries between 1945 and 1990 is that
national leaders insecure in their positions are likely to want to main-
tain policy flexibility because it provides greater potential for vote-buy-
ing and because the benefits of creditworthiness may accrue for the
succeeding leadership.43 Rising economic literacy in developing coun-
tries could reduce this rule’s general applicability if electorates under-
stand and value the role of the politician–central bank relationship in
sustaining capital flows. For example, Carlos Menem’s reelection as
president of Argentina in 1995 depended in part on convincing voters
that he would be able to sustain a credible commitment to investors. He
pursued somewhat expansionary fiscal policy, but did not contemplate
encroaching on the central bank or eliminating the currency board.
Partisanship is likely to become necessary in explaining the impact of
tenure security as democracy becomes institutionalized in developing
countries. One can then expect a rise over time in the number of in-
stances in which tenure insecurity leads politicians to increase central
bank independence in order to protect gains threatened by electoral
successors.

Objective Balance of Payments Conditions
and the Need for Creditworthiness

In the midst of widespread default on international bonds in the 1930s,
the U.S. Securities and Exchange Commission commented: “The will-
ingness of the issuer to negotiate with representatives of the bondhold-
ers and eventually to agree to readjust its default generally has two
motivations: a desire to restore the prestige and reputation of the na-
tion and a desire to borrow more money.”44 An indisputably important
determinant of the extent to which politicians seek international credit-
worthiness is their countries’ need for international financial resources.
A nation’s balance of payments situation, specifically debt, export ca-
pacity, and foreign exchange reserves, is likely to reflect this need.
Several caveats are in order, however. Quantitative indicators of the
balance of payments can be highly misleading; large current account
deficits may be voluntarily financed in one country, while small deficits
may signal a loss of confidence in another. Furthermore, politicians’
perceptions of the need for balance of payments support may not be
fully objective. History, as well as countervailing contemporary pres-
sures, intervenes, creating varying degrees of separation between ob-
jective and subjective evaluations.
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Conclusion

This chapter has outlined a theory that politicians’ decisions to cede
discretion to their nation’s central bank should be an increasing func-
tion of the need for creditworthiness. One measure of such need lies
in a nation’s balance of payments accounts. But the story is more
complex. Politicians are more likely to use central bank independence
to signal global financial markets the greater the role of portfolio fi-
nance in financial intermediation between capital-rich and capital-
scarce countries. This occurs because the expected effectiveness of sig-
naling via central bank independence varies with the predominant
structure of “north-south” financial intermediation. The supply of
financial resources, another characteristic of international financial
markets, also shapes politicians’ perceptions of the potential effective-
ness, and therefore value, of trying to signal the need for international
creditworthiness. If the global supply of financial resources greatly
outstrips demand, the need to compete for capital and for credit-
worthiness is less.

Politicians are also more likely to use central bank independence to
signal international financial markets the more secure they are in office
and the less their country restricts domestic and international financial
transactions through government regulation. Tenure security is impor-
tant because the impact of central bank independence on credit-
worthiness involves a time lag. Government politicians insecure about
their tenure in office will have short time horizons in office and are
likely to accord low value to central bank independence and the credit-
worthiness it can bring. The potential political cost of ceding discretion
over monetary policy is higher when politicians must fight to win the
electorate’s support. If there is any chance that monetary policy flexibil-
ity will allow weak governing politicians to buy greater support, the
cost of ceding discretion over monetary policy is very high. This rule
may change with democratic institutionalization and rising economic
literacy among the electorate in developing countries. In any case, gov-
ernment regulation of financial transactions is important because it
weakens the impact of global financial pressures.

This argument highlights the role of politicians’ perceived need for
creditworthiness in shaping their decisions regarding central bank in-
dependence. If politicians perceive the need as low, the likelihood of an
increase in central bank independence is low. If they perceive the need
as high, the likelihood of an increase in central bank independence is
greater. Many factors can influence politicians’ perceptions of the need
for creditworthiness. The argument developed here emphasizes the
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most obvious: the objective balance of payments conditions and the
extent to which market forces shape the government’s financial situa-
tion. The argument also emphasizes politicians’ tenure security.
Furthermore, conditions in global financial markets will shape expecta-
tions about the effectiveness of acting to signal improved credit-
worthiness via treatment of the central bank. Politicians will only
choose to signal creditworthiness via their actions toward the central
bank if they expect the signal to be effective.

This book’s theoretical claims may be briefly characterized relative to
broad themes in the political economy of developing countries. These
pages tell a subtle story about forces shaping central bank indepen-
dence that is consistent with arguments stressing the conditions set by
international financial institutions in order to explain the policy choices
of developing countries. It is also broadly consistent with arguments
linking international economic conditions to the relative capacity of
different domestic sectors, such as the financial sector, to influence gov-
ernment actions. Quite simply, hard-money coalitions, often centered
around domestic financial actors, have more leverage over government
when financing is scarce. The argument is also second cousin to theo-
ries of state action stressing the structural power of capital. It is both
more and less political than arguments explaining policy choice by vir-
tue of the sectoral composition of a national economy. It is more politi-
cal because politicians’ perceptions are central, but it is less political
because the assumption is that the globalization of finance will move
politicians’ perceptions inexorably toward a consistent concern with
their nation’s creditworthiness. The impact of economic ideology on
politicians’ perceptions of the need for creditworthiness is secondary to
material conditions manifest in global financial markets. Similarly, for
the domain of developing countries as a whole, arguments stressing
party politics and/or regime type alone have little relevance for ex-
plaining trends in central bank independence in the second half of the
twentieth century.



Four

Central Bank Independence in the 1990s

The intellectual case for independent central
banks is more or less won.

—The Economist

I am convinced there is objective reality in my
impression that central banks are in exception-
ally good repute these days.

—Paul Volcker

THIS CHAPTER surveys the remarkable global rise in central bank inde-
pendence in the 1990s.1 It also explores the extent to which cross-re-
gional variation in this global trend corroborates the argument that
politicians are more likely to cede discretion to central banks when the
need and value of competing for international creditworthiness is high.

Between 1990 and 1995 at least thirty countries, spanning five
continents, legislated increases in the statutory independence of their
central banks. A list of the countries increasing de jure central bank
independence and, in some cases, measures of increase in legal inde-
pendence (based on the 1992 coding criteria of Cukierman, Webb, and
Neyapti, hereafter referred to as Cukierman et al. [1992]) are presented
in Table 4.1.2 This dramatic trend occurred at the same time that portfo-
lio flows became the fastest-growing form of capital inflow for devel-
oping countries, global demand for international financial resources
rose relative to supply, and financial deregulation in developing coun-
tries, especially of international transactions, proceeded rapidly. The
global trend in central bank independence in the early 1990s is consis-
tent with the competition to signal creditworthiness engendered by
the liquidity of portfolio finance, increasing demand for international
financial resources as formerly Communist countries begin rapid infra-
structure expansion, and lowering of government barriers to financial
transactions.

The trend toward central bank independence has been most pro-
nounced in Europe, but it is also evident in Latin America. Change in
Asia and the Pacific has been moderate and in the Middle East and
Africa, minimal. If the argument laid out in Chapter 3 is correct, regions
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TABLE 4.1
Changes in Statutory Central Bank Independence, 1989–1994

Regional AveragesDateCountries with Charter Change

1992Argentina
1989Chile
1992Colombia
1992Ecuador
1993Mexico
1992Venezuela

.55Latin American Average Level, 1990–1994
Latin American Average Increase in 1990s

.19over 1980s

1991Albania
1994Belarus
1991Bulgaria
1993Czech Republic
1993Estonia
1991Hungary
1993Kazahkstan
1992Latvia
1994Lithuania

1991 and 1992Poland
1991Romania
1993Russia
1993Slovak Republic

Ukraine 1992
Central and Eastern Europe Average Level,

.451990–1994
Central and Eastern Europe Average Magnitude

.26Increase in 1990s over 1980s

1993Belgium
1993France
1993Greece
1992Italy
1992Portugal
1994Spain

.46Western Europe Average Level, 1990–1994
Western Europe Average Magnitude Increase in

.331990s over 1980s

1991Algeria
1992Egypt
1989Turkey

1989New Zealand
1993Pakistan
1992Vietnam

Note: Coding of charters based on charter coding and data reported in Alex Cukier-
man, Steven B. Webb, and Bilim Neyapti, “Measuring the Independence of Central
Banks,” World Bank Economic Review, 6, 3 (September 1992).
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with the largest rates of increase in central bank independence should
also be regions with the greatest need for international credit-
worthiness. Using interest rates on private international credits, Table
4.2 shows that Latin American and Central and Eastern Europe were
the regions facing the highest rates.

If we turn to the variables that should enhance the impact of need for
creditworthiness on central bank independence, the cross-regional
variation is generally consistent with the theory. In absolute numbers
the two regions with the largest increases in central bank indepen-
dence, Europe and Latin America, sold more bonds to foreigners than
did the other regions. Their short-term debt roughly captures objective
need for creditworthiness. This debt, measured as trade and suppliers’
credits, was large. It is difficult to capture regional differences in finan-
cial regulation and politicians’ time horizons in quantitative terms.
The capital account openness measure used here as an indicator of
overall financial regulation is based on coding of International Mone-
tary Fund (IMF) reports on national exchange restrictions. Capital ac-
count openness is greatest in Latin America, which experienced the
second-greatest increase in central bank independence. Yet Europe,
which saw a larger increase in central bank independence than Latin
America, continued to have relatively high capital account regulation.3

This chapter is not intended as a strong test of the argument laid
out in Chapter 3. However, the data on cross-regional variation in the
increase of central bank independence are consistent with the argu-
ment, at its broadest level. Other possible factors contributing to
central bank independence in different regions, especially Europe, are
also noted.

The Maastricht Treaty for European integration, and its impact on
expectations about capital mobility, created impetus for the revision of
central bank law in Western Europe, where the trend toward increased
legal independence has extended to a relatively large number of coun-
tries, representing a significant portion of regional GNP. Maastricht
heightened politicians’ awareness of the need to compete for interna-
tional capital. In Eastern and Central Europe it is difficult to distinguish
among concern over inflation stabilization, capitalist growth, and for-
eign capital inflow as motivating central bank independence.

The trend toward legal independence has also been dramatic in Latin
America. Latin American countries need investment capital to retool
for export-oriented production, and many are trying to recover from
recent histories of poor international financial management that make
their need for international creditworthiness even greater. Portfolio in-
vestment is an important source of balance of payments finance in the
region. Most of the larger countries in Latin America, measured in
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TABLE 4.2
Cross-Regional Indicators of Legal Central Bank Independence (CBI) and Signaling Likeli-
hood, 1990–1992

Central and
AsiaAfrica Latin America Eastern Europe

Bonds Outstanding
140(U.S. millions)a 2,060 2,851 4,727

Interest on Private most loans are
International Loansa concessional 7.2 8.3 8.4

Suppliers/Trade
Credit Outstandinga 1,259 4,622 N.A. 13,283

Capital Account Openness
(0 = lo; 11 = hi)b 5.1 6.9 6.3 8

Domestic Financial
Market Regulation

123 1.0(1 = lo; 3 = hi)c

No. of Observations of
CBI Increase and
Average Magnitude

15 (.26)5 (.19)3 (.07)2 (N.A.)of Increased

a. Data from World Bank, World Debt Tables (Washington, D.C.: World Bank, various years).
b. From regulations in IMF, Exchange Arrangement and Exchange Restrictions (Washington, D.C.: IMF,

various years).
c. Based on author’s country surveys.
d. Based on legal coding in Alex Cukierman, Steven B. Webb, and Bilim Neyapti, “Measuring the

Independence of Central Banks,” World Bank Economic Review, 6, 3 (September 1992), and author’s
coding of post-1989 legal changes.

terms of GNP, have revised or are debating revising their central bank
legislation in the direction of increased independence.

The need for special efforts to attract international investment is low
in the majority of Asian countries, and there have been relatively fewer
moves toward central bank independence in this region. Domestic and
international financial transactions remain relatively heavily regulated.
The proportion of countries that have recently increased central bank
authority is lowest in the Middle East and Africa. In Africa this is partly
because two different currency boards substitute for central banks in
thirteen countries. The relatively weak trend toward central bank re-
form in Africa also corresponds to the minimal incentive to seek ap-
proval from international capital markets for countries considered too
poor to receive nonconcessional finance. Middle Eastern countries,
though facing growing economic troubles, enjoy good international
creditworthiness as indicated in the low interest rates international
lenders charge them (see Table 4.2).
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Western Europe

On the western side of the former Iron Curtain new central bank char-
ters were promulgated with striking alacrity in the early 1990s. Portu-
gal passed two laws, one in 1990 and a second in 1992, leading to a
staged increase in central bank independence. The 1990 legislation
gave the Bank of Portugal, previously an administrative arm of the
government, the right to collaborate in setting monetary and exchange
rate policies. Legislation in 1992 gave the bank independence in setting
monetary and exchange rate policies and in the regulation of financial
markets and institutions. This law also abolished the free overdraft ac-
count the government held with the central bank and limited lending
by the Bank of Portugal to 10 percent of budgeted government expen-
diture. Legislation also lengthened the legally stipulated term of office
for the central bank governor.4

Throughout 1993 debate surrounded proposals for a new Bank of
Spain statute. Informally, government leaders encouraged increases in
central bank autonomy even prior to resolution of that debate. For ex-
ample, in a meeting occasioned by Spain’s devaluation of its currency,
the Bank of Spain president informed Prime Minister Felipe Gonzalez
that he was prepared to accompany the devaluation with a drop in
interest rates. Gonzalez reportedly replied that such a move would
have to be entirely at the discretion of the central bank.5 The prime
focus of debate over legal revision was the provision for the appoint-
ment of the central bank’s governing officials, including concern about
term length and regional representation. Legislation stipulating greater
independence was finally passed in 1994. It lengthened the governor’s
term of appointment and tightened the grounds for his or her dis-
missal. The new statute also shifted responsibility for monetary policy
formulation more clearly to the central bank. Terms of central bank
lending to the government were also made more stringent.

In Greece, Ministry of Economics officials met with IMF representa-
tives to work out details on how best to legislate central bank indepen-
dence. As of January 1994, when new central bank legislation went into
effect, the Greek government lost its right to obtain direct financing
from the central bank. The charter also stipulates increases in central
bank authority in the areas of terms of government appointment and
dismissal, monetary policy, and bank objectives.

The central bank of Turkey, under Rusdu Saracoglu, unilaterally
began to operate with increased autonomy from the government.
Saracoglu was part of the team advising former Prime Minister Turgot
Ozal on economic liberalization in the late 1980s. He was appointed to
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the central bank in 1987 and struggled to increase central bank authority
both de jure and de facto throughout his tenure in the central bank. In
1989 he succeeded in obtaining a protocol restraining Treasury borrow-
ing from the central bank.6 Commented Saracoglu, “In recent years the
independence of the Central Bank has improved markedly. True we are
no Bundesbank, not even close. On the other hand, the increased public
awareness regarding the Central Bank’s independence combined with
conscientious behavior on the part of politicians are gradually reducing
the impact of elections on the conduct of monetary policy.”7 But Sara-
coglu’s efforts were never enshrined in a new central bank statute. De
facto independence did not survive the heightened political uncertainty
surrounding government changes in the mid-1990s.

In Italy, despite the progress toward central bank independence
achieved through the so-called divorce of 1982, more autonomy for the
central bank had been sought for years prior to the 1992 legislation that
accorded the Bank of Italy autonomy in setting interest rates.8 That leg-
islation also gave the bank complete autonomy to intervene in foreign
exchange markets. Prior to the change, the Italian Treasury set both
interest and foreign exchange rate policy, usually on recommendation
of the central bank. Although there had been no Bank of Italy financing
of the government for several years in spite of a large deficit, 1992 legis-
lation legally limited Treasury overdrafts with the central bank to 14
percent of the expected increase in government expenditure.9

Belgium passed legislation in March 1993 abolishing the Ministry of
Finance veto over central bank affairs and preventing Treasury bor-
rowing from the Bank of Belgium. The legislation fell short, however,
in failing to include a clear stipulation of monetary stability as the cen-
tral bank’s sole objective.

In mid-1993 France also passed legislation increasing the autonomy
of its central bank, considered one of the least independent in Western
Europe. Late in 1992 central bank independence became part of the
party platform of the French right. In December, with uncertainty sur-
rounding the franc’s value, opposition politician Giscard d’Estaing
proclaimed that legislating central bank independence “would, in the
current situation, be the best political and technical signal of our will
to have, from now on, a sound currency policy.”10 “The international
markets carefully monitor the independence of central banks,” stated
Giscard on another occasion.11 As electoral competition rose in antici-
pation of the March 1993 elections, the governing party also embraced
the concept of speedy action to increase central bank independence.
Minister of Finance Michel Sapin expressed favor for immediate legis-
lation of central bank independence as “an elegant way to challenge
what could be the policies pursued by another majority.”12
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The legislation put forth by the newly elected neo-Gaullist Prime
Minister Edouard Balladur in April 1993, and passed later that year,
shifted control over monetary policy from the Treasury to a Monetary
Policy Council composed of appointees drawn from a list made up by
institutions that included the judiciary and the parliament. The Bank of
France governor and deputy governors, previously appointed with no
fixed term, were now, under the 1993 legislation, appointed for a fixed
six-year term with dismissal only by recommendation of the general
council of the bank in the case of gross misdemeanor. After demands
by the Ministry of Finance that it be given bank supervisory rights if
control over exchange rate parities and rules were passed to the central
bank, the latter were left under the purview of the Treasury. Legisla-
tion defined the goal of the Bank of France as the pursuit of price stabil-
ity within the framework of government policy and, though debated, a
definition of price stability was not stipulated.13 The new legislation
also restricted the terms of central bank lending.

Debate over changing central bank legislation even spread to Great
Britain in the mid-1990s; politicians and policy elites have hotly debated
the legal status of the Bank of England. An independent commission of
private bankers, academicians, and European central bankers issued
“a new mandate for the Bank of England” entitled “Independent and
Accountable.” This title reflected popular concern that an independent
central bank would not be consistent with democratic governance.14

Some British central bankers expressed skepticism about increasing
legal independence in the absence of popular support for it.15

Fear of losing international financial resources lurks underneath the
proximate legal motivation for politicians to increase central bank in-
dependence in Western Europe. The price of failing to do so is exclu-
sion from Maastricht, which would reduce capital inflows. Maastricht
mandates institutional convergence to equalize the playing field and
prevent unequal access to foreign capital within Europe, and also to
act as a vaccine against inflation. In middle-income countries, such as
Portugal, Greece, and Spain, the need to beat inflation and to attract
foreign capital are intertwined.

Central and Eastern Europe

New central banks have been created and old ones strengthened
throughout Central and Eastern Europe. Under the guidance of inter-
national advisers, one of the first steps in financial market development
has been the revision of central bank legislation. The International
Monetary Fund, the World Bank, the Bank for International Settle-
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ments, U.S. AID, the European Bank for Reconstruction and Develop-
ment, and the U.S. Treasury Department, reflects one observer, “are all
shoveling in . . . talk as quickly as they can.”16 In many countries of the
region central bank development has been an incremental process,
with annual change in central banking law.

Many of the former republics of the Soviet Union have enacted new
central bank charters. These have had varying impact on actual central
bank authority.17 In many cases the legislation is extremely vague, leav-
ing considerable room for political interference in central bank actions.
More important, in situations such as that of Belorussia, where the state
or state-owned enterprises spend 85 percent of national income, the
practice of independent monetary policy is virtually impossible, de-
spite legal provision of independence. Belorussian legislation, for ex-
ample, forbids extension of credit to national or local government. It
also stipulates monetary stability as the central bank’s primary objec-
tive. Legal independence is less than ideal in a number of ways; mone-
tary policy is subject to government approval. But the impact of law
fades in the shadow of the credit demands of industrial, agricultural,
and banking constituencies that dominate and, in some cases, are the
government.

This situation has certainly prevailed in Russia. An effort to increase
the legal independence of the central bank was made because inter-
national credibility called for it. But prior to the constitutional changes
of December 1993, with a central bank governor responsible to parlia-
ment and a parliament dominated by credit-hungry entrepreneurs,
restrictive monetary policy was an impossibility despite legal provi-
sions to the contrary. The law stipulated monetary stability as the
central bank’s primary objective. It also restricted central provision of
credit to the government, although the restrictions were weak com-
pared with those of many others in the region. Credit is “limited” to
the difference between current government income and expenditure.
The constitution approved increased independence for the Russian
central bank in December 1993 by giving the president authority to
nominate and recommend dismissal of the bank governor subject to
parliamentary approval.18 The constitution now enshrines the goal of
monetary stability. But the central bank is still vulnerable to “undue
pressure” from the Duma.19 In 1995 the Duma refused to ratify Tatiana
Paramonova’s appointment as central bank governor because, as
acting governor, she stood fast against legislative pressure. Most
Russian politicians do not view the country’s need for international
creditworthiness as a high priority. Foreign investors fall over one an-
other trying to gain a foothold in the country and in their enthusiasm
weaken incentives for economic reform. Multilateral aid to Russia re-
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sponds more to geopolitical considerations than to Russian leaders’
economic choices.

Another obstacle to the effectiveness of legal stipulations of inde-
pendence in this region is the financial weakness of the commercial
banking sector and the requirements of government debt service. In
Uzbekistan new central bank legislation limits bank lending to the
government to credits of less than three months, but other legislation
stipulates that the central bank must service all government debt. The
situation in Kazakhstan is similar. The statute provides for indepen-
dence in some ways. Legislation charges the central bank with main-
taining the internal and external value of the currency, and limits the
term of credit extended to the government to three months. Nonethe-
less the statute also allows the government to fill the board of the
central bank with political appointees, provides no protection from ar-
bitrary dismissal for the governor,20 and calls for the central bank to
manage and service government debt.

Armenia reveals a virtually identical story. Legislation stipulates
that the central bank protect the internal and external stability of the
currency. But the law affords little actual autonomy in monetary poli-
cymaking, in part because it provides for a combination of central bank
board members nominated by the central bank governor and by the
government. Credit to the government is limited to one-year maturities
and a total not to exceed 25 percent of expected annual government
revenue, but the central bank is required to service government debt.

New legislation is under consideration in Ukraine; existing legisla-
tion is confusing because of contradictory provisions in the central
bank statute and banking law. Again, legislation prohibits the central
bank from providing credit to the government but requires it to service
government debt. The governor of the central bank enjoys no protec-
tion from arbitrary dismissal. As the bank governor V. A. Yuschenko
commented in 1994, “existing legislation does not yet establish a civi-
lized relationship between the National Bank of Ukraine and govern-
ment structures.”21

The Baltic countries include two in which currency boards protect
central banks from the kinds of political pressures for expansionary
central bank action that government elites tolerate in many other for-
mer Soviet republics.22 The prime minister of Estonia notes that while
currency board–type monetary policies may limit central bank flexibil-
ity, they “deflect political pressures” and “preclude colossal mistakes,
which at the present stage of transition is much more important [than
flexibility].”23 Estonia adopted a quasi-currency board regime for ex-
change and monetary policy. The monetary base is backed by gold and
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hard currency.24 In addition, legislation protects independence by pro-
hibiting central bank provision of credit to the government and by
shielding the governor and board from arbitrary dismissal. Indeed the
Estonian central bank governor Siim Kallas survived several changes
of government. Estonia boasts that its currency board and central bank
independence account in part for its great success in attracting foreign
direct investment.25 Lithuania adopted a currency-board system in
mid-1994 in part to prevent the kind of political interference with the
central bank that lay behind the dismissal of the bank governor and
much of the board in 1993.

Poland, which led regional liberalization, freed its central bank to
formulate and conduct monetary policy without parliamentary ap-
proval of detailed credit plans in 1990. A Monetary Policy Committee,
composed of central bankers, makes monetary policy. An annual out-
line of monetary policy must be presented to the cabinet for informa-
tional purposes. The 1990 legislation charged the Bank of Poland with
advising the government on budget policy appropriate to maintain
monetary stability and limited lending to government to 2 percent of
the government’s budgeted expenditures.26 Legislation charged the
bank both with protecting currency stability and with supporting the
government’s overall economic objectives. Legislation in 1991 in-
creased the bank’s supervisory authority over commercial banks.27

Legislation the next year eliminated the cap on central bank lending to
government and made deficit financing subject to negotiation between
the minister of finance and the Bank of Poland. This placed a greater
burden for maintaining independence on the negotiation and leader-
ship skills of the Bank of Poland governor, Hanna Gronkiewcz-Waltz.
She lived up to the challenge, successfully withstanding political pres-
sures for expansionary policy.28 The governor is appointed by parlia-
ment and can be recalled on unspecified grounds.

When it became apparent in 1993 that different levels of develop-
ment in the Slovak and Czech Republics, compounded by nationalistic
divisions, made maintenance of a single central bank, currency, and
monetary policy difficult, legal change created a separate central bank
in each republic.29 The Slovak parliament labored hard beginning in
February 1993 to write legislation that would both comply with consti-
tutional stipulations on economic policy and guarantee central bank
independence. Law gave the Bank of Slovakia the sole objective of
currency stability and prohibited it from annual lending to the gov-
ernment of more than 5 percent of national government revenue in
the previous year, with a three-month limit on government credit
maturities. The law demands that monetary policy be formulated in
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conjunction with the government, however. The central bank governor
is subject to presidential recall, but is legally protected from arbitrary
dismissal.30

The Czech Republic promulgated new central bank legislation in
1993, making the already strong Czech Central Bank even more legally
independent. Legislation charges the central bank with the sole goal of
price stability,31 grants complete autonomy in monetary policy formu-
lation and a formal advisory role in government budget policy, and
prohibits the bank from lending the government more than 5 percent of
the previous year’s government revenues and from extending credit
with more than a three-month maturity. The central bank governor
and board are subject to presidential recall only if criminally sentenced
or incapacitated.32 The governor’s term is six years, exceeding the terms
of office of the nation’s president and lower house representatives.

Slovenia loosely copied German and Austrian central banking legis-
lation in writing and ratifying a new law in 1992 that provided for the
central bank’s independence from the government. Observers explic-
itly heralded the legal change as an effort to attract foreign investors.33

The legislation sets currency stability as the central bank’s primary goal
and limits its credit to the government to 5 percent of planned govern-
ment revenue or 20 percent of the government budget deficit. The
governor and board members are appointed to six-year terms but are
subject to parliamentary recall.

Legal changes made the Bank of Hungary formally independent
of the government in 1991, with further legislation in 1992 and 1994.
The law is equivocal about central bank autonomy in the formulation
of monetary policy. In contrast to Poland, a monetary policy council
composed of an equal number of central bank and political appointees
determines monetary policy.34 The central bank governor is appointed
to a six-year term and since 1991 can be recalled only for gross misde-
meanor. (The central bank governor and four deputies were dismissed
in 1991, days before legislative changes went into effect providing
greater protection from arbitrary dismissal.) Central bank lending to
government is limited annually to 3 percent of planned government
revenue, excluding receipts from privatization, and credits of one-year
maturity. The bank’s legally stipulated goal is principally to maintain
the domestic and foreign value of the currency, but the law also
charges the bank to support the government’s economic program.35

Although Hungary’s legislation does not make it one of Eastern Eu-
rope’s more independent central banks, the nation does have a provi-
sion unique among the region’s central bank laws that instructs the
Bank of Hungary to “warn the government and, if need be, turn to
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parliament and the public,” if it “deems that the economic policy or
practical activities of the government endanger the stability of the
economy.”36

Both the Polish and Hungarian statutes have the unusual feature of
giving the central bank a legally stipulated role in the government’s
budget policy formulation. Ethiopia is the only other country in the
world according its central bank such legal authority. Given the tre-
mendous importance of budget policy in shaping macroeconomic
stability, especially in a developing country context, this provision is
arguably more important than the celebrated “New Zealand clause”
legally stipulating a level of price stability. Authority in the budget
process is crucial to the maintenance of price stability in an uncertain
political environment where the temptation for politicians to follow
expansionary, crowd-pleasing fiscal policies is great.

Bulgaria and Romania also passed legislation in 1991 increasing
the independence of their central banks. Three missions from the IMF
Central Banking Department helped to formulate a new central bank
statute for Bulgaria.37 According to this statute the central bank is not
subject to government directives on monetary policy, nor are there di-
rect representatives of the government on the central bank board. The
central bank’s legally defined primary goal is internal and external cur-
rency stability. Central bank credit to the government can have no
more than a three-month maturity, and total credit may not exceed 5
percent of expected current-year revenues and certain other govern-
ment–central bank assets, including reserves. Nonetheless parliament
sanctioned a ten-year government credit in 1992. Five of the nine mem-
bers of the central bank board are nominees of the central bank gover-
nor. Parliament appoints the governor, who is, however, legally pro-
tected from arbitrary dismissal. Even so, the central bank governor
Vulchev, appointed in 1991, was forced to resign in 1992 after public
attacks orchestrated by opponents of his tight money policy.

Romanian legislation provides for significantly less independence
than in Bulgaria and many other Eastern European countries. Roma-
nians modeled their central bank law on the legislation that guided
French central banking prior to 1993 reforms. The legislation is rela-
tively vague. It provides for central bank credit to the government to
cover “temporary deficits” up to 10 percent of the total government
budget or twice the sum of central bank reserves and capital, with no
maturity provisions. The central bank governor and board are chosen
by parliament and enjoy no protection from arbitrary dismissal.

Albania also enacted new central banking legislation, with provi-
sions for a surprisingly independent central bank. The central bank
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governor is appointed on recommendation of the central bank board
for a six-year term, longer than that of any political office, and is pro-
tected from arbitrary dismissal. Six-month advances to the government
may not exceed 10 percent of the previous year’s government revenue.
The law stipulates that the central bank’s primary goal is maintaining
internal and external currency stability. However, the provision for the
executive branch to appoint a majority of central bank board members
potentially compromises independence.

The need for international financial resources and international
creditworthiness has been great in Eastern and Central Europe in the
1990s. In many cases legal protection for central bank independence
was a condition of multilateral financing. Newfound nationhood and a
strong desire to emulate Western institutions are also behind the trend
toward legal protection of central bank independence in the central
and eastern part of Europe. But de jure independence is not de facto
independence. In many cases the demands of concomitant political and
economic liberalization still constrain central bank practice. Great un-
certainty faces government leaders in these fledgling democracies. For
many of these leaders, the importance of protecting the central bank
from the pressure of credit-hungry financiers and industrialists in
order to maintain international creditworthiness pales in comparison
with the demands of building and maintaining a political mandate to
remain in office. These cases, where democracy is barely institutional-
ized, illustrate the importance of politicians’ tenure security in their
prioritization of central bank independence.

Latin America

Five Latin American countries enacted new central bank legislation be-
tween 1989 and 1992: Chile, Argentina, Venezuela, Colombia, and
Mexico. In Chile, the departing Pinochet government granted the
Banco Nacional de Chile significant new legal authority in December
1989. Pinochet’s concern was to protect Chile’s economic progress, in-
cluding international creditworthiness, against the potentially poor
judgment of successor governments. Legislation gave the central bank
two objectives: price stability and management of international pay-
ments. It created a new central bank board, prohibited the central bank
from extending credit to the government or purchasing government
paper, and permitted the minister of finance to attend, but not vote at,
board meetings. The statute made the central bank the final authority
on monetary policy. It also increased central bank authority in gover-
nor appointment procedures. Although Pinochet had hoped to fill
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the board with personal allies prior to leaving office, negotiations
with the united opposition, represented by Alejandro Foxley, led to a
compromise. Of the new five-member central bank board, Pinochet
chose two members, the opposition chose two, and a fifth was chosen
by consensus of both parties. The five were appointed for staggered
terms so that no more than one new member would be replaced every
two years.38

Between 1989 and 1992 the Peronist government of Argentina also
drew up several plans to give the central bank more independence in
handling monetary policy. A 1989 conditional loan agreement with the
IMF included provisions for increased central bank independence.39

Congress finally approved a new central bank law in mid-1992.40

Among other things, it promised to end an era of virtually unlimited
central bank financing of government deficits by restricting legal cen-
tral bank lending to the government to 10 percent of the value of the
central bank’s total public debt holdings.41 The new statute lengthened
the governor’s term of office, gave the central bank the primary objec-
tive of preserving monetary stability, and made it the final authority
over monetary policy.

The new Colombian constitution of 1991 included a commitment to
future legislation of increased central bank independence. Congress
approved a new central bank statute in December 1992. Under this new
statute the central bank’s sole objective became maintaining the cur-
rency’s purchasing power.42 The statute also increased central bank in-
dependence in the areas of term of governor appointment, formulation
of monetary policy, and methods of government finance.

The Venezuelan government also approved a new central bank stat-
ute in December 1992. This statute gave the central bank complete inde-
pendence in the formulation of monetary policy. This authority was
deftly exercised following the announcement of an impeachment order
for President Carlos Andres Peres in May 1993. The central bank presi-
dent, Ruth de Krivoy, immediately raised interest rates in a successful
effort to prevent capital flight.43 The new statute also tightened require-
ments for central bank financing of the government and increased
central bank authority through changes in the terms of governor ap-
pointment. Nonetheless, Venezuela’s vast oil wealth tends to reduce
the priority most politicians place on the goal of international credit-
worthiness. In practice, government mishandling of the domestic fi-
nancial sector in the mid-1990s has severely compromised Venezuelan
central bank autonomy.

In Mexico, President Carlos Salinas sent new legislation to the legis-
lature in May 1993 that was designed to increase the autonomy of that
country’s central bank, the Banco de México. The new statute, passed
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into law in December 1993, mandated that the bank follow the sole
objective of preserving the purchasing power of the peso. It also re-
stricted government borrowing from the central bank to finance its
deficits and changed appointment procedures for the central bank gov-
ernor and board members. The statute stipulated that the governor and
board members be selected for fixed, staggered terms by the nation’s
president (subject to Senate approval) and be dismissed only for severe
breach of duty. For Salinas, Mexico’s international creditworthiness
was a strong consideration in introducing changes in the statute. Note
that although major politicians were leaving the scene in both the
recent Mexican and the Chilean cases of central bank statute change,
uncertainty was low. Law proscribed Pinochet and Salinas from com-
peting in upcoming elections. Because chances of reappointment were
close to zero, pressure to manipulate the central bank for personal po-
litical gain was minimized.44

Even in strongly antiliberal Brazil, the country’s constitution, rewrit-
ten in the 1980s as part of Brazil’s democratic transition, opened the
door to unspecified reform of the central bank. Since then, there have
been a variety of proposals to increase central bank autonomy. En-
hancement of central bank independence was an important part of
fiscal reform legislation presented to the Brazilian congress in 1992.
This proposal would have replaced the top monetary policymaking
body, the National Monetary Council, on which the central bank has
only one vote of seventeen, with a new council dominated by the
central bank.45 This aspect of the fiscal reform package did not sur-
vive congressional debate. However, in August 1993 there was again
high-level murmuring about the need to increase central bank indepen-
dence. After several years of haranguing on the subject by economist-
turned-parliamentarian José Serra, Finance Minister Fernando Henri-
que Cardoso publicly conceded the importance of trying to increase
central bank autonomy from government. As a candidate for the na-
tional presidency in 1994, Cardoso made a call for central bank inde-
pendence part of his campaign platform. By early 1995 President
Cardoso’s administration was drafting new central bank legislation for
congressional review.

Throughout Latin America central bank independence came after
considerable progress had already been made in stabilizing inflation
and consolidating democracy. From the point of view of official credi-
tors, such as the Inter-American Development Bank, improvement in
governance institutions was the second stage in the fight to build
healthy economies in the region. Most Latin American elites gave the
fight for international creditworthiness high priority in the 1990s for
several reasons. The debt crisis imposed high-risk premia. Capital ac-
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count and domestic financial liberalization increased the global inte-
gration of Latin American financial markets. Both the incentives and
the value expected from manipulating the central bank for personal
political gain fell. And the role of international bond financing raised
the expected effectiveness of signaling creditworthiness via central
bank independence.

Asia and the Pacific

Perhaps the most well known and dramatic case of increased central
bank independence since 1990 is in the Asian and Pacific region. A
new and globally unique central bank statute went into effect in New
Zealand in February 1990.46 It had four main components: complete
freedom from political interference in the operation of monetary pol-
icy; the stipulation of a single central bank goal, price stability; a legally
specified inflation target; and a link between the governor’s tenure and
inflation performance.47 No other central bank in the world legally
specifies an inflation rate and makes this a performance criterion for
central bank personnel. The only chink in the central bank’s armor left
by this legislation is a provision for parliamentary revision of the infla-
tion target.48 The business weekly The Economist explicitly links inves-
tor interest in New Zealand with the uniquely independent Bank of
New Zealand.49

Several other countries in the Asian-Pacific region have seen an in-
crease in central bank authority in recent years, although the trend has
been less pronounced than elsewhere. In anticipation of change in the
legal status of the central bank, debate has heated up in Australia.
Looking to New Zealand, reformers have proposed complete indepen-
dence from the federal government and the stipulation of inflation
control as the bank’s sole objective.50

In Pakistan, after a period in which the central bank had suffered
significant decline, the World Bank began working with the govern-
ment in 1991 to strengthen this primary financial institution.51 A Sep-
tember 1993 presidential ordinance, part of Prime Minister Moeen
Qureshi’s economic reform program, allowed the State Bank of Paki-
stan to recruit staff without federal government clearance, gave it new
power to control the money supply and regulate commercial banks,
and set limits on deficit financing of the government.52 There were
modifications to this ordinance after Benazir Bhutto took over from
Moeen Qureshi in late 1993. These reduced the governor’s term of of-
fice and gave the government the right to name new board members.
Opponents of these changes warned that the change would create diffi-
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culties in the country’s negotiations with the IMF. They argued that an
independent central bank would increase the IMF’s confidence that the
government would abide by the loan agreement.53 The Bhutto govern-
ment was quick to defend itself publicly, emphasizing that the bank
retained the important power to limit credit to the federal and provin-
cial governments.

Elsewhere, in 1991 the IMF began helping the State Bank of Vietnam
become a central bank with the tools to control money and credit.54 In
Sri Lanka in that same year the central bank regained de facto auton-
omy, lost under the previous government. A previous victim of politi-
cal pressure, the Harvard-trained economist Neville Karunatillake, re-
turned to the governorship of the Central Bank of Sri Lanka on the
condition that there would be no political interference in the bank’s
operations. Prime Minister D. B. Wijetunge, also the finance minister,
appears to have honored his side of the bargain.55

There have even been tentative nonlegal moves toward increased
independence in South Korea and Japan. During his one-year tenure as
governor of the Bank of Korea from 1992 to 1993, Cho Soon was able to
raise the central bank’s status by exercising a strong and independent
voice on monetary policy and single-mindedly pursuing low inflation
and financial liberalization. He also called for revision of the Bank of
Korea charter.56 Tolerated for a while, Cho Soon eventually engen-
dered sufficient concern among government politicians to warrant his
dismissal. The union of Bank of Korea workers had worked hard to
raise public consciousness of, and support for, central bank indepen-
dence. Union members protested Cho Soon’s dismissal, and his succes-
sor at the central bank promised to continue giving top priority to sta-
bilizing the value of the won.57 Many observers criticized the nation’s
May 1993 draft financial reform legislation for its omission of provi-
sions for increased central bank autonomy.58

Japan’s central bank governor in the early 1990s, Yasushi Mieno,
exercised considerable independence and frequently raised the ire of
Liberal Democratic Party leaders.59 He restructured the Bank of Japan
internally in 1990, a year after being appointed.60 This restructuring,
involving increased research capacity, a stronger international depart-
ment, a more efficient payment system, and a new management struc-
ture, was “designed to show the central bank’s independence from the
finance ministry.”61 In a style consistent with Japanese politics, instead
of pressing for legal freedom, the Bank of Japan is “employing a flank-
ing strategy . . . that involves turning information gathering into regu-
latory and policy-making power.”62

In general the trend toward increased central bank independence
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has been less pronounced in Asia than in regions, such as Europe and
Latin America, in which middle-income developing countries seek to
ensure their ability to compete successfully for international capital.
Given interest rates paid on private international credits and its rela-
tively low levels of external debt relative to exports of goods and ser-
vices evident in Table 4.2, Asia as a region has had considerably less
need to be concerned with competing for international capital and
creditworthiness than Latin America or Central and Eastern Europe.
Financial regulation has also remained high, mitigating international
financial pressures.

Middle East

The push for central bank independence in the Middle East has been
limited. In Algeria central bank independence was decreed as part of a
broad package of economic liberalizations implemented in January
1991. Concern with international creditors’ views of Algeria was part
of the context in which these changes occurred. Legislation made the
Banque d’Algérie independent of government, accorded it power to
autonomously set monetary policy, and gave it a lead role in structur-
ing international financial transactions.63 The Iranian central bank,
Bank Markazi, moved unilaterally to detach itself from the government
in 1991 by rejecting its previous role as guarantor of foreign loans. The
Iranian political leadership tolerated, if it did not encourage, this
move,64 and one of the objectives of the 1994–1999 five-year economic
plan was more central bank independence in the formulation of mone-
tary policy.65 Although it is difficult to pinpoint precise motives for
specific changes in central bank independence without deep knowl-
edge of the particular context, it is plausible that these changes in cen-
tral bank independence also reflected concerns over international
creditworthiness. In Egypt a new banking law passed in June 1992
shifted authority over the banking sector from the Ministry of the Econ-
omy and Foreign Trade to the Bank of Egypt. Observers viewed this as
an important move toward increased authority and ultimately greater
independence for the central bank.66

The Middle East and Northern Africa is a region in relatively low
need of international creditworthiness (see Table 4.2). Debt relative
to exports is low and interest rates are low, reflecting the favor of inter-
national creditors. The relatively small moves toward central bank in-
dependence in the region have come in countries with weaker than
average balance of payments.
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Africa

As in so many other ways, Africa, the “lost continent” of the 1990s, has
remained outside the central bank reform movement. The issue of cen-
tral bank independence has arisen in relatively few African countries.
Among these are Namibia and South Africa. In the Namibian case the
role of the IMF was crucial. As part of an IMF and United Nations
Development Program assistance package, the Bank of Namibia was
run in 1990 by an official of the Dutch central bank. Largely owing to
the government’s unwillingness to “incur the IMF’s displeasure, he en-
joyed several victories in his efforts to increase Namibian central bank
autonomy.”67 In South Africa, provision for central bank independence
in the new national constitution was heatedly debated throughout
1993. Both the transitional and the permanent constitutions included
strong provisions for central bank independence.

African external debt is very high, but much of this reflects official
credit extended on concessional terms. Although South Africa and Ni-
geria are important exceptions, most countries in Africa suffer limited
access to international market finance, a situation that makes credit-
worthiness a minor concern. Relatively little increase in central bank
independence should not surprise us.

Conclusion

The pattern of regional variation in the extent of increase in central
bank status worldwide in the 1990s is consistent with variation in the
need to compete for capital and creditworthiness. Latin American po-
litical elites have viewed the need to compete for creditworthiness as
high, and legal central bank independence reflects this. The percentage
of countries in the region showing an increase is relatively high. As
Table 4.1 indicates, these increases in Latin America raised its average
for legal central bank independence to .55, among the highest of any
region. Central and Eastern Europe also had a very high percentage of
countries which increased legal independence, again reflecting a great
need to compete for international creditworthiness. Western Europe
began the 1990s in a position of relatively high legal independence;
many countries lagging in legal independence had changed their stat-
utes by mid-decade. The average level of legal central bank indepen-
dence remained low in Asia and the Middle East, where the need to
compete for creditworthiness was relatively low.
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TABLE 4.3
London Eurodollar and Interbank Interest Rates

YearInterest Rate aYear Interest Rate a

1970 13.719828.5
1971 6.6 1983 10.2

5.5 11.819841972
9.119859.21973

1986 7.011.01974
7.619877.01975

1988 8.45.61976
9.319896.01977

1990 8.58.71978
1979 12.0 1991 6.3
1980 14.4 1992 4.2
1981 16.1

Source: Data from IMF, International Financial Statistics (Wash-
ington, D.C.: IMF, various years).

a. Rate is for one-year Eurodollar loans in London through
1980. The 1981–1992 rate is the London interbank offer rate.

The number of efforts to increase central bank authority in the early
1990s marks a significant change over earlier trends. As we saw in
Table 1.1, this represents a rate of legislated increase in central bank
independence many times greater than in any other decade since
World War II. The evaluation of central bank independence based on
the coding of legal documents provides only a partial picture of trends
in central bank authority. Yet cross-temporal global trends evident in
this data accord with internationally determined change in the need
to compete for creditworthiness. For example, rising liquidity and
loan “pushing” characterize the 1970s, a period in which the legal
data indicate a relatively great decrease in central bank independence.
Table 4.3 provides data on interest rates in the London Eurodollar and
interbank markets that give an indication of the relationship between
global supply and demand for international financial resources. For
example, interest rates are relatively low, as in the 1970s, when supply
exceeds demand.

This variation between decades also helps us begin to separate con-
cern over inflation from the need to compete for international capital as
motivations for central bank independence. There appears to be a
much closer temporal connection between the rise of portfolio finance
(and the need to compete for capital associated with it) and central
bank independence than there is between inflation and central bank
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independence. Inflation was very severe in developing countries in the
1970s and 1980s, yet central bank independence decreased in the 1970s
and changed little in the 1980s.

Despite the utility of quantitative indicators of legal independence, it
is important to remember that they may miss important elements of
central bank discretion and authority. The limited quantitative data
presented here fall short of providing a full understanding of the extent
to which political elites facing complex domestic politico-economic
pressures give priority to the need for international creditworthiness.
In an effort to gain a fuller empirical picture of the connection between
the need for and value of competing for international creditworthiness,
on the one hand, and central bank authority, on the other, the following
four chapters present detailed histories of central bank authority in
specific developing countries.



Five

The Politics of Changing Central Bank
Authority: Thailand

APPROACHING central bank authority from an international perspective
suggests that, globally, changes in central bank authority should occur
in broad temporal waves as international financial integration in-
creases, as the relationship between supply and demand of interna-
tional financial resources varies, and as predominant forms of inter-
national investment change. But as the cross-regional variation evident
in Chapter 4 suggests, governing politicians’ views of the need to
compete for capital are influenced by domestic as well as international
factors, including national balance of payments constraints, national
regulation of financial transactions, and national politicians’ tenure se-
curity. The perception of the need to compete for capital internationally
is related to objective conditions; but it is not easily judged through
simple quantitative indicators. Yet if central bank status changes partly
in response to the need to compete for capital internationally, this
should be evident in studies of change in the authority of central banks
in particular countries over time. This and the following three chapters
examine change in central bank authority in four developing countries.
These case studies explore the extent to which changes in politicians’
perceptions of the need and value of competing for capital internation-
ally have affected central bank authority.

The four countries, Thailand, Mexico, South Korea, and Thailand,
were chosen from the set of newly industrializing countries because
they represent a wide range of experiences and contexts. The countries
were chosen independently of any knowledge of variation in their
need to compete for capital internationally or in their level of central
bank authority.1 Together the country histories include many instances
of change in the need to compete for capital internationally and change
or nonchange in central bank authority. The analysis pools observa-
tions across countries in Chapter 9.

Recall the argument that the need to compete internationally for cap-
ital is more likely to lead politicians to increase central bank indepen-
dence the greater the objective need for balance of payments support
and creditworthiness, the greater the expected effectiveness of signal-
ing (a function of the extent of foreign investment in the form of securi-
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ties, particularly bonds, and the supply and demand of international
financial resources), the greater politicians’ tenure security, and the
lower a country’s regulation of national and international financial
transactions. In the country histories a combination of quantitative in-
dicators and qualitative evaluation is used to identify these factors and
their impact on politicians’ actions vis-à-vis central banks.

Factors shaping political elites’ perceptions of need for credit-
worthiness are complex. We can expect some correlation with objective
conditions. Although some balance of payments crises are more easily
corrected than others, I use “import coverage” (month’s worth of im-
ports covered by central bank reserves) to indicate actual balance of
payments pressure. Data on foreign exchange reserves used in calculat-
ing import coverage are also included. The average interest rate on new
private international credits to each country, minus the London inter-
bank or Eurodollar interest rate, is a measure of international creditors’
evaluation of national creditworthiness.

Data on annual stocks of foreign investment in the form of bonds
indicate the relative effectiveness of signaling creditworthiness via cen-
tral bank independence, as outlined in Chapter 3. The nominal or real
stock of foreign investment is less important than the changing relative
composition of foreign investment in any given country. Rapid in-
crease in any particular form of international liability in any given
country suggests the relative predominance of that mode of inter-
national financial intermediation globally. The relationship of global
supply and demand for financial resources is assessed qualitatively
and on the basis of interest rates on Eurodollars and interbank loans in
London presented in Table 4.3. For each of the four country studies,
financial regulation and politicians’ tenure security are evaluated qual-
itatively as part of the historical narrative. In general, financial regula-
tion is a relatively minor part of the story of the changing need and
value of competing for international creditworthiness and varying
central bank status, because levels of regulation are fairly consistent
over time. Financial regulation is a more important part of the explana-
tion for the temporally fixed cross-national variation in the need for
international creditworthiness and central bank independence evident
in the four countries highlighted here. This static cross-national
comparison is explored in Chapter 9; the emphasis in this and the
following three chapters is on explaining change over time within a
single country.

Given the problems, discussed in Chapter 2, that are associated with
measuring central bank independence through quantitative coding of
legal statutes, particularly in developing countries, the country profiles
use more traditional and contextual measures of power. Central bank
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independence is low when there is conflict between the central bank
and the government which is not resolved in the central bank’s favor,
and/or when policy falls far from the central bank’s preferred position
and/or when it is clear that the central bank de facto follows executive
branch directives.2

Table 5.1 presents data indicating change over time in Thailand’s
objective need for balance of payments support and international
creditworthiness. Data on the composition of foreign investment, from
which the relative weight of different assets is evident, are presented
in Table 5.2.

The Thai government has regulated domestic and international fi-
nancial transactions very little, especially compared with other middle-
income developing countries. The capital account has been compara-
tively and consistently open in Thailand since the 1950s. Foreign
exchange allocation was regulated by the central bank from 1942 to
1947, when liberalization began.3 Remaining controls on exchange
allocation, which consisted of a system of multiple rates for different
types of activities, were eliminated in the mid-1950s. After 1957, provi-
sion of selective, preferential credit was the exception rather than the
norm, as in many other middle-income developing countries. In gen-
eral, relatively unrestricted domestic and international financial trans-
actions increased the incentive for central bank independence. Regula-
tion was relatively and fairly consistently liberal from 1957 until the
present, with a marginal increase in the mid-1970s.4

The Central Bank: From Weak to Strong

There are three turning points in Bank of Thailand history: 1959, 1973,
and 1982. The first and third are associated with an increase in the need
to compete for international creditworthiness. They mark the begin-
ning of periods of increased central bank authority. The year 1973
marks the beginning of a period of decline in central bank authority
and is associated with a decline in the need to compete for international
creditworthiness.

Weak Central Bank Authority, 1948–1957

As the Bank of Thailand began operations during the postwar adminis-
tration of Field Marshal Plaek Phibunsongkhram (1948–1957),5 its
governorship turned over an average of every two years. Turnover
was virtually the same for the Ministry of Finance. Conflict between
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TABLE 5.1
Indicators of Thailand’s Need to Compete for International Capital

Average Annual Interest
on Private Credit Minus

Foreign Exchange the Eurodollar or Libor
Interest RateaReserves (U.S. millions)Import CoverageYear

7215.241946
687.351947

13911.581948
1006.221949
1709.751950
24510.801951
2359.261952
1916.941953
1666.391954
1896.791955
2036.661956
2096.151957
1945.921958
2045.751959
2566.871960
3398.391961
4088.971962
4618.881963
5459.621964
62410.091965
80810.891966
89310.041967
9059.371968
8698.361969
7907.301970

−2.57366.861971
−0.68967.251972
N.A.1,1326.631973
−2.01,6816.421974
−0.41,6055.871975

1.51,7255.801976
2.51,7354.511977
2.21,9744.421978
0.11,7943.011979

−0.61,5522.021980
−2.41,6712.011981
−2.81,5132.121982
−1.21,5611.821983
−1.31,8902.181984
−1.52,1572.801985
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TABLE 5.1 (cont.)

Average Annual Interest
on Private Credit Minus

Foreign Exchange the Eurodollar or Libor
Import CoverageYear Reserves (U.S. millions) Interest Ratea

1986 3.58 2,736 −1.4
3,906 −1.63.601987

1988 −1.93.60 5,997
9,461 −1.44.411989

4.76 13,247 −1.51990
N.A. N.A. 1.41991
N.A. N.A. 2.91992

Source: Calculated from IMF, International Financial Statistics (Washington, D.C.: IMF,
various years), and World Bank, World Debt Tables (Washington, D.C.: World Bank, vari-
ous years).

Note: The World Debt Tables changed the definition of the numerator in 1980. N.A.–Not
available.

a. Libor–London interbank offer rate.

the government and the bank was relatively great, with the Bank of
Thailand usually on the losing side. This was most obvious during
the governorship of Dej Santivong (see Table 5.3). The early 1950s
was a period of deficit financing and heavy government involve-
ment in production and distribution. As is evident in the 1952 annual
report of the Bank of Thailand, Dej opposed deficit spending and
blamed the government’s heavy investment in economic activities,
which he felt should be the province of the private sector.6 When
Phibun ordered the central bank to revalue the baht vis-à-vis the pound
sterling in 1952, Dej refused on the grounds that this would hurt ex-
ports, and resigned.

Another major conflict arose in 1953, leading to Phibun’s dismissal
of the deputy governor of the bank, Puey Ungphakorn. Phibun wanted
the central bank to make foreign exchange available at rates highly
favorable to commercial banks. The Bank of Thailand protested,
fearing the loans would be used in financial arbitrage, and issued a
prohibition on commercial bank sale of foreign exchange at subsidized
rates. One bank, with highly placed military supporters, violated this
prohibition. The resulting cabinet-level hearing resolved to fine the
bank but also to dismiss the Bank of Thailand official who had issued
the prohibition.7

During this time the need for international creditworthiness became
objectively greater, as Table 5.1 indicates. The extent of import cover-
age, for example, fluctuated greatly. Steep declines in months’ worth of
imports covered by central bank reserves occurred in 1946, 1949, and
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TABLE 5.2
Foreign Investment in Thailand (stock of investments,
in U.S. millions)

Equities LoansBondsFDIYear

3.71954
4.51955

28.12.41956
24.12.41957
13.93.31958
19.53.41959
30.12.41960
26.86.01961
51.67.51962
43.620.61963
65.018.11964
29.728.41965
18.027.01966
40.043.01967
30.060.01968
60.051.01969
85.043.01970
93.039.01971

163.063.01972
117.065.01973
238.0157.01974
276.071.01975
389.069.01976
561.091.01977

5.0 908.057.045.01978
3.0 1,562.0137.042.01979

39.0 2,341.035.0146.01980
10.0 2,009.028.0249.01981
24.0 1,755.037.0174.01982
14.0 1,872.088.0327.01983
33.0 2,481.0116.0346.01984
41.0 2,385.0854.0163.01985
96.0 1,863.0126.0263.01986

499.0 1,833.0(154.0)352.01987
444.0 1,660.087.01,105.51988

1,424.0 3,097.063.01,775.01989
440.0 4,164.0(478.0)2,444.01990
37.0 5,011.0(118.0)2,014.01991

455.0 4,487.0295.01992 2,116.0

Source: IMF, International Financial Statistics (Washington, D.C.: IMF,
various years).

Note: FDI–Foreign direct investment.



TABLE 5.3
Change of Government, Regime Type, and Central Bank Governor in Thailand

Bank of Thailand GovernorRegimePrime Minister

Viwat-anachaichaiyan (1942–46)MILITARYPlaek Phibunsongkhram (1938–44)

Kuang Aphaiwong (1944–45) SEMI-DEM.
Thavee Bunyaket (1945)
Seni Pramoj (1945–46)

Serm Winijaikul (1946–47)DEMOCRATICKuang Aphaiwong (1946)
Pridi Banomyong (1946)
Thawal Thamrongnawasawat

(1946–47)

Laeng Srisomwongse (1947–48)MILITARYKuang Aphaiwong (1947–48)
Plaek Phibunsongkram (1948–57)

Viwat-anachaichaiyan (1948)
Laeng Srisomwongse (1948–49)
Dej Santivong (1949–52)
Serm Winijaikul (1952–55)
Kasem Srihpayak (1955–58)

Poj Sarasin (1957)
Jote Guna-Kasem (1958–59)Thanom Kittikachorn (1958–59)
Puey Ungphakorn (1959–71)Sarit Thanarat (1959–63)

Thanom Kittikachorn (1963–73)

Bisudhi NimmanhaeminDEMOCRATICSanya Thammasak (1973–75)
(1971–75)

Seni Pramoj (1975)
Kukrit Pramoj (1975–76) Snoh Unakul (1975–79)
Seni Pramoj (1976)

MILITARYThanin Kraivichien (1976–77)

SEMI-DEM.Kriangsak Chamanan (1977–79)
Nukun Prachuabmoh (1979–82)Prem Tinsulanond (1979–87)
Kamchorn Sathirakul (1982–88)

DEMOCRATICChatchai Shunhanan (1988–91)
Chavalit Thanachanan (1988)
Vijit Supanit (1988–)MILITARYAnand Panyarachun (1991–92)

Suchinda Krapayoon (1992)
Anand Panyarachun (1992)

DEMOCRATICChuan Leekpai (1992)
Barnharn Silapaarcha (1995)
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1953. (Although these are sharp declines in the Thai context, import
coverage still remained fairly high compared with that of other devel-
oping countries.) From annual increases of international reserves of 45
percent in 1950 and 25 percent in 1951, reserves declined or increased
only minimally between 1952 and 1958.

Increased Central Bank Authority after 1959

The initial weakness of Thailand’s central bank authority contrasts
sharply with its steady growth after 1957. Thailand’s declining interna-
tional reserves in the mid- and late 1950s (see Table 5.1) gave President
Sarit Thanarat a strong desire for recognition from the International
Bank for Reconstruction and Redevelopment and the U.S. government.
The rise in central bank independence coincides with Sarit’s desire to
improve Thailand’s international creditworthiness.

In terms of the relationship between supply and demand of interna-
tional investment, the 1950s were not an era of tremendous liquidity
and availability of commercial loans. But the World Bank was coming
into its own as one of the new Bretton Woods institutions purveying
loans around the world. World Bank missions to developing countries
engaged in serious study and recommendations for economic policy
and institution building. These missions brought the promise of loans
and left a reform blueprint. Although conditionality was not as explicit
as it became in the context of IMF stabilization loans in the late 1970s,
those who wanted access to World Bank loans had to show signs of
commitment to comply with bank suggestions.

Accompanying the objective increase in Thailand’s need for interna-
tional creditworthiness, partially indicated in Table 5.1, was a change
in the time horizon of political leaders, stemming from increased ten-
ure security. Phibun was replaced by Marshal Sarit Thanarat. Both the
Phibun and Sarit regimes were military, but after coming to power
through a military coup in 1958 Sarit was able to wipe out the many
competing military factions that had plagued the Phibun era.

During the Phibun administration the military was divided into
three principal factions, one under Phibun, a second under General
Phin Chunhawan and Police General Phao Sriyanond, and a third
under Marshal Sarit. Political opposition to the military regime also
came from the Democratic Party, a major force in the National Assem-
bly. Between 1948 and 1951 Phibun’s government was challenged by
three coup attempts.8 After 1951 Phibun only managed to stay in power
by playing the Sarit and Pao factions off against each other.
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Financial demands by Phibun’s government were a direct source
of central bank–government conflict. Sarit, when he came to power,
managed to secure his leadership and reduce the patronage costs of
remaining in power by eliminating competing factions. Sarit also
developed illicit means for increasing the spoils of office-holding with-
out demanding that the central bank print more money. The elimina-
tion of rival factions brought an increased measure of elite political
stability to Thailand. Sarit could be much more secure about his tenure
in office than his predecessor had ever been. Greater tenure security
increased the value of improving Thailand’s international credit-
worthiness.

Central bank governor Puey, appointed by Sarit in 1959, exploited
the political leadership’s desire for international support. He used his
personal ties to international credit organizations as leverage with mil-
itary leaders.9 Puey occasionally threatened to resign when he could
not secure government cooperation; these threats were powerful be-
cause in international circles Puey was perceived as the “only honest
Thai,” and international financiers would not do business with Thai-
land unless he was involved.10 Stifel notes that to achieve its goals the
Bank of Thailand “skillfully mobilized the support of foreign aid do-
nors as a powerful lever in their internal political effort.”11

Puey used the political elite’s concern with international credit-
worthiness to greatly increase the central bank’s authority. On the few
occasions when open disagreement arose between the Bank of Thai-
land and the military, the military backed down. The most public
source of disagreement was over the role of military personnel on the
boards of commercial banks. After Puey made a public speech subtly
condemning the practice of generals sitting on bank boards, at least one
field marshal resigned as a bank board member. In another instance
Puey tried to encourage two generals on the board of a failing bank to
intervene; they refused and the bank, the Thai Development Bank, be-
came insolvent. Chagrined, the generals reportedly apologized to Puey
for their obstinateness.12

The authority of the central bank under Puey is also evident in
debate over the locus of responsibility for fiscal policy. The govern-
ment proposed the creation of a new committee to handle fiscal issues,
especially those internationally related. Puey’s response was that
such policy lay clearly under the jurisdiction of the Bank of Thailand.
“I did not see any use for the new committee,” Puey recalls, “and if
this committee was appointed [I said] I would have no choice but
to resign . . . nobody ever mentioned the committee for fiscal policy
again.”13
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International Liquidity and Unstable Democracy:
Central Bank Weakening

The beginning of democratic government in the mid-1970s marks a sec-
ond turning point in Thai central bank history. The uncertain political
environment created by the democratic opening decreased political
leaders’ tenure security and their assignment of value to maintaining
international creditworthiness. Uncertainty also increased politicians’
desire to wrest authority over financial and monetary policy from the
central bank in order to increase their arsenal of political weapons.

Objective conditions did little to counterbalance these pressures.
The flood of oil revenues into the Euromarket also decreased the im-
portance of maintaining international creditworthiness. International
loan rates were low, and banks pushed loans wherever they could.
Annual increase in total international lending rose from 27 percent in
1972 to 56 percent in 1974.14 The need to maintain international credit-
worthiness declined as resources became easier and less expensive
to get. Thailand’s international reserves, which had shrunk annually
from 1969 to 1971, rose 21, 24, and 42 percent annually in 1972, 1973,
and 1974, respectively. Meanwhile the nation continued to enjoy high
creditworthiness in international financial markets as indicated by
the comparatively low interest rates charged by private international
creditors. For example, as is evident in Tables 5.1, 6.1, and 7.1, in
1971 the average interest charged on private international loans to
Thailand was .4 percent below the rate on one-year Eurodollar deposits
in London, while Mexico and Korea paid 1.2 percent over the Euro-
dollar London rate.

Sarit’s successor, Marshal Thanom Kittikachorn, governed—as Sarit
had—with military backing under an interim constitution. But Thanom
did not enjoy Sarit’s success in controlling either the outbreak of mili-
tary factionalism or civilian pressures to accelerate the drafting of a
new constitution. A new constitution was promulgated in 1968 legaliz-
ing political parties, which had been banned for ten years, and creating
a semi-parliamentary system; parliamentary elections were held in
1969. Thirteen parties were organized.15

The military continued to be the primary force in politics, but dis-
putes between military leaders constantly threatened Thanom’s leader-
ship and provided further openings for the civilian opposition. This
factionalism came to a head in 1971 with a military coup; the new gov-
ernment dissolved the legislature, revoked the constitution, and
banned political parties and meetings.16
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Civilian backlash against military rule intensified; in what is known
as the “October Revolution” the monarchy intervened, forcing Thanom
to resign. A new constitution was invoked and the parliamentary sys-
tem was reinstated in 1974. January 1975 elections yielded a multiparty
coalition government under the leadership of M. R. Kukrit Pramoj of
the Social Action Party, after a Democratic Party coalition suffered a
no-confidence vote. The unstable base of this coalition and the govern-
ments that followed forced politicians to use cabinet appointments as
rewards for political support. For example, Boonchu Rojanastien, ap-
pointed finance minister in 1978, was a leading party politician who
sought to further his political ambitions at the expense of central bank
authority.

The renewed need for Thai political leaders to engage in patronage
politics in order to maintain power created incentives to capture the
central bank as a source of funds to generate political support. While
political uncertainty created incentives for political leaders to under-
mine central bank authority, the era of easy money internationally un-
dermined a potential bulwark against these pressures. The World
Bank, for example, encouraged Thai borrowing.17 The rise of interna-
tional liquidity and ease of access to international loans undercut what
had been an important source of Bank of Thailand authority in the
1950s and 1960s.

The roles of the central bank and the Ministry of Finance in the adop-
tion of selective credit for agriculture in the 1970s reveals the changed
balance of power between the central bank and the government.18 The
private banks opposed the program, arguing that the loans were too
risky, in large measure because the banks did not have the capacity to
effectively evaluate potential rural borrowers.19 The program posed a
similar problem for the Bank of Thailand, which did not have an agri-
cultural credit division to supervise the program. A group with this
responsibility was set up within the bank, but initiative and control
over the program lay with the Ministry of Finance.20 “The Ministry of
Finance said we had to do it,” notes Chavalit Thanachanan, a high-
level Bank of Thailand staffer at the time, about this program.21

The increase in government regulation indicated by this preferential
credit program was roughly simultaneous with the decrease in central
bank independence. Nonetheless, the general excess of international
financial resources compared with demand, Thailand’s strong balance
of payments position, and high creditworthiness as indicated by inter-
est rate data in Table 5.1 were more proximate reasons for Thai politi-
cians’ decision to rescind de facto central bank independence than was
the extent of financial regulation.
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The weakness of the Bank of Thailand in the 1970s, compared with
the 1960s, is also evident in other episodes beyond the squabble over
agricultural credit. Criticism of the central bank governor Snoh Unakul
for his handling of the Raja Financial Company, for example, was an
important factor leading to his resignation. The Raja Company, on the
verge of failure, used its connections to convince several military offi-
cers to pressure for a government bail-out.22 The Ministry of Finance
supported this move. Snoh was forced to choose between acceding to
a bail-out he felt would compromise the central bank and resigning.23

When asked in retrospect about Bank of Thailand preferences regard-
ing Ministry of Finance actions during this time, Finance Minister
Boonchu commented that Bank of Thailand officials disagreed with the
Ministry of Finance, but had no recourse.24

In 1976 the democratic period ended with the military’s installation
of Thanin Kraivichien as prime minister and the appointment of a new
legislature. Opposition to military government from civil servants, lib-
eral parties, and violent protest by the Communist Party of Thailand
posed threats to Thanin’s tenure that continued to create incentives for
political manipulation of the central bank. Discord within the military
added uncertainty to the situation. In 1978 a military faction of “young
Turks” led another coup, resulting in the installation of General Kri-
angsak Chamanan. A new national constitution was promulgated in
1978 that theoretically increased the power of the parliament.25 Parlia-
mentary elections in 1979 saw a wide dispersal of votes among multi-
ple parties; this made parliamentary politics highly unstable. In addi-
tion to uncertainty surrounding parliamentary reaction to and support
for executive branch actions, growing fragmentation of power among
army generals made gaining military support more difficult.26 The in-
centives created by this uncertain political environment were not con-
ducive to restoration of Bank of Thailand authority.

In a detailed study of economic policymaking, Doner and Laothama-
tas suggest that Kriangsak’s efforts to shore up his political position by
dispensing government jobs to key politicians led to changes in the
budget process that resulted in a total loss of central bank or finance
ministry control over military and state enterprise spending.27 Central
bank authority also declined.

Kriangsak’s appointment of Boonchu as minister of finance typifies
the way that government leaders’ tenure insecurity may undermine
central bank authority, if there are no countervailing pressures. Kriang-
sak himself held the Ministry of Finance position at first because he
could not find a suitable candidate. He correctly feared the power that
the appointment of Boonchu would give the Social Action Party (SAP)
within his coalition government. Boonchu had made full finance minis-
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try control over other economic policymaking bodies of the executive
a condition for accepting the job. The Social Action Party pressured
hard for Boonchu to be given the position; but many of Kriangsak’s
supporters objected that Boonchu had orchestrated the private banks’
to refusal to bring new foreign loans into the increasingly credit-
squeezed Thai economy. Nevertheless Kriangsak did not feel he could
afford to alienate the SAP.28 Once appointed finance minister, Boonchu
tended to use government funds to gain political support for himself
and his party. This was not conducive to central bank authority.29

The Need for International Creditworthiness and
Renewed Central Bank Status

After 1979 Thailand’s need for external creditworthiness began to rise
again. In 1979 and 1980 Thailand suffered significant decline in import
coverage. The level of import coverage reached in 1980, only two
months’ worth of imports covered by total central bank reserves, was
the lowest in post–World War II Thai history. The early 1980s also saw
Thailand’s ratio of external debt to exports of goods and services more
than double. The need to compete for international capital was on the
rise generally after 1982, as global liquidity dried up. International
loans became scarce and expensive, especially compared with the
1970s. In Thailand, foreign investment in the form of bonds also rose
steeply in 1979 (see Table 5.2).

Although one would expect these events to be associated with a rise
in central bank authority, evaluation of Thailand in the 1980s suggests
that the impact was not immediate. From 1979 to 1982 the central bank
found itself in frequent conflict with the finance ministry over auster-
ity-related measures and was often on the losing side. The central bank
governor appointed in 1982 enjoyed rising respect in international cir-
cles, however, and a tenure in office only exceeded in Thai history by
Puey in the 1960s. As part of its effort to restore Thailand’s access to
international credit, the Prem government made an effort to insulate
the central bank from the political pressures under which it had oper-
ated since the democratic opening beginning in the late 1960s.

Influencing political leaders’ subjective perceptions of the need for
international creditworthiness was the uncertainty surrounding Gen-
eral Prem Tinsulanond’s grip on power. Prem’s initial political support
came from a four-party coalition. As in the 1970s, the rigors of govern-
ing through a coalition in a semi-democratic environment continued to
create incentives to manipulate the central bank for short-term political
gain. Prem’s emphasis on restoring Thailand’s credibility with interna-
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tional creditors facilitated the increase in central bank authority, but
monarchical support for the Prem government could only go so far in
counterbalancing pressures from coup attempts and unexpected elec-
tions that led to government–central bank conflict.

The Thanin-Kriangsak period preceding Prem was viewed as one of
crisis in which foreign direct investment had declined and agricultural
exports stagnated. After several years of strong growth in the mid-
1970s, international reserves contracted in 1979. The change was dra-
matic: from 22 percent growth in 1979 to 3 percent contraction in 1980.
International lending also began to shrink after many years of steady
increase. Beginning in 1973 inflation rates had begun to climb. The
Bank of Thailand began experiencing difficulty attaining foreign loans.
“The country’s traditionally strong reputation among foreign lenders,”
note Doner and Laothamatas, “seemed to be weakening.”30

In early March 1980 Army Commander-in-Chief Prem Tinsulanond
was appointed prime minister by the king and was later elected by the
lower house of the legislature to succeed Kriangsak, who resigned after
years of mounting political trouble. Prem had a reputation for incor-
ruptibility and enjoyed the support of key military factions, a coalition
of political parties, and the king. In 1981 Prem faced a coup attempt
that he put down with support from the monarchy and its loyalists.
Prem put down a second coup attempt in 1985 and faced unanticipated
elections in 1983, 1986, and 1988.31

The rigors of maintaining the support of a party coalition to help
confront military insurrection made the finance ministry, in particular,
susceptible to pressures that created tension with the central bank.32 In
1985, for example, the minister of finance “was a primary target for a
no-confidence motion in the Parliament.”33 Even before this, and de-
spite a generally shared outlook on price stability and an overall in-
crease in central bank authority, there were a number of conflicts be-
tween the central bank governor, Nukun Prachuabmoh, and Finance
Minister Somaii Huntrakul over the extent of sacrifice necessary to
achieve inflation control.34

In one instance of conflict Nukun wanted to float both savings and
loan rates, while Somaii wanted to cushion the blow to borrowers
and keep the ceiling on loan rates.35 In the end, the finance ministry
position prevailed. In another case, the Bank of Thailand imposed
an 18 percent ceiling on commercial bank credit increases, which
caused a credit crunch seriously affecting small- and medium-sized in-
dustry. There was heavy criticism from business, the media, and the
finance ministry; and the measure was reversed. Trouble also arose
between the central bank and finance ministry when the Bank of Thai-
land made a public statement opposing Thailand’s planned purchase
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of several F-16 fighter planes on the grounds that the purchase would
strain the national budget. Somaii criticized this public discussion of
budget policy by the Bank of Thailand. Conflict also surrounded policy
toward troubled financial institutions, of which there were many in
this period. The Ministry of Finance position was generally that the
central bank should extend soft loans. The Bank of Thailand felt this
was unsound policy.

Other conflicts, with less clear macroeconomic policy motivations,
also occurred. For example, the Bank of Thailand proposed a savings
insurance scheme which Somaii opposed. The finance minister’s threat
of resignation led the cabinet to table the Bank of Thailand proposal.
Another source of friction between the central bank and the Ministry of
Finance concerned the supervision of commercial banks. Believing
Bank of Thailand supervision to be lax, Somaii assigned personnel
from the finance ministry’s Fiscal Policy Office to work with Bank of
Thailand supervisors on a regular basis.

Somaii eventually dismissed Nukun, abruptly, in the wake of a bank
collapse that drew considerable media attention. Somaii brought in a
close associate, Kamchorn Sathirakul, to run the central bank. Open
conflict arose again when Pramual, a Social Action and Chart Thai
Party politician with close ties to Boonchu, became minister of finance.
The conflicts between Pramual and Kamchorn were typically over the
finance ministry’s expansionary macroeconomic policy preferences.
In one case the Bank of Thailand simultaneously removed interest
rate ceilings and restricted credit expansion; Minister of Finance Pra-
mual opposed the measures because they would slow growth. He also
accused the bank of colluding with private banks in setting interest
rates and promised the public he would not allow this in the future.
Many interpreted this statement to mean that the Bank of Thailand
would not be allowed to independently formulate and implement
monetary policy.36

Although both personality clashes and the difficulties of trying to
keep Prem’s coalition partners content caused considerable conflict, the
Bank of Thailand was marginally more autonomous under Prem than
it had been under Kriangsak. Kamchorn lasted six years as governor,
during which he was able to partially regain the central bank’s tradi-
tional veto power over national fiscal policy. The political leadership’s
emphasis on restoring Thailand’s international creditworthiness al-
lowed Kamchorn, as Puey before him, to use his links to international
creditors such as the World Bank as leverage in policy debates with the
government. One high-level Bank of Thailand staffer recalls, “We had
our policy preferences, which were similar to the IMF’s, but we had to
ask the IMF to impose them because of opposition from outside gov-
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ernment.”37 Kamchorn’s coup de grace came when Pramual negotiated
the terms of entry into the Thai financial market of five foreign banks
without consulting the Bank of Thailand. Kamchorn left the governor-
ship in a media uproar over Pramual’s lack of respect for central bank
independence.

The trend toward restored central bank independence, however, has
continued. The most recent era includes the short preretirement gover-
norship of Chavalit Thanashanan and that of his successor, Vijit
Supanit. Vijit was a central bank insider; his appointment was viewed
as a sign that the Ministry of Finance, where the nomination for gover-
nor typically originates, intended to support Bank of Thailand auton-
omy.38 This period spans the end of the elected Chatchai government
and the militarily installed Anand government. In the early 1990s, as
Tables 5.1 and 5.2 indicate, debt, interest rates and portfolio foreign
investment in Thailand all rose. In this context it is not surprising that
Anand’s government showed great respect for central bank indepen-
dence, to the point of supporting discussion of charter changes that
would legally secure greater autonomy.39

Conclusion

Change in the status of the Bank of Thailand appears to be connected
with changes in governing politicians’ perceptions of the need to in-
crease international creditworthiness. While the extent of government
financial regulation remained relatively low and open after 1957,
changes in politicians’ security, in objective indicators of balance of
payments trouble and the stock of creditworthiness, and in the compo-
sition of foreign investment, appear to have influenced the likelihood
of change in central bank status as expected. Sarit increased central
bank independence in 1957. He was more secure in his position
and stayed in power longer than his predecessor; he also wanted to
improve Thailand’s balance of payments position. The democratic
opening in 1973 lowered governing politicians’ tenure security. This,
combined with a relatively sound balance of payments, excessively
easy international credit, and the tremendous favor creditors found in
Thailand (evident in interest rates in Table 5.1), led to a decline in
central bank status. This situation was partially reversed when the sup-
ply of international financial resources contracted in the 1980s and
Thailand’s balance of payments position deteriorated. After several
years of consolidating his power, Prem gained the political security
that finally permitted him the luxury of increasing central bank inde-
pendence in 1982.



C E N T R A L B A N K A U T H O R I T Y: T H A I L A N D 87

Chapter 2 outlined the arguments typically made to explain central
bank authority. These are based on law, sectoral strength, political in-
stitutions, government financial needs, ideology, and leadership capa-
bilities. The explanation derived from the need to compete for interna-
tional creditworthiness draws on several of these factors, combining
the need for government finance with aspects of the arguments based
on sectoral strength and political institution. The competing argu-
ments, based on law, personality or leadership capability, and ideol-
ogy, are not supported by Thai central bank history.

Legal Arguments

If law were the primary determinant of central bank authority, we
would expect to see a decrease or an increase in conflict between the
central bank and the government, and conflict resolution closer to or
further from the central bank’s ideal point, after changes in legislation
affecting central bank independence. The Thai central bank statute it-
self has not been rewritten since it was promulgated in 1942, although
several other legal changes clearly impinge on central bank indepen-
dence. The most important are the commercial banking acts promul-
gated in 1962 and 1979 and the government budget law enacted in
1959. Measures of central bank independence based on central bank
statutes do not capture changes in authority implied by legislation in
related areas. Legal coding of central bank statutes, following the
Cukierman et al. (1992) criteria, reveals no change in Bank of Thailand
authority between 1950 and 1990.

Even the pattern of changing authority implied by legislation in the
related areas of commercial banking and government budgeting corre-
sponds only weakly to the pattern of change in central bank authority
as evident in government–central bank conflict. The Government
Budget Procedures Act of October 1959 discontinued Bank of Thailand
financing of the government through overdraft mechanisms.40 The
Commercial Banking Acts of 1962, 1979, and 1985 are other pieces of
legislation that increase central bank supervisory power vis-à-vis the
commercial banks.41 The dates of these changes correspond roughly to
eras in which central bank authority rose. Whether they are cause or
effect of political leaders’ decisions to respect central bank authority is
hard to determine.

Puey, the central bank governor appointed in 1959, had strongly
supported the end of overdraft financing of the government because he
believed it compromised central bank autonomy. The timing of the
Government Budget Procedure Act reflects both Puey’s appointment



88 C H A P T E R F I V E

and Sarit’s interest in increasing Thailand’s international credit-
worthiness, which led to his choice of Puey.

The 1962 Commercial Banking Act also strengthened the Bank of
Thailand by providing new tools for banking supervision and control
of credit. The timing and formulation process of this legislation illus-
trates how financial law follows politics, rather than the other way
around. Both Puey and his colleagues in the multilateral credit agencies
saw increasing the central bank’s supervision and control of commer-
cial banking as crucial to the bank’s ability to increase and sustain its
authority. Maintenance of price stability, a key to international credit-
worthiness, requires the ability to control credit, among other things.
Puey drafted this legislation, but rather than imposing new commercial
bank regulations unilaterally, Puey was careful to involve the commer-
cial banks through consultation with the Thai Bankers Association.42

Government sympathy for the central bank facilitated central bank–
private bank collaboration. Had political leaders been less internation-
ally oriented and more nationalist and/or populist, central bank–pri-
vate bank collaboration could easily have become politicized, stirring
popular opposition to the central bank and increasing the potential for
government interference.43

Another major legislative change increasing the legal scope for cen-
tral bank action was the 1979 Commercial Bank Act. Its timing corre-
sponds with a period in which objective conditions suggested in-
creased need for international creditworthiness. But the legislative
change can hardly be interpreted as causing the modest increase in
central bank authority that began after 1982. The legislation was con-
troversial. The political environment of hesitant and sporadic progress
toward liberalization was not conducive to close central bank–private
bank consultation over regulatory reform. When the policy was an-
nounced, private banks were angry over the lack of prior consultation;
this damaged central bank credibility with domestic bankers for sev-
eral years. The 1985 commercial bank law reform came at a time when
the central bank was gradually winning the campaign to restore lost
autonomy.

Decrease in central bank authority is not associated with any legal
change in Thailand. Legal protection of central bank independence and
growing political support for central bank autonomy may be mutually
reinforcing, but law alone will not prevent politically motivated en-
croachment on central bank authority—especially not in a developing-
country context, where the role of law is uncertain. Lack of variation in
the Bank of Thailand statute contrasts sharply with instability in the
legal framework overall: Thailand had thirteen constitutions and seven
constitutional amendments in the fifty years from 1932 to 1982.44
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In cross-national comparative terms, as briefly noted in Chapter 2,
there is also some reason to doubt the validity of a legal approach to
central bank authority. The Bank of Thailand’s position in the interna-
tional rankings of central bank independence, based on the coding of
its legal statute, falls significantly below where it would be placed
based on a conflict-oriented evaluation.

Leadership and Ideology

Puey Ungphakorn is the kind of governor who comes to mind when
the argument is made that central bank authority rests on the quality of
its leadership. He had integrity; he was cautious and judicious. He per-
fected the art of moral suasion in the conduct of bank regulation. Tales
are told that he had informants who would provide information on
bankers’ conduct; if reports of “inappropriate behavior” (excessive
drinking, extramarital affairs) reached Puey, subtle reprimands were
delivered. This practice increased Puey’s reputation of integrity, be-
cause it was thought that only a man above moral reproach himself
would dare to employ such practices.

But leadership qualities are an unsatisfying explanation of institu-
tional capability. Moe and Wilson’s complaint about students of the
American presidency applies well to leadership-focused studies of
central banks. “Scholars have long insisted in seeing the presidency
in highly personal terms, as an institution built around a single
person whose personality, skills, experiences, ideology, and decision-
making style are the prime determinants of presidential behavior.”
But this does not allow us to “build genuine theories of presidential
behavior.”45

The two criticisms of quality-of-leadership explanations raised in
Chapter 2 are also borne out in the context of Thai history. These con-
cern the endogeneity of strong leadership in two senses. The first issue
is how and why strong central bank leaders are selected. Puey brought
experience in, and contacts with, multinational credit institutions to
the job. These were outstanding aspects of his resumé; he was one of
the only Thais with such a background. His professional record indi-
cated he could be a strong central bank leader. It is hard to imagine that
Puey’s leadership potential was not part of the reason Sarit asked him
to be governor of the Bank of Thailand. Second, Sarit’s support for cen-
tral bank autonomy and for the governor personally facilitated the de-
velopment of Puey’s leadership capabilities. It is also difficult to imag-
ine that the politician-finance ministers of the 1970s, such as Boonchu,
would have tolerated Puey-style leadership tactics.46
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For similar reasons ideology also rings hollow as an explanation for
variation in central bank authority in the Thai context. It begs the ques-
tion of why political leaders chose or tolerated central bank governors
of particular ideological leanings. The answer proposed here is that
when the need for international creditworthiness is great, political
leaders want fiscally conservative central bankers as effective interloc-
utors with investors.



Six

The Politics of Changing Central Bank
Authority: Mexico

AS IN THE discussion of Thailand, the history of central bank politics
in Mexico helps us to evaluate the importance of competing for inter-
national creditworthiness in our search for explanations of changing
central bank authority. Again, the likelihood that the need for credit-
worthiness will lead politicians to increase central bank status changes
with conditions in international financial markets, which alter the an-
ticipated benefits of trying to increase creditworthiness via central
bank independence; with politicians’ tenure security; with objective in-
dications of balance of payments trouble and creditworthiness; and
with the extent of national financial regulation.

There are five turning points in Mexican central bank history: 1934,
1954, 1972, 1983, and 1993. Two, 1934 and 1972, are associated with a
decrease in the need for international creditworthiness and with de-
clining central bank authority. In the 1970s international liquidity and
“loan-pushing” undermined central bank autonomy because they re-
duced the need and value of competing for international capital and
creditworthiness. Mexico, like Thailand, saw a decrease in central bank
authority in the 1970s. The years 1954 and 1983 both mark increases in
the need for external credit that created propitious conditions for an
increase in central bank authority. These periods of increased central
bank authority in Mexico coincide roughly with periods of increase in
Thailand, reflecting similar pressures and opportunities emanating
from international financial markets: a growing opportunity for multi-
lateral and international commercial bank borrowing in the 1950s and
the relative tightening of international credit in the 1980s. In Mexico,
1954 and 1983 were also years of extreme balance of payments diffi-
culty, which fell early in the six-year Mexican presidential cycle. In
these instances, Mexican politicians still had four and five years, re-
spectively, of their government terms ahead of them. The 1993 Mexican
statute change illustrates how growing portfolio investment and global
competition for capital, especially in a context of financial deregulation
and ballooning short-term debt, create incentive for political leaders to
signal their creditworthiness via institutional change. As in Thailand,
Mexican government regulation of domestic and international finan-
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cial flows has been relatively constant, until recently. Prior to the 1990s
variation in the impact of the need for international creditworthiness
on central bank status corresponds more to politicians’ tenure security,
characteristics of international financial markets, and objective indica-
tions of balance of payments and creditworthiness than to change in
financial regulation.

Declining Central Bank Authority in the 1930s

The decline in Mexican central bank authority that took place over the
course of the 1930s reflected the limited effectiveness expected of ef-
forts to increase international creditworthiness. This era in Mexican
central bank history illustrates the principle that no matter how open a
country’s capital account, conditionality, implicit or explicit, does not
work if the promise of new investment is not credible. Mexico has a
long history of relatively unrestricted currency exchange, reinforced in
the 1930s by President Lazaro Cárdenas’s consideration and dismissal
of exchange controls. Objectively speaking, Mexico’s need for interna-
tional investment was also relatively high in the 1930s. Domestic
savings were low and domestic investment needs high. Central bank
reserves were drained by efforts to support the peso’s value in the face
of capital flight and “dollarization” (ratio of dollar to overall demand
deposits in local banks). Yet the value of adopting policies and institu-
tions aimed at building international creditworthiness was severely
discounted all over the world in the 1930s as international investment
and credit dried up. Mexico’s own international debts were large
enough, and the history of negotiations with creditors so long and un-
successful, that hope of renewed access to international credit was re-
mote.1 An exhaustive study of Mexican attitudes toward foreign credi-
tors in the 1920s and 1930s concludes: “By 1932 relations with the
[foreign] bankers were so distant that Mexico decided to give up on
them and direct their attention in the search for more resources to-
wards the oil companies. . . . Then, with external sources exhausted,
Mexico issued 504 thousand pesos in 1933 and 333 thousand pesos in
1934 of internal bonds, although this tactic succeeded only by pressur-
ing several banks into buying them.”2

Political uncertainty and the power of populist appeals in the after-
math of a partially labor- and peasant-based revolution also decreased
the relative importance President Cárdenas accorded international
creditworthiness. Cárdenas came to the presidency in late 1934, facing
an uncertain political environment. It was not clear whether former
president Calles could be forced to cede his behind-the-scenes control
of the Mexican presidency. Cárdenas faced potential threats from
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within the political elite and a growing challenge from society, workers
in particular, in reaction to the policies of Calles. While there had been
virtually no strike activity in Mexico in 1932, there were over two hun-
dred in the year preceding Cárdenas’s inauguration. Cárdenas took on
the monumental job of trying to consolidate his power and that of the
institution of the presidency by weakening the military and building a
new labor- and peasant-supported political party. The latter task, in
particular, mandated government access to central bank financing for
vast, popularly oriented spending programs.

The financial pressures stemming from Cárdenas’s effort to build
labor and peasant support created incentives to make the central bank a
subservient financier of an expensive process of political consolidation.
There was little hope of significant international financing that could
have counterbalanced the incentive to restrict central bank authority.

For most of Mexican central bank history, governor turnover has
followed the six-year presidential cycle. Periods of central bank weak-
ening coincide with presidential terms that saw more than one central
bank governor. During the Cárdenas presidency Eduardo Suárez, a
Cárdenas ally, replaced Gonzalo Robles as central bank governor.
Other important indicators of declining central bank authority during
the Cárdenas regime are also apparent. Over the course of several
years the Banco de México went from being able to obtain a written
agreement from the government on lowering deficit financing to being
forced by the government to cover deficit spending in amounts far be-
yond legal limits.

Cárdenas found expansionary policies necessary to consolidate a
partly peasant- and labor-based political hegemony. An authoritative
central bank interfered with those plans. Gonzalo Robles, named the
first governor of the Banco de México in 1935, resigned after less than
a year, along with a number of other cabinet-level officials opposed to
Cárdenas’s populist state intervention, particularly his agrarian re-
form. One of Cárdenas’s prime concerns in considering a replacement
for Robles was the ability of a central bank governor to be subservient
to the president, through the Ministry of Finance and its head, Eduardo
Suárez. After laying plans for controlling the central bank with Suárez,
Cárdenas appointed Luis Montes de Oca governor of the Banco de
México.3

One of the first tasks Suárez assigned Montes de Oca was revision of
the Banco de México charter.4 Rhetoric aside, the intent of the charter
was debilitating for the central bank; it legalized increased government
borrowing, in part by permitting central bank investment in govern-
ment paper. Previous restrictions on central bank credit provision to
the government were emasculated by explicit exemptions for six types
of government financing operations. Foreign banks and businessmen
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with interests in Mexico expressed concern that the new legislation was
not compatible with inflation control and peso stability. The U.S. em-
bassy in Mexico City reported to the State Department its belief that the
legislation spelled the end of Banco de México’s ability to resist presi-
dential requests for credit.5

The 1936 charter revision is interesting for what it reflects about the
balance of power on the charter-writing subcommittee between those
interested in preserving or increasing central bank authority to pursue
monetary stability and those interested in giving a legal foundation to
Cárdenas’s desire for increased central bank subservience. The history
of implementation of the 1936 amendment is even more revealing. The
charter included a four-month transition period for gradual implemen-
tation that was repeatedly extended by executive decree as the reality
of government desire for central bank finance increasingly conflicted
with even the relatively permissive stipulations of the charter. In effect,
the 1936 amendment was never implemented.

Even before the ink was dry on the new legislation it was clear that
government demands for central bank financing were going to far ex-
ceed what most Banco de México board members felt was healthy.6

During 1937, the Banco de México board of directors became increas-
ingly concerned about deficit financing of the government. A small
subcommittee was appointed to write a report outlining the dangers
inherent in the prevailing situation; this report was presented to
Minister of Finance Suárez along with recommendations for change in
government policy. As a result, the government signed an agreement
stating its intention to limit deficit spending. In the face of political
pressures motivating large government spending Cárdenas essentially
ignored the limitations in this agreement, as he had ignored the limita-
tions included in the 1936 charter.7 A second report requesting deficit-
reducing efforts was sent by the Banco de México board to the presi-
dent in 1938. It too was ignored.8 In 1938 the 1936 central bank law was
retroactively revised, bringing the central bank’s legal authority into
line with the political and financial reality of the Cárdenas administra-
tion. One of its most important changes made the Minister of Finance
head of the central bank board of directors.

Seeking International Loans and Strengthening
the Central Bank in the 1950s

The second major change in Banco de México history came in the 1950s,
as central bank authority rose under the governorship of Rodrigo
Gómez. Although governor turnover is not necessarily a reliable mea-
sure of central bank autonomy, in Mexico periods of increased central
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bank authority coincide with the two instances in which a central bank
governor remained in his post for more than one presidential term
(sexenio). Rodrigo Gómez remained central bank governor through the
three sexenios comprising the presidencies of Adolfo Ruiz Cortines,
Adolfo López Mateos, and Gustavo Diaz Ordaz. Depletion of the
foreign exchange reserves Mexico had built up during World War II
and the rise of international development lending created pressures
and opportunities supporting the growing authority of the central
bank under Gómez. Although Mexican political leaders of the 1950s
faced several political challenges, the six-year pattern of regular presi-
dential succession and the political hegemony of the ruling party, PRI,
was well institutionalized compared with the 1930s.9 The tenure secu-
rity of political elites and their technocrats was long, and the costs of
nationalist, populist economic policies seemed high, given the balance
of payments problems and the unfavorable international interest rates
Mexico faced (evident in Table 6.1), an exceptionally open capital ac-
count relative to other developing countries, and the opportunity to
obtain significant loans from the World Bank.

Objective indications of a growing need for international credit and
creditworthiness are evident in data for the early 1950s. Balance of
payments trouble had been building since the late 1940s. In 1947, as
Table 6.1 indicates, reserves covered less than 0.5 (months’ worth of
imports). Coverage reached 2, still low in comparative terms, and fell to
under 1 again in 1951. Similar trends are reflected in the reserves data.
Reserves fell 26 percent in 1951, recovering in the following year only
to fall again in 1953.

The 1954 devaluation is an important part of the context of this sec-
ond shift in Mexican central bank authority. It highlights both the na-
ture of Mexican economic policymaking and the role of international
financiers’ influence.10 The devaluation negotiations established a di-
rect relationship between the central bank governor and the minister of
finance, on the one hand, and the IMF, on the other, with no presiden-
tial intermediation. The finance ministers of this era and the governor
of the central bank consciously used presidential interest in securing
new international credit for Mexico, and their own relationships with
international creditors, to strengthen institutional authority.

Speaking for financial technocrats in general, Antonio Ortiz Mena
notes that “we go to the IMF to make us do what we know we have to
do. . . . this helps us control public opinion.”11 In the 1950s and 1960s,
the efforts of Gómez and Ortiz Mena brought the settlement of Mex-
ico’s old debts, sale of Mexican government paper to foreign govern-
ments, and new bilateral and multilateral credits. The search for these
new sources of external finance “imposed very strong discipline” and
greatly strengthened the authority of the central bank and the finance
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TABLE 6.1
Indicators of Mexico’s Need to Compete for International Capital

Average Annual Interest
on Private Credit Minus

Foreign Exchange the Eurodollar or Libor
Interest RateaReserves (U.S. millions)Import CoverageYear

521.801945
430.911946
260.451947
360.951948
742.021949
891.921950
660.961951

1151.701952
691.021953

1472.471954
2763.741955
3223.601956
2732.841957
2252.391958
2713.231959
2612.641960
3013.171961
2883.021962
3643.521963
3733.001964
3252.501965
3692.761966
3252.231967
3592.201968
3812.201969

0.43851.881970
1.25502.741971
1.47313.231972
0.68882.791973

−0.69601.901974
2.21,1682.131975
1.41,1872.361976
2.21,5923.481977
1.71,7862.641978
0.21,8711.861979
1.82,6881.661980
0.33,7091.851981
1.38280.661982
1.53,7955.681983
0.57,2697.401984
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TABLE 6.1 (cont.)

Average Annual Interest
on Private Credit Minus
the Eurodollar or LiborForeign Exchange

Reserves (U.S. millions)Import CoverageYear Interest Ratea

1985 4.21 4,906 0.7
1986 5.66 5,667 2.2
1987 11.08 11,758 0.2
1988 2.99 4,885 0.8
1989 2.92 5,946 0.5

0.81990 6.64 9,446
2.9N.A.N.A.1991
3.2N.A.N.A.1992

N.A.N.A.N.A.1993

Source: Calculated from IMF, International Financial Statistics (Washington, D.C.:
IMF, various years), and World Bank, World Debt Tables (Washington, D.C.: World Bank,
various years).

Note: The World Debt Tables changed the definition of the numerator in 1980. N.A.–Not
available.

a. Libor–London interbank offer rate.

ministry to define how to make Mexico attractive to international cred-
itors. It should be pointed out, says Ortiz Mena, that the “international
banks worked with us because they liked what we were doing . . . if we
did it any other way the doors would close.”12 The most difficult chal-
lenge, he reports, was to maintain the authority to control spending
when international reserves were in excess.

In addition to strengthening direct ties between the central bank and
international creditors, the 1954 devaluation also set an important prec-
edent for central bank and Finance Ministry authority over the presi-
dent. The devaluation was worked out by Minister of Finance Antonio
Carillo Flores and central bank governor Rodrigo Gómez with the IMF.
It was announced as a virtual fait accompli to President Ruiz Cortines.13

In historical perspective this constitutes a highly unusual departure
from the traditions of the Mexican presidency. The precedent the presi-
dent set by accepting the central bank and Ministry of Finance lead on
this issue significantly strengthened the central bank–finance ministry
role in economic decision making thereafter.

Rodrigo Gómez was appointed head of the Banco de México by
newly elected president Ruiz Cortines in 1954 on the recommendation
of his mentor, Finance Minister Carillo Flores. Rodrigo Gómez re-
mained as central bank governor until his death at the end of the Díaz
Ordaz administration in 1970. During his long tenure, Mexico experi-
enced a remarkable period of low inflation and high growth known as
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the era of “stabilizing development.” Relations between the central
bank and the Ministry of Finance were exceptionally close, both under
Finance Minister Carillo Flores and his successor, Antonio Ortiz Mena.
One sign of the authority of the Banco de México under Gómez is the
bank’s success in divorcing itself from responsibility for the operations
of the agricultural development banks established by Cárdenas. The
U.S. embassy in Mexico City reported that “the President was per-
suaded by the Bank of Mexico . . . that [it] should cease serving as a
virtually inexhaustible source of funds for the credit operations of the
agricultural banks.”14

When Ortiz Mena became chief economics adviser to the campaign
of López Mateos in 1957, he discussed the evils of popular sentiment in
favor of government control of the central bank with the president-
elect.15 “The central bank should serve as our conscience, to tell us
when we go astray,” Ortiz Mena argued.16 In keeping with this belief,
when López Mateos appointed Ortiz Mena finance minister in 1958, he
became the first Mexican finance minister to refuse to take on the chair-
manship of the central bank board.

Jointly, the head of the central bank, Gómez, and Minister of Finance
Ortiz Mena exercised a virtual monopoly on major macroeconomic
policy decisions. Price stability was their main goal and, although the
central bank had no legal role in the budget process and there were
no legal limits on government borrowing from the central bank, they
successfully dictated the limits on government programs and policies
necessary to protect that goal.17 They also managed to obtain a change
in charter stipulations regarding governor appointment procedures.
Although central bank law changed, in reality the president continued
to control selection of the central bank governor.

International Liquidity and Central Bank Denouement

A tremendous influx of oil export proceeds and foreign loans in the
1970s, combined with a left-wing challenge to the PRI’s legitimacy,
coincided to bring an end to the halcyon days of Mexican central
bank authority in the 1950s and 1960s. In 1970, as Table 6.2 shows,
Mexico contracted foreign loans at double the rate of 1969; borrowing
held steady for a few years only to double again in 1972, after which
it expanded steadily until 1982. Mexican debt relative to exports of
goods and services outstripped that of most other middle-income
developing country borrowers. Was this a sign of rising or falling need
for international creditworthiness? As Tables 6.1, 7.1, and 8.1 indicate,
Mexico borrowed in 1971 at rates comparable to those of Korea, lower
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TABLE 6.2
Foreign Investment in Mexico (stock of investments, in U.S. millions)

Bonds
Equities Loans(Disbursements)FDIYear

631051954
561121955

1071181956
1651321957
2431001958
224811959
363(38)1960
3521201961
4011271962
4261181963
7551021964
3702141965
1281831966
2951301967
2082271968
4182971969
8933231970
9283061971
9861152771972

1,8811263831973
2,562105641974
3,9401785021975
4,4431665441976

1,146 4,3631,0494761977
603 6,6456486621978

(306) 8,759N.A.1,0331979
(57) 9,2782361,6781980
845 12,095N.A.2,1551981
844 13,353N.A.1,4891982

(583) 8,236N.A.4251983
(610) 4,937N.A.3821984
(984) 14,177434911985
(816) 12,02901,5231986
(397) 8,54203,2461987

1,676 5,93402,5941988
438 3,65303,0371989

5,359 12,0829752,6371990
9,267 13,1881,1224,7621991

14,095 12,7171,1575,3661992

Source: IMF, International Financial Statistics (Washington, D.C.: IMF, various
years). For bonds (disbursements), see World Bank, World Debt Tables (Wash-
ington, D.C.: World Bank, various years), disbursement tables.

Note: FDI–Foreign direct investment; N.A.–Not available.
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than those of Brazil. Import coverage fell, but foreign reserves did not
contract during the period (see Table 6.1). In fact, in 1971 Mexico’s
international reserves grew faster than they had in all but two of the
previous twenty-one years. In sum, in Mexico, as in other countries,
the growth of the Euromarket in the late 1960s pushed the supply of
international financial resources far beyond demand. Easy money in-
ternationally undermined an important rationale for central bank inde-
pendence. For Mexico, in addition, the promise of oil helped preserve
its reputation as a good credit risk internationally despite high debt-to-
export ratios.

Mexican political leaders had little reason to be concerned with the
impact of their nation’s economic policy processes and outcomes on
international financiers, because oil guaranteed easy access to interna-
tional loans. President Luis Echeverría was free to be consumed with
meeting the leftist challenge to his party’s semi-authoritarian monop-
oly on political representation. (Table 6.3 lists Mexican presidents, re-
gime type, and central bank governors by years of tenure.) Concern
with growing income inequality and the authoritarian side of PRI gov-
ernance led to student demonstrations during the 1968 Olympic games
in Mexico City. These demonstrations were violently suppressed by
the government, creating further discontent with the ruling party.
Early in Echeverría’s term his role in overseeing the police action
against students and workers in 1968 became public knowledge. To
general partywide concerns about legitimacy in the aftermath of the
1968 events was added Echeverría’s own personal drive to improve his
popularity. In 1971, a deeper than anticipated recession scared the
president into a major policy shift designed to buy back popular sup-
port for himself and his party. Echeverría announced that Mexico
would move from stabilizing development to “shared development.”
In the absence of counterpressures from international financial circum-
stances, pressure from the left gave Echeverría incentive to pursue pol-
icies requiring deficit financing by the central bank.

Central bank president Ernesto Fernández Hurtado and Finance
Minister Hugo Margáin did everything possible to convince Echeverría
to scale back his plans to use public spending to stimulate growth.
When Margáin protested to Echeverría that certain spending could not
be authorized because reserves were insufficient, he was summarily
dismissed. Echeverría declared that “economic policy is made at Los
Pinos” (the presidential mansion) and turned the office of the presi-
dency into a shadow economic cabinet which persistently fought other
economic policymaking institutions. Fernández Hurtado, director of
the Banco de México at the time, found his institution’s policy prefer-
ences subordinated to the president’s spending plans.
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TABLE 6.3
Change of Government, Regime Type, and Central Bank Governor in Mexico

President Regime Banco de México Governor

Lazaro Cárdenas (1934–40) ONE-PARTY Gonzalo Robles (1935)
DEMOCRACY

Luis Montes de Oca (1935–40)
Manual Avila Camacho (1940–46) Eduardo Villaseñor (1940–46)
Miguel Aleman (1946–52) Carlos Novoa (1946–52)
Adolfo Ruiz Cortines (1952–58) Rodrigo Gómez (1952–70)
Adolfo López Mateos (1958–64)
Gustavo Díaz Ordaz (1964–70)
Luis Echeverría Alvarez (1970–76) Ernesto Fernández Hurtado (1970–76)
Jose López Portillo (1976–82) Gustavo Romero Kolbeck (1976–82)

Miguel Mancera (1982)
Carlos Tello (1982)

Miguel de la Madrid (1982–88) Miguel Mancera (1983–)
Carlos Salinas (1988–1994)
Ernesto Zedillo (1994–2000)

Echeverría wanted to fire Fernández Hurtado for his opposition to
government economic policy, as he had Margáin. Margáin’s replace-
ment in the Ministry of Finance, José López Portillo, argued forcefully
that Echeverría should keep the central bank director to avoid the
destabilizing impact his resignation would have on an already un-
stable economic environment. Although he wanted to leave the gover-
norship, Fernández Hurtado was asked to remain in the position.
Fernández Hurtado’s successor in the following sexenio, Gustavo Ro-
mero Kolbeck, concluded, “None of us had the pants to resign when
we should have.”18

From 1973 to 1976 central bank governor Fernández Hurtado’s pol-
icy advice was repeatedly dismissed. “Those years were terribly hard,”
he recalls; “I had to go in front of the press after my positions were
rejected and say that the policies were good and wouldn’t add to infla-
tion or lead to devaluation, when I knew that wasn’t true. I had to do
this in order to try to preserve public confidence in the central bank.”19

López Portillo’s fear of the impact of the resignation of a central bank
governor on economic stability lessened as he succeeded Echeverría
in the presidency. There was considerable hubris in López Portillo’s
attitude, perhaps stemming in part from Mexico’s foreign exchange
bonanza. López Portillo’s conflicts with central bank governor Romero
Kolbeck were bitter, particularly over the issue of devaluation. “I
was a victim of the Banco de México’s dependence on the executive,”
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states Romero. López Portillo refused to even contemplate devalua-
tion. After several meetings in which Romero argued the necessity of
the move, López Portillo told him he wasn’t going to meet with him
again. “Don’t even ask for an appointment with me,” the president
reportedly said. “I won’t grant it. I am not going to leave office as a
‘devalued’ president.”20 Yet contact was necessary if López Portillo was
to personally oversee Banco de México policy implementation. He in-
structed the central bank governor daily on what to do with the ex-
change rate. One day he called for an appreciation, over Romero’s
strong protest.21 But with the country awash in foreign exchange, there
seemed little need to heed central bank advice. This incident resulted in
Romero’s resignation.

Miguel Mancera replaced Romero Kolbeck at the central bank, only
to find that the president had plans for bank nationalization and ex-
change controls. Rather than try to fight a losing battle with the presi-
dent behind the scenes, Mancera chose a more public strategy. He
wrote, published, and distributed a treatise against exchange controls.
When López Portillo went ahead with his plans anyway, he replaced
Mancera with Carlos Tello, an ideologically unorthodox economist
who was one of the architects of bank nationalization and the concom-
itant exchange controls. The nationalization in September 1982 marked
the culmination of the second major period of declining central bank
authority in Mexico.

Competing for Creditworthiness: Rebuilding
Central Bank Authority

The September 1982 measures also marked the end of Mexico’s foreign
exchange bonanza. After this, the urgent need for foreign exchange and
international creditworthiness became the primary criterion against
which government decisions were judged. Foreign exchange reserves
contracted more in 1982 than they ever had in post–World War II Mex-
ico. Table 6.1 also shows that foreign exchange reserves fell to 0.66 of a
months’ import cost, a level close to the postwar low of 0.45 in 1947. In
the context of contraction in global financial markets, even projected oil
wealth could not prevent high debt-to-export ratios from taking their
toll on Mexican creditworthiness. Tables 5.1, 6.1, 7.1, and 8.1 show that
the average interest rate for private credits to Mexico in 1982 was 1.3
percent over the London interbank offer rate (Libor) while it was, −2.8
percent relative to Libor for Thailand and −0.7 and −2.1 percent for
Brazil and South Korea, respectively.
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The nationalization measure engendered extreme business opposi-
tion and drove several prominent businessmen into the arms of the
PRI’s prime competitor party, the PAN. In addition to Mexico’s urgent
need for international creditworthiness, the partisan nature of this
challenge to Mexico’s political leadership prompted measures to cir-
cumscribe government and lessen the future possibility of such an
unexpected and seemingly arbitrary exercise of government power.
The year 1983 marked the beginning of a steady increase in Mexican
central bank authority that culminated in a charter change promul-
gated ten years later, in 1993. Miguel de la Madrid reappointed Miguel
Mancera as central bank governor in 1983, and like Rodrigo Gómez in
the 1950s and 1960s, Mancera’s tenure as central bank governor
spanned three sexenios.

Salinas continued the de facto policy of support for central bank in-
dependence and authority as part of a multifaceted effort to increase
foreign financial inflows, even though by some objective measures
the need for international creditworthiness was declining. Import
coverage reached unprecedented highs for Mexico in 1987 (eleven
months), but short-term debt was creeping back up from its 1985
low and the country still faced relatively high international loan rates,
especially compared with those of Asian middle-income countries
(compare Tables 5.1, 6.1, 7.1, and 8.1). While growth of new foreign
direct investment in Mexico was uneven, foreign equity and bond
investment began to boom during Carlos Salinas’s administration
(Table 6.2).

The Salinas administration also saw the first substantial change in
Mexican financial regulation in decades, induced in part by the North
American Free Trade Agreement financial sector negotiations. The
NAFTA-related reforms included substantial deregulation of the do-
mestic financial market, reprivatization of the banks that had been na-
tionalized in the wake of the crisis, and the opening of the financial
sector to foreign competition.22 U.S. banks had long sought freer access
to the Mexican market, and the negotiation of the North American Free
Trade Agreement provided them an entry point. Despite the strong
external pressure and the Salinas administration’s interest in seeing
the NAFTA succeed, the newly privatized banks were able to win a
gradual phase-in of the entry provisions and certain market-share
restrictions. However, the financial crisis of 1994–95 resulted in an ac-
celeration of the NAFTA liberalization timetable.23

Given financial deregulation, the dramatic rise in bond investments,
and rapidly growing short-term debt, signaling government commit-
ment to investor-friendly policies became increasingly important to
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Mexican political leaders, who were almost single-mindedly concerned
with foreign capital inflow. When it looked as though the cornerstone
of Salinas’s effort to attract foreign capital, the North American Free
Trade Agreement, might fail due to U.S. congressional opposition,
Salinas pushed through a statutory increase in central bank authority
as a partial substitute. Salinas saw both measures as ways to signal
the PRI’s future commitment to policies favorable to foreign capital,
even after he left the presidency. Salinas’s term was ending, and he
was ineligible for reelection. Political manipulation of the central bank
could thus not have helped extend Salinas’s own term of office. Salinas
sought instead to make an institutional change that would help future
governments, likely to be PRI-dominated, compete for international
creditworthiness.24

The proposed central bank statute changes passed the Mexican legis-
lature easily.25 Representatives of the small Mexican political parties
of the left objected to the proposal on the grounds that it would reduce
the likelihood of economic policies favorable to the poor. Other observ-
ers saw the increase in central bank independence as a positive move
in the process of political liberalization, contributing to reductions in
the power of the presidency.26

The new statute made three changes. It stipulated securing the stabil-
ity of the peso’s purchasing power as the central bank’s primary goal.
The new legislation also prohibited the extension of central bank credit
to the government. Finally, the statute provided for terms and condi-
tions of appointment for the central bank governor and board “that
would be conducive to exercising autonomy.” The statute provides for
recall of these personnel only on grounds of “falta grave” (grave fault).
This is actually a weaker provision than those in many other recently
changed central bank statutes, where recall can only occur on the basis
of judicial sentencing or extended incapacitation.

The 1994 peso crisis illustrates the limited impact of increased legal
independence.27 Salinas succumbed to political pressures to expand
economic activity prior to the August 1994 elections. On top of growing
overvaluation, off the books lending through para-state organizations
such as Nafinsa heightened the need for the central bank to tighten
monetary policy throughout 1994. Yet two factors prevented Mancera
from accomplishing this tightening; they signal the continued weak-
ness of the Mexican central bank despite the 1993 charter change. First,
tightening would have contravened the wishes of leading PRI officials
and Salinas associates. Second, the weakness of the private banking
system precluded monetary tightening that would have dangerously
increased the banks’ liquidity problems.
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Conclusion

The history of the politics of Mexican central banking highlights the
complexity of international financial influence as it relates to political
leaders’ prioritization of their need to compete for international credit-
worthiness. The nature of predominant forms of international invest-
ment and the global relationship between supply and demand for in-
ternational investment are important determinants of the extent to
which objective balance of payments considerations translate into a
perceived need for creditworthiness and a decision to try to improve
creditworthiness via central bank independence. In the 1930s interna-
tional financial market conditions heavily foreclosed the possibility
that international lenders might have leverage over debtor countries.
This coincided in Mexico with domestic political conditions that made
a nationalist, populist economic strategy appealing to political leaders
trying to consolidate their hold on government. Similarly, in the 1970s,
permissive international financial conditions significantly lowered the
costs to political leaders of responding to leftist pressure with policies
that would, under other international financial market conditions, have
lowered international creditworthiness. The rise in international port-
folio investment in Mexico, growing short-term debt, and financial de-
regulation made Salinas’s move to increase central bank independence
in 1993 predictable.

As in the Thai context, problems arise with alternative arguments
about longitudinal variation in central bank authority that are based on
legal stipulations, leadership qualities, or ideology. Mexican central
bank history strongly suggests that legal change follows from increase
in central bank authority, with a considerable lag. The increases of the
1950s and the 1980s both led in the following decades to changes in
the Banco de México statute. Specifically, the 1962 statute change made
the governor an appointee of the central bank board rather than of the
executive branch. It also changed the legal delineation of the central
bank’s role in the monetary policy process. The original statute had no
provision for a central bank role in policy formulation; the altered
statue provided for the government to seek central bank advice before
undertaking monetary policy decisions. But once again, Mexican cen-
tral bank history suggests that legal stipulations do not prevent decline
in central bank authority.

Mexican central bank history also illustrates the ways in which cen-
tral bank leadership capabilities are shaped by presidential prefer-
ences. Regardless of whether Ruiz Cortines knew that Rodrigo Gómez
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would be a strong leader when he chose him, Ruiz Cortines’s own
weaknesses in economic knowledge and his virtual delegation of eco-
nomic policymaking to the central bank and Ministry of Finance al-
lowed both Rodrigo Gómez and Antonio Ortiz Mena to become strong
leaders. The tenure of Miguel Mancera also illustrates the problems in
the leadership quality argument vis-à-vis central bank authority. All
the central bank leadership capability in the world could not have kept
López Portillo from nationalizing the banks and imposing exchange
controls.

In general, differentiating between market force explanations and
those based on ideology is difficult. Worse still, in this book emphasis
is on politicians’ perceptions of market dictates. While Mexican central
bank history demonstrates that the president’s preferences constrain
the central bank governor, it is harder to distinguish between the role
of ideology and markets in shaping the president’s preference forma-
tion. The cost and benefit of economic strategies associated with differ-
ent ideologies varies with market pressures. In a time of global depres-
sion, such as the 1930s, internationalist economic policy has little
pay-off and nationalist policy conversely little cost. In the 1930s in
Mexico Cárdenas could pursue the economic implications of his na-
tional populist ideology at relatively little cost. Similar interaction be-
tween ideology and market conditions is evident in Mexico in the
1970s. Echeverría did not begin his administration with clear populist
economic policy preferences, but the prospects of oil windfall and loan
bonanza helped push him in that direction, with obivous consequences
for central bank independence. Mexican central bank history lends cre-
dence to the intuition that, in the last instance, markets shape ideology
more than ideology shapes markets.



Seven

The Politics of Changing Central Bank
Authority: South Korea

THE HISTORY of central banking in Korea is another case that aids our
exploration of the extent to which variation in the need for interna-
tional creditworthiness corresponds to change in central bank indepen-
dence. Several factors stand out in evaluating Korea’s need for inter-
national capital and creditworthiness since World War II. First, as is
evident in Table 7.2, trends in foreign borrowing in the 1950s are differ-
ent from those in the other three countries examined. Foreign borrow-
ing rises fairly steeply beginning in 1954 in Mexico and Brazil and in
1956 in Thailand; in constrast, foreign borrowing falls off in Korea in
1954 from comparatively high levels in 1952–53. This shift reflects U.S.
and allied loans to Korea during the Korean War. The relatively sharp
decline in foreign lending between 1953 and 1955, a time when lending
to other developing countries was rising, coincides with the beginning
of serious encroachment on central bank autonomy. The largely geo-
political determinants of capital inflow led the Korean leadership to
discount the role of economic policy in attracting capital, even though
the need to compete for international capital was objectively high by
some indicators (see Table 7.1).

Foreign borrowing was modest in the 1970s compared with that in
Latin America. Even as Korea’s relative favor with international cred-
itors fell slightly in 1971–72 (as measured by interest rates shown in
Tables 5.1, 6.1, 7.1, and 8.1) and Korea experienced several years of
decline in foreign exchange and import coverage, the strength of
Korean exports, the ease of foreign borrowing, and Korea’s extensive
capital controls limited political elites’ perceptions of the need to
compete for international capital. Korea also weathered the debt crisis
well. As Table 7.1 indicates, debt-to-export ratios remained modest,
especially by Latin American standards. Through the late 1980s objec-
tive indicators of the need to compete for international capital re-
mained low. Import coverage was scant, but so was the country’s
international debt. Korea enjoyed extremely favorable interest rates on
international loans. In accord with leaders’ low prioritization of the
need to compete for capital internationally, Korea’s failure to increase
central bank authority is notable throughout the 1970s and 1980s. In
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TABLE 7.1
Indicators of South Korea’s Need to Compete for International Capital

Average Annual Interest
on Private Credit Minus

Foreign Exchange the Eurodollar or Libor
Interest RateaReserves (U.S. millions)Import CoverageYear

371951
811952

1073.731953
1065.201954
953.331955
973.021956

1143.101957
1454.601958
1465.741959
1555.411960
2057.791961
1674.741962
1302.781963
1293.831964
1383.581965
2363.951966
3474.181967
3883.181968
5503.621969

−1.85843.531970
1.24012.011971
2.14812.291972
0.28292.351973

−1.82760.481974
1.47771.281975
2.71,9622.681976
2.32,9553.281977
1.02,7362.191978

−0.62,9101.721979
−0.32,9121.571980
−2.52,6191.201981
−2.12,7441.361982

0.02,2301.021983
−0.92,7231.071984
−0.52,8291.091985

0.33,3011.251986
0.03,5661.041987
0.62.86 12,3401988

−0.814,9782.931989



C E N T R A L B A N K A U T H O R I T Y: K O R E A 109

TABLE 7.1 (cont.)

Average Annual Interest
on Private Credit Minus
the Eurodollar or LiborForeign Exchange

Year Import Coverage Reserves (U.S. millions) Interest Ratea

1990 2.49 14,459 0.4
1991 N.A. N.A. 1.4
1992 N.A. N.A. 2.9

Source: Calculated from IMF, International Financial Statistics (Washington, D.C.: IMF
various years), and World Bank, World Debt Tables (Washington, D.C.: World Bank, vari-
ous years).

Note: The World Debt Tables changed the definition of the numerator in 1980. N.A.–Not
available.

a. Libor–London interbank offer rate.

1987–88 there was an unsuccessful movement to provide a statutory
basis for increased Bank of Korea independence. Financial regulation
remained consistently great from the 1950s through the early 1990s.1

Throughout the period studied here this high level of government fi-
nancial regulation mitigated the impact any need for creditworthiness
might have had on central bank status.

Eroding Central Bank Authority, 1956–1962

The contemporary Korean central bank is based on legislation drafted
by two advisers from the Federal Reserve Bank of New York. Officials
of Korea’s Chosen Bank, which had been the state bank in the era of
Japanese colonialism, circulated a draft central bank law to the Na-
tional Assembly and various government ministries in 1948. The Min-
istry of Finance drafted an alternative bill in early 1949 that included
much less autonomy for the proposed central bank. The government
then decided to invite foreign experts to write the legislation. Arthur I.
Bloomfield and John P. Jensen wrote a charter for the new Bank of
Korea stipulating independence and the primary goal of maintaining
price stability, proposals fairly far from the Ministry of Finance’s ideal.2

The charter was modified slightly, but not significantly, by the legisla-
ture. The main debate was over the constitutionality of the Bank of
Korea legislation; the Korean constitution reserved responsibility for
monetary, financial, and foreign exchange policy for the government,
that is, the Ministry of Finance.3

The ink was hardly dry on this legislation when finance-hungry Ko-
rean government politicians began to abrogate the law, firing central
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TABLE 7.2
Foreign Investment in South Korea (stock of investments, in U.S. millions)

Equities LoansBondsFDIYear

70.31952
85.81953
30.01954
8.51955

12.91956
20.21957

N.A.1958
(13.0)1959
(9.8)1960
(0.7)1961
(3.3)0.61962
77.84.81963
17.2(0.8)1964
18.20.31965

185.013.01966
264.011.01967
392.01.01968
518.0(3.0)1969
617.066.01970
651.042.01971
601.059.01972
598.0117.01973
777.099.01974

1,172.047.01975
1,523.070.01976
1,652.060.080.01977
2,382.034.071.01978
3,038.06.028.01979
2,568.031.06.01980

39.0 3,603.014.086.01981
N.A. 3,216.013.062.01982
N.A. 3,391.0176.065.01983
21.0 3,514.0309.0109.01984

121.0 3,611.0861.0234.01985
39.0 2,901.0262.0435.01986
38.0 2,836.0(151.0)601.01987
29.0 1,796.0(511.0)871.01988
30.0 1,263.0(59.0)758.01989

380.0 940.0431.0715.01990
N.A. 2,033.03,116.01,160.01991

2,328.0 966.03,414.0550.01992

Source: IMF, International Financial Statistics (Washington, D.C.: IMF, various
years).

Note: FDI–Foreign direct investment. N.A.–Not available.
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bank presidents who did not provide them money on demand. The
prime motivation for the government’s encroachment on central bank
authority beginning in 1956 was the need to raise campaign financing
to compete successfully with an ever-growing political opposition. Per-
haps the single most important indication of the uncertainty President
Syngman Rhee faced is the fact that his own party’s vice-presidential
candidate lost in the 1956 elections, and Rhee was forced to govern
with an opposition party vice-president from 1956 to 1960.4

In the minds of Korea’s political leaders at this time, the demands of
securing power outweighed any concern with the reaction of interna-
tional financiers to particular changes in economic policy or economic
policymaking institutions. The influence of international financiers was
limited for objective reasons as well. Patterns in foreign lending were
closely tied to geopolitical concerns. Initially this meant that foreign
loans and aid were abundant. Korea’s political leadership took the U.S.
loan and aid program for granted and made the correct assumption
that Korea’s security importance to the United States would outweigh
any disgruntlement with Korean economic policies. The United States
did monitor efforts to amend the original central bank charter and
saw them as dangerous to Korea’s future economic health.5 Diplomatic
suggestions were made to the Korean government, but no specific
pressure was ever exercised with regard to central bank authority.

When U.S. loans and aid declined (see Table 7.2), it was clearly be-
cause the United States considered South Korea relatively secure
against Communism. Because lending rose and fell in response to U.S.
security concerns, over which the Koreans had little control, Korea still
had little incentive to seek creditworthiness. The Korean political lead-
ership’s largely correct perception of the delinkage between interna-
tional financing and domestic economic policy in the late 1950s and
early 1960s was a condition that helped encourage the wanton disre-
gard for legally stipulated central bank independence. Other indicators
of the objective need to prioritize competition for international invest-
ment also suggest permissive conditions. As Table 7.1 shows, import
coverage was high (by Korean standards) and growing from 1956
through 1961.

Although the political leadership changed between 1956 and 1962,
the governments of this period shared a strong opposition to central
bank independence that is clearly reflected in governor turnover rates.
In this period there were six different Bank of Korea governors (see
Table 7.3). The Liberal Party government, in particular, sought to use
the central bank in efforts to raise campaign financing. Direct requests
to the Bank of Korea to aid the Liberal Party in its fund-raising efforts
were a prime source of conflict between the government and the cen-
tral bank at this time.
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TABLE 7.3
Change of Government, Regime Type, and Central Bank Governor in South Korea

Bank of Korea GovernorPresident Regime

Rhee Syngman (1948–60) SEMI-DEM. Ku Yµng-Sµ (1950–51)
Kim Yu-Taek (1951–56)
Kim Chin-Hyµng (1956–60)

Chang Myon (1960–61) Bae ∂i-Hwan (1960)
Chu Ye-Yµng (1960–61)

Park Chung Hee (1963–79) MILITARY Yu Ch’ang-Sun (1961–62)
Min Pyµng-To (1962–63)
Lee Chµng-Hwan (1963)
Kim Se-Ryµn (1963–67)
Sµ Chin-Su (1967–70)
Kim Sµng-Hwan (1970–78)
Shin Pyµng-Hyµn (1978–80)

Choi Kyu-Ha (1979–80) Kim Chun-Sông (1980–82)
Ha Yµng-Ki (1982–83)
Choi Ch’ang-Rak (1983–86)
Park Sµng-Sang (1986–88)

Roh Tae Woo (1988–93) SEMI-DEM. Kim Kµn (1988–92)
Cho Sun (1992–93)

Kim Young Sam (1993–) Kim Myµng-Ho (1993–96)
Lee Kyung-Shik (1996)

The second governor of the Bank of Korea, Kim Yu-Taek, both re-
fused to provide loans to the Liberal Party and rebuffed the “invita-
tion” to become a member of the party’s central committee.6 In order to
increase its control over the bank, the Liberal Party leadership, through
the Ministry of Finance, proposed amending the central bank charter to
give the minister of finance veto power over decisions of the Monetary
Board. (The Monetary Board’s relationship to the Bank of Korea was
intended to be like that of the Federal Reserve Board to the Federal
Reserve banks.) Kim Yu-Taek called one of the authors of the original
statute, Bloomfield, to Korea to investigate and report in defense of the
bank’s independence as originally stipulated. This report was not
made public, but was circulated within the government, angering
many cabinet and party officials. When this tactic failed to deter gov-
ernment politicians, Kim broke with protocol and issued a public de-
nunciation of the minister of finance. The government’s State Council
voted to force Kim to resign.

The bank’s fourth governor, Bae ∂i-Hwan, also clashed with the
government over Liberal Party financing and proposals to change the
central bank statute.7 Bae was extremely critical of what he saw as pres-
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ident Syngman Rhee’s use of the Bank of Korea as his “personal cash
register.”8 He also strenuously opposed government proposals to
change the central bank charter, arguing that the Bank of Korea needed
more, not less, statutory independence. His swan song was a newspa-
per article alluding to corrupt campaign financing practices involving
the banking system and suggesting that the Monetary Board was irre-
sponsible in hesitating to admit its knowledge of the corruption. Bae
went on to argue that this type of corruption could only be avoided if
the Bank of Korea were allowed genuine political independence. He
was forced to resign shortly thereafter.

This scenario of conflict between the central bank director and the
government was repeated a third time during the governorship of Yu
Ch’ang-Sun. In this case the Liberal Party had raised funds through
manipulation of the stock market, which led to a minor financial crisis
known as the “Padong stock market scandal.”9 Yu managed to con-
vince the Monetary Board to refuse government requests that the cen-
tral bank continue providing funds to help cover up the manipulation
and calm financial markets. Shortly thereafter, in December 1961, the
Ministry of Finance presented a central bank charter amendment to
the cabinet for approval. Governor Yu had not been consulted about
the amendment; he resigned in protest.

The governorship of Min Pyµng-To was also curtailed by conflict
with the government, which included a proposal to remove bank su-
pervisory authority from the central bank,10 the sudden end of central
bank authority over foreign exchange policy, and the contract of a for-
eign loan concluded by the government without consultation of the
central bank.11

Although, de facto, the Bank of Korea never exercised the full au-
thority granted it under its original charter, the amendment promul-
gated May 24, 1962, formalized the central bank’s political weakness.
Under this amendment the minister of finance was given veto power
over all Monetary Board decisions. The minister of finance was
also given authority to oversee the Bank of Korea’s bookkeeping. The
Bank Supervisory Office of the Bank of Korea was turned into a
separate entity placed under direct Monetary Board jurisdiction. The
policy scope of the Monetary Board was also reduced from covering
both exchange and credit policy to simply covering credit policy.
This left a central bank that over the next several decades did little
more than implement credit policies in line with policies designed
by the Economic Planning Board and the Ministry of Finance. In
fact, the bank was commonly called the “Namdaemun branch of
the Finance Ministry,” referring to the Seoul district in which the
bank is located.
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The Central Bank Remains Weak

Over the two decades following the 1962 charter revision there was
little change in the Bank of Korea’s authority.12 Political stability ceased
to be a problem during the Park regime, the need for international
creditworthiness remained low, and capital account regulations im-
plied a consistently low level of openness, creating little incentive for
change in central bank authority. Korea suffered oscillation in inter-
national reserves and some change in the relative interest margin to
London interbank rates. But the growth in the supply of international
financial resources compared with demand, strong government regu-
lation of financial transactions, Korea’s relatively low levels of indebt-
edness and successful transition to export-led growth, especially com-
pared to that of many Latin American countries, combined to keep
politicians’ perceptions of the need for international creditworthiness
low. Even though Korea suffered economic troubles concomitant with
the oil price hikes of the 1970s, a variety of factors vitiated the need for
political leaders to be concerned with making domestic institutional
changes in order to secure international creditworthiness.13

In accord with this low concern for international creditworthiness,
the history of central bank politics in the two decades after 1962 reveals
only minor instances of further challenge to Bank of Korea authority,
counterbalanced by sporadic, also minor, Bank of Korea backlashes.
For example, there was open debate again in 1968 about the locus of
authority over commercial bank supervision. The central bank gover-
nor, Sµ Chin-Su clashed with the minister of finance over a proposal to
transfer some responsibility to the central bank; the latter backed down
and as a result resigned.14 Some transfer of bank supervisory authority
to the central bank occurred, but this authority was repeatedly chal-
lenged in the following years.

Several years later the Bank of Korea was on the losing side of a
controversy over details of the 1972 Emergency Decree.15 The debate
concerned the level below which savings in the informal financial
sector would be exempt from confiscation. For a number of reasons
the Bank of Korea wanted to maximize the squeeze on the informal
sector, with a low exemption point. The minister of finance and others
wanted to minimize political fall-out and sought a higher level that
would maximize the number of individuals exempted. The minister of
finance prevailed.

In the mid-1970s President Park Chung Hee cut Bank of Korea sala-
ries, which had been high compared with those of other government
employees, and thus contributed to low morale and a small exodus of
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some of the best central bank personnel. The story circulates that this
move was Park’s response to his wife’s complaints about how well-off
the neighboring central banker’s household appeared. Specifically,
Park investigated the nonsalary perquisites of Bank of Korea employ-
ment and eliminated many of them.16

After this blow to Bank of Korea capacity came a small compensating
victory. Governor Shin Pyµng-Hyµn successfully lobbied the minister
of finance in the late 1970s to grant the Bank of Korea power to formu-
late, though not necessarily implement, quarterly credit programs.17

Perhaps more significant, in 1981 the bank obtained a promise from the
Ministry of Finance to permit the central bank autonomy in its own
operational budgeting. This was a right accorded the central bank by
law in the Bank of Korea statute but not followed in practice.18

The issue of bank supervision arose again in the early 1980s. In 1982–
83 Minister of Finance Kang Kyµng-Shik presented the governor of the
Bank of Korea, Ha Yµng-Ki, an amendment proposing to remove bank
supervision rights from the central bank. Ha managed to block the
amendment but had to resign as a result.

While there was no international financial pressure on Korean politi-
cal leaders to increase central bank authority in the 1970s, there were
domestic pressures against doing so. The Korean government had de-
veloped a system of industrial and government finance dependent
upon extensive state control. As a subordinate arm of the government
the central bank played an important role in this system. The Bank of
Korea oversaw the commercial banks’ implementation of credit distri-
bution plans drawn up by the Economic Planning Board in accord with
overall industrialization goals.19 Furthermore, the central banks’ imple-
mentation of credit and interest rate controls limited development of
the financial sector. This kept demand for money high; high money
demand was crucial to government finance through seignorage.20

A Failed Independence Movement, 1987–88

The year 1987 marked the beginning of a complex several-year effort to
increase central bank authority that ultimately failed. The movement
had popular origins and became caught up in the hesitant rebirth of
party politics. As Table 7.1 indicates, the push for central bank indepen-
dence coincided with a very large rise in foreign exchange reserves and
a return to import coverage levels not sustained for more than a year
since the late 1960s. Domestic actors in favor of increased central bank
authority therefore did not enjoy the option of seeking support for their
movement from increasingly influential international financiers.
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The issue of central bank independence was brought to public debate
by a small group of Bank of Korea employees as part of the Korean
democracy movement. Central bank independence, they argued,
should be a necessary corollary of democratization.21 For slightly dif-
ferent reasons large-scale industrialists also joined the call of Bank of
Korea employees for central bank independence.22 Bank of Korea direc-
tors, as opposed to employees, also argued for increased central bank
authority but recommended different tactics. They suggested that au-
thority could not simply be restored to the central bank by constitu-
tional decree and called for quiet negotiation for modification of
the existing central bank charter, rather than public mobilization for
constitutional change.23 Bank of Korea directors wanted to eliminate
the finance minister’s voting rights on the Monetary Board, to make
the governor of the central bank, rather than the finance minister,
chair of the Monetary Board, to increase central bank policy jurisdic-
tion to foreign exchange and nonbank financial markets, to eliminate
the Ministry of Finance’s role as central bank auditor and its right
to appeal Monetary Board decisions, and to shift responsibility for
recommendation of the central bank governor from the Ministry of
Finance to the president.24

The debate over tactics for ensuring central bank independence be-
came caught up in party politics and the campaign leading up to the
1987 presidential and 1988 congressional elections. The National As-
sembly held hearings in August 1987. The Bank of Korea governor
Park Sµng-Sang argued for increased authority and Minister of Finance
Sakong Il, testified against it.25 Sakong Il argued that the government’s
overall responsibility for economic performance and social welfare
mandated that it have control over important policies such as mone-
tary policy. He also noted that evidence from other countries suggests
that there is no guarantee that increased statutory independence of a
central bank will bring monetary stability. Sakong Il further claimed
that Ministry of Finance intervention in central bank affairs in Korea
was minimal.

All major parties included the promise of increased central bank in-
dependence in their campaign platforms. The party of the incumbent
president, Roh Tae Woo, was the Democratic Justice Party. The for-
merly united opposition party, the Democratic Party, split into the left-
leaning Peace Democratic Party, led by Kim Dae Jung, and the more
centrist Democratic Party for Unification, led by Kim Young Sam. Fol-
lowers of the late president Park Chung Hee also formed a new opposi-
tion party during this electoral campaign: the relatively conservative
New Democratic Republican Party led by Kim Jong Pil. The Demo-
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cratic Justice Party argued that constitutional revision was not neces-
sary. In its view, amendment of the existing Bank of Korea law would
be sufficient. The opposition Peace Democratic Party and Democratic
Party for Unification adhered to the position that constitutional revi-
sion was necessary. The New Democratic Republican Party, perhaps
because there were a number of former government bureaucrats
among its leadership—such as former finance minister Kim Yµng-
Hwan—argued for little deviation from the status quo.

After winning the presidential election, Roh Tae Woo announced
that the guarantee of central bank independence would be a primary
concern during the first year of his term. In July 1988 the three opposi-
tion parties announced a joint proposal for a new Bank of Korea law
that largely echoed the preferences of the central bank directors.26 The
main changes proposed were that the chairmanship of the Monetary
Board should be held by the central bank governor rather than the
finance minister and that authority over nonbank financial institutions
and foreign exchange matters should be passed from the Ministry of
Finance to the Bank of Korea.

The government, through the Democratic Justice Party, responded
to the opposition proposal with a proposal of its own.27 This pro-
posal conceded that the chairman of the Monetary Board should be
the Bank of Korea governor and that the president, rather than the
minister of finance, should choose the Bank of Korea governor. But
the proposal suggested that all bank supervision authority should
be transferred from the central bank to the Ministry of Finance and
reiterated that ultimate authority for monetary policy should lie with
that ministry.28

The two most important points of debate between the Bank of Korea
and the opposition parties, on the one hand, and the Ministry of Fi-
nance and the government party, on the other, concerned who should
have authority over financial institution supervision and whether or
not the Bank of Korea needed guarantees of increased independence.
Ironically the two sides used similar arguments to defend different po-
sitions. The Ministry of Finance’s rationale for removing financial su-
pervisory authority from the Bank of Korea was to ensure “checks and
balances” of power. Its argument against central bank independence
rested on the need for coordination in order to have effective macroeco-
nomic management. The Bank of Korea reversed this logic, arguing
that independence provides important checks and balances for execu-
tive branch power but that coordination is necessary for effective finan-
cial supervision.29

Through back-room lobbying the government party persuaded the
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Monetary Board to release a letter supporting the government–Minis-
try of Finance position. Despite holding a seat on the Monetary Board,
the Bank of Korea governor was excluded from the letter-drafting pro-
cess.30 The letter stated the Monetary Board’s belief that authority over
monetary policy and financial administration should reside with the
Ministry of Finance, although there should be “some restraints” on the
minister of finance. The letter suggested that the Monetary Board
(which is appointed by the minister of finance) itself elect its chairman,
who would then serve concurrently as head of the central bank.31 This
political maneuvering greatly annoyed the central bank employees’
union, which issued a statement arguing that the Monetary Board’s
actions revealed opportunistic motives and complete subordination to
the Ministry of Finance. The employees called for the resignation of the
Monetary Board.32

In responding to the Monetary Board letter, Bank of Korea officials
also particularly objected to the possibility that the Ministry of Finance,
through its appointment of Monetary Board members, could select the
governor of the Bank of Korea.33 During six meetings over two weeks
in late August 1988, the Bank of Korea and the Ministry of Finance
were unable to reach a compromise.34

In the meantime, the government pressured the opposition parties
to modify their support of the Bank of Korea. The opposition New
Democratic Republican Party renounced its commitment to the uni-
fied opposition proposal and put forward a new proposal much
closer to the position of the Ministry of Finance and the governing
Democratic Justice Party.35 By November the other two opposition
parties had also decided to more or less support the Ministry of Fi-
nance and Democratic Justice Party position.36 They withdrew this
proposal after hearing strenuous objections from the Bank of Korea,
however, and fell back on proposals closer to their original pro–central
bank stance.37

With little hope of relying on opposition party support to help win
independence, the Bank of Korea employees turned to the populace,
launching a street campaign to collect signatures on a petition support-
ing the Bank of Korea’s proposals for increased authority.38 Once again
the Bank of Korea and the Ministry of Finance held a series of private
meetings to try to hammer out a compromise. These negotiations
dragged on through the first half of 1989.39 In May the Ministry of Fi-
nance broke off the talks and submitted a unilateral proposal to the
governing party. The governing party requested the opinion of the
Monetary Board, which reportedly came to shouting and fisticuffs over
the issue without being able to break its deadlock. Unable to reach an
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agreement to support the Ministry of Finance proposal, the Monetary
Board recommended dropping the idea of legal change in the Bank of
Korea’s status.

The 1987–88 Bank of Korea independence movement failed because
the government mobilized the power of a semi-authoritarian regime
against it. This stance was possible because Korea’s economic situation
did not demand that political elites assign a high priority to the compe-
tition for international capital. Foreign borrowing had been well man-
aged, Korean growth remained strong, and capital controls provided
assurances against sudden capital flight.

Conclusion

Korean central bank history highlights the way in which politicians’
perceptions of low need and value of competing for international
creditworthiness can jeopardize central bank independence. If objec-
tive conditions do not put pressure on political leaders to give priority
to the competition for international capital, they are free to follow
the logic of the domestic political economy. Accordingly, tenure inse-
curity of government politicians and abundant international aid
worked against the institutionalization of Bank of Korea independence
in the late 1950s and early 1960s. A variety of factors—heavy govern-
ment regulation of the financial sector, fairly strong export perfor-
mance relative to debt, and favorable interest rates on foreign loans
(compared with those of other middle-income developing countries)—
kept the need to compete for international capital and creditworthi-
ness low throughout the 1970s and 1980s, and central bank status
remained poor.

The picture that emerges from Korean central bank history on the
relationship between de facto and de jure authority is similar to that
emerging from the histories of Thailand and Mexico. To the extent that
there is any relationship, de jure change appears to follow from de facto
change, as in the 1962 Korean statute reform episode.

It also seems clear in this case that both technical capacity and strong
central bank leadership are, to a large extent, a function of the prefer-
ences of political leaders. Many of the Korean central bank governors
of the late 1950s and early 1960s had as much potential to become
strong central bank governors as did Puey in Thailand or Gómez in
Mexico, but could not overcome political obstacles. Similarly, while the
Bank of Korea attracted highly trained personnel in the 1950s, it be-
came a less desirable place of employment for the best of Korea’s
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young economists as it became more nearly an administrative arm of
the Economic Planning Board and the Ministry of Finance.40

Foreign portfolio finance is slowly increasing in Korea but plays a
smaller role than in any of the other countries examined in Chapters
5–8. As suggested by the forced resignation in 1993 of Sun Cho, one of
Korea’s most widely respected and powerful central bank governors,
the Korean central bank is likely to continue in its current subservient
position until the nation’s international economic position deteriorates
significantly and/or the country finds itself with a well-institutional-
ized democracy.



Eight

The Politics of Changing Central Bank
Authority: Brazil

THERE ARE two identifiable turning points in Brazilian central banking
history: 1964 and 1967. Lack of change in the 1970s and 1980s also re-
quires explanation. In 1964, economic crisis and the need for interna-
tional creditworthiness helped bring about both a military coup and
the creation of an official central bank, after two decades of debate over
the nature of official financial institutions. As Table 8.1 indicates, resto-
ration of import coverage, growth of Euromarket lending, and export
levels that lagged only modestly behind debt took away pressure to
maintain international creditworthiness, and with rising debate in the
military over economic policy, the newly created central bank quickly
lost its promise of authority and independence after 1967. Brazilian
creditworthiness measured by an international comparison of interest
paid on its international loans (Table 4.3) remained good during the
1970s. In the 1980s, despite higher interest rates on foreign borrowing
(by international comparison), rising debt-to-export ratios, and grow-
ing short-term debt, Brazilian political leaders did not perceive a great
need to compete for international capital (see Table 8.2). Gov-
ernment regulation of the financial sector was significant, and this
regulation mitigated the need and value of competing for international
capital and creditworthiness.1 Import coverage remained adequate.
Furthermore, the incentive to maintain policy flexibility with which to
try to buy political support in the uncertain context of political liberali-
zation provided an important motive not to increase central bank au-
thority in the 1980s.

SUMOC: Precursor to a Central Bank

In the 1940s, spurred by developments in the international monetary
arena and by a strong desire to avoid a repeat of the inflation experi-
enced early in the decade, government technocrats pressed the issue of
creating a central bank.2 But Brazil’s largest commercial bank and long-
time state bank, the Banco do Brasil, and the agricultural and commer-
cial elite represented among its owners, resisted.
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TABLE 8.1
Indicators of Brazil’s Need to Compete for International Capital

Average Annual Interest
on Private Credit Minus

Foreign Exchange the Eurodollar or Libor
Interest RateaReserves (U.S. millions)Import CoverageYear

3127.061945
3966.831946
4204.141947
4414.671948
4034.331949
3483.801950
1981.181951
2091.251952
2842.581953
1611.191954
1681.541955
2872.791956
1521.221957
1401.241958
400.351959
580.481960

1851.521961
600.491962
690.561963

1541.461964
4214.611965
3682.951966
1421.021967
2001.131968
5993.171969

−1.29624.051970
1.41,4504.701971
1.93,8369.621972
0.16,03010.341973
0.74,8744.131974
1.93,6533.231975
1.96,1015.331976
2.46,7876.141977
1.511,4069.091978

−0.48,3425.051979
−0.95,0422.421980

0.15,8882.931981
−0.73,6412.071982

1.04,3553.111983
1.511,5079.081984



C E N T R A L B A N K A U T H O R I T Y: B R A Z I L 123

TABLE 8.1 (cont.)

Average Annual Interest
on Private Credit Minus

Foreign Exchange the Eurodollar or Libor
Import Coverage Reserves (U.S. millions)Year Interest Ratea

10,6048.881985 1.3
2.25,8031986 4.48

6,2994.56 0.21987
1.56,9715.211988

7,535 0.54.521989
0.57,4303.971990

N.A. 1.5N.A.1991
1992 N.A. N.A. 4.1
1993 N.A. N.A. N.A.

Source: Calculated from IMF, International Financial Statistics (Washington, D.C.: IMF,
various years), and World Bank, World Debt Tables (Washington, D.C.: World Bank, vari-
ous years).

Note: The World Debt Tables changed the definition of the numerator in 1980. N.A.–Not
available.

a. Libor–London interbank offer rate.

The Banco do Brasil had been the primary source of funds support-
ing São Paulo businessmen and, in particular, the government’s coffee
price support programs since 1906.3 The political pressure of São Paulo
entrepreneurs, coffee planters, and industrialists played a large role in
shaping government financing needs and the Banco do Brasil’s actions.
Over the course of the 1920s, as Brazil’s First Republic drew to a close,
the Banco do Brasil became a quasi-central bank with the main goal of
directly and indirectly supporting first the credit-hungry businessmen
of São Paulo, then mostly coffee growers, and later industrialists.4 The
interests of the Banco do Brasil and its owners and clients were so anti-
thetical to those of Brazil’s international creditors that a 1923 British
loan negotiation team decided that the only way to guarantee that Bra-
zil would follow sound financial policies was for British creditors to
buy the Banco do Brasil. 5

The more practical idea of limiting Banco do Brasil functions and
creating a genuine central bank alongside it was first seriously consid-
ered in 1931. In that year, as part of British financiers’ evaluation of
Brazilian creditworthiness, the adviser Otto Niemeyer traveled to Bra-
zil. He wrote a report on Brazilian financial policy that included a de-
tailed statute for a separate central bank which would usurp the Banco
do Brasil’s central banking functions.6 While some private bankers sup-
ported the proposal, the Banco do Brasil and São Paulo businessmen
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TABLE 8.2
Foreign Investment in Brazil (stock of investments, in U.S. millions)

LoansYear EquitiesBondsFDI

31.544.51949
23.439.11950

1951 63.5 28.8
28.894.51952

1953 59.9 22.9
110.251.41954

1955 78.7 109.4
83.0140.01956

1957 179.0 57.0
172.0128.01958

1959 158.0 192.0
72.0138.01960

1961 147.0 361.0
177.0132.01962

1963 87.0 142.0
125.086.01964

1965 128.0 158.0
282.0159.01966

1967 115.0 193.0
183.0136.01968

1969 252.0 491.0
1,470.0421.01970

1971 535.0 2,069.0
4,036.0550.01972

1973 1,156.0 3,825.0
5,869.01,103.01974

1975 1,346.0 5,070.0
6,958.01,567.01976

1977 1,567.0 7,182.0
12,326.01,597.01978

1,869.0 7,854.01979

opposed it and succeeded in getting the report shelved, as they had the
1923 proposal.

The political power of the Banco do Brasil’s supporters was based
largely on the heavy representation of coffee planters in Congress,
which was closed after Getulio Vargas’s 1937 coup. In 1945, the govern-
ment economist Octavio de Gouvêia Bulhões convinced President Var-
gas to take advantage of the soon-to-end eight-year congressional re-
cess and decree the creation of the Superintendency of Money and
Credit (SUMOC) as a precursor to a central bank.7
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TABLE 8.2 (cont.)

EquitiesBondsFDIYear Loans

1980 1,470.0 13,128.0
2,142.01981 11,232.0

1982 2,647.0 6,583.0
10,895.01,456.01983
15,963.01,559.01984

(15.0)(222.0)1,348.0 13,221.01985
1986 320.0 (460.0) 10.0 13,533.0
1987 1,225.0 (489.0) 61.0 14,368.0
1988 2,969.0 (13.0) 189.0 31,000.0

5,137.01989 1,267.0 (364.0) (57.0)
3,072.0584.0(72.0)901.01990

15,274.0578.03,230.0972.01991
N.A.N.A.1,466.01,454.01992

Source: IMF, International Financial Statistics (Washington, D.C.: IMF, vari-
ous years).

Note: FDI–Foreign direct investment. N.A.–Not available.

The Superintendency of Money and Credit was created in 1945 as a
“halfway” central bank because of Banco do Brasil opposition to creat-
ing a genuine central bank. It was responsible for foreign exchange
policy, interest rates, the registration of foreign capital, and commercial
bank reserve requirements, and was authorized to conduct open mar-
ket operations. Essentially, SUMOC was given jurisdiction over policy
formulation while the Banco do Brasil continued to be the executor of
foreign exchange policy and, to some extent, interest rate policy. The
SUMOC statute authorizes the minister of finance to contract with the
Banco do Brasil to execute the policies of SUMOC,8 and stipulates the
bank as its financial agent.

The Banco do Brasil also continued to enjoy other privileges that
would have made SUMOC control of monetary and exchange policy
difficult even if it had more legal authority over policy execution. The
Banco do Brasil offered the government virtually costless, limitless au-
tomatic overdraft protection. It was also the legally stipulated recipient
of mandatory commercial bank reserve requirements while enjoying
exemption from such requirements, despite significant commercial
banking operations of its own.

Furthermore, SUMOC was housed in the Banco do Brasil building. It
had a limited number of personnel, selected from Banco do Brasil staff,
and virtually no autonomous technical capacity until a government de-
cree created a statistics department within SUMOC in 1950.9 SUMOC
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did not publish its own annual reports but rather was given a few
pages in the Banco do Brasil annual report.

These conditions “annihilated . . . SUMOC in the cradle.”10 SUMOC
was “confined to the role the Bank of Brazil sought to assign to it.”11

SUMOC spent its first five years promoting mergers among commer-
cial banks during a period of great instability in the private bank sector.

The archeology of SUMOC’s failures between 1945 and 1964 is pre-
dictable. The directorship of SUMOC changed hands fifteen times in
the nineteen years between 1945 and 1964. SUMOC personnel fre-
quently complained to U.S. embassy personnel about their inability to
pursue money-stabilizing goals.12 SUMOC was inevitably caught up in
struggles between the minister of finance and the Banco do Brasil pres-
ident, whose powers in the economic policy process were considered
roughly equal. SUMOC was weakest when the Banco do Brasil presi-
dent and the minister of finance were closely allied. SUMOC initiatives
came closest to success when it could count on Ministry of Finance
support in the face of Banco do Brasil intransigence. One such instance
occurred while Horacio Lafer was finance minister (1953). Lafer
clashed seriously with the Banco do Brasil president, Ricardo Jafet,
and had to resign. Before that, he provided political protection for
SUMOC to raise the issue of its right to solicit information about Banco
do Brasil loans and inspect the bank’s books. In the end, however, the
Banco do Brasil “obtained a half victory that constituted a total defeat
for the SUMOC.”13

The pattern is also evident during Lucas Lopes’s tenure as finance
minister (1958–59). SUMOC proposed institutional reforms transfer-
ring some of the Banco do Brasil’s executive authority in the area of
monetary and exchange policy to SUMOC. That the proposal could be
advanced is testimony to the strong support of the finance minister.
Nonetheless it eventually sank into the abyss of growing politico-
economic crisis that cost Lopes his job and intensified as the 1960s
approached.

SUMOC was the official Brazilian interlocutor with the IMF, but this
did little to bolster its authority in a context of strong opposition to
IMF conditions from Brazil’s political leaders. SUMOC tried to use its
ties to the IMF as a lever in debates over government policy and issues
concerning its own scope of authority. “Forever worried, like the entire
SUMOC group, with external repercussions,” during 1958 debate over
stabilization Garrido Torres, executive director of SUMOC in 1958,
warned of “the weakening of the Brazilian government’s position over-
seas for the negotiation of loans.”14 Ultimately Banco do Brasil domi-
nance of SUMOC created difficulties in SUMOC–IMF relations. The
IMF placed greatest confidence in the Brazilian representatives to the
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Fund, including Octavio Gouvêia de Bulhões and Francisco Alves dos
Santos Filho. Nonetheless the IMF’s vote of confidence in these officials
was not sufficient to overcome opposition, which stemmed from incen-
tives created by a fragmented party system, to their economic vision.

Debating the Need for a Central Bank

Brazil’s nineteen-year debate over central bank legislation, from 1945
to 1964, must be understood in the context of the tremendous political
uncertainty facing the nation’s political leaders in that period. All
the civilian leaders of that era experienced tenure insecurity, as indi-
cated by the frequent changes in government leadership. Creating a
central bank implied reducing the scope for action of the Banco do
Brasil, Brazil’s largest commercial bank and also Brazil’s longtime state
bank. Until the military coup of 1964 no political leaders had a strong
enough coalition either to give up the direct source of government
finance the government had in the Banco do Brasil or to incur the politi-
cal costs of circumscribing Banco do Brasil operations when the bank
was backed by powerful industrial and agricultural interests. Coffee
exporters, for example, required inexpensive government-subsidized
credit from the Banco do Brasil to weather cycles in coffee production
and business.

Getúlio Vargas, who had governed Brazil under a dictatorship from
1937 to 1945, won the presidency in free national elections in 1950. To
overcome his dictatorial legacy he was determined to prove himself a
successful democratic leader. Most important, he had to avoid provid-
ing the military with an excuse to intervene. Given the weakness and
fragmentation of the Brazilian party system, this required a careful
balancing act. Vargas had been elected for a constitutionally defined
five-year term with a 49 percent plurality and help from an extremely
diverse coalition, including the rural elite–based Partido Social De-
mocrático (Social Democratic Party or SDP), the labor-based Partido
Trabalhista (Brazilian Workers’ Party or PTB), the Partido Social Pro-
gressista (Progressive Social Party or PSP—the personal machine of the
populist politician Adhemar), and even a minority group within the
União Democrática Nacional (National Democratic Union or UDN—a
party linked to one army faction and united largely around opposition
to Vargas’s dictatorial populism). Although a minority within the Na-
tional Democratic Union had supported Vargas, the party leadership
tried to block Vargas’s inauguration on a constitutional technicality. A
military tribunal rejected the appeal. No single party had a majority in
Congress, and most were represented in Vargas’s cabinet.
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In this context Vargas pursued a strategy of reconciliation, trying
to win full National Democratic Union support. This merely succeeded
in alienating the Brazilian Workers’ Party and other of Vargas’s left-
leaning allies. Vargas tried to combine nationalism and orthodoxy
in his economic policy in order to maintain the support of as many
classes or sectors as possible. For example, to gain support for a much-
needed monetary stabilization program in 1953 he appointed Goulart,
a politician with a reputation for collaborating with Communists
and militant labor leaders, as his labor minister. Ultimately this move
led to a demand by the military and the National Democratic Union
for Vargas’s resignation. Despondent, Vargas committed suicide. His
vice-president, João Café Filho, succeeded him for a brief period until
new elections brought Juscelino Kubitschek to the presidency in 1956
(see Table 8.3).

Kubitschek’s political situation was also tenuous. He was elected
with a 36 percent plurality and support from a Democratic Socialist and
Workers’ Party alliance. As it had done earlier, the National Demo-
cratic Union tried, and failed, to block the new president’s inaugura-
tion. The military staged a “preventive” coup to ensure that Kubitschek
could take office. Like Vargas, Kubitschek tried to govern without ap-
pealing to a single identifiable party or movement, endeavoring to pre-
serve the broadest appeal possible. Although Kubitschek managed to
survive his term, national political instability rose with the election of
Jánio Quadros. Quadros ran in the 1960 elections with a National Dem-
ocratic Union endorsement but tried to maintain distance from the
party whenever possible. He ran as an outsider, with an “antipoliti-
cian,” anticorruption, anti-inefficiency platform. This stance left him
without an organized political base when he came to power. He was
forced to resign from the presidency within a year of taking office and
was succeeded by his vice-president, João Goulart, after a ten-day in-
terregnum during which both pro- and anti-Goulart military factions
debated the merits of a coup.

This national-level political fragmentation hindered the ability of
any political leader to build a coalition behind bank reform. Armijo’s
characterization of the 1980s holds equally well for the 1950s: “Political
parties were not strong or deep. It was possible to arrange a coalition
to block . . . economic initiatives, but not one to pass serious stabiliza-
tion programs or far-reaching financial reforms.”15 SUMOC officials
observed and lamented the need for, and lack of, a strong presidential
commitment and political push to get central bank legislation passed.16

In this situation domestic political pressures, specifically the incen-
tives stemming from constant uncertainty, swamped the need for inter-
national creditworthiness. Brazil’s need for international capital rose
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TABLE 8.3
Change of Government, Regime Type, and Central Bank Governor in Brazil

SUMOC Director/Banco
Central GovernorRegimePresident

José Vieira Machado (1945–51)DEMOCRATICEnrico Gaspar Dutra
(1946–51)

Valter Moreira Sales 1951–52)Getúlio Dornelles Vargas
Egidio da Camara Sousa (1952)(1951–54)
José Soares Maciel Filho (1952–54)
Octavio Gouvêia de Bulhões (1954–55)João Café Filho (1954–55)
Prudente de Morais Neto (1955)
Inar Dias de Figueiredo (1955–56)
Eurico de Aguiar Sales (1955–56)Juscelino Kubitschek
José Joaquim Cardoso de Melo Netode Oliveira (1956–61)

(1957–58)
José Garrido Torres (1958–59)
Marco de Sousa Dantas (1959–60)
Fransisco Vieira de Alencar (1960–61)Jánio da Silva Quadros (1961)
Octavio Gouvêia de Bulhões (1961–63)João Belchor Marques
Julio Augusto Dias Carneiro (1963–64)Goulart (1961)–64)

Denio Chagas Nogueira (1964–67)MILITARYHumberto de Alencar
Castelo Branco (1964–67)

Rui Aguiar da Silva Lerma (1967)Arthur da Costa e Silva
(1967–69)

Ernane Galvêas (1968–74)
Emilio Garrastazu Medici

(1969–74)
Ernesto Geisel (1974–79)

Paulo H. Pereira Luna (1975–79)
João Baptista de Oliveira

Figueredo (1979–85)
Carlos Langoni (1980–82)
Affonso Celso Pastore (1983–84)

Fernão Carlos Botelho Bracher (1985)José Sarney (1985–89) DEMOCRATIC

Fernando Milliet de Oliveira (1986)
Elmo de Araujo Camoe (1988)Fernando Collor de Melo
Wadico Waldir Bucchi (1990)(1989–92)
Ibrahim Eris (1990–91)
Fransisco Roberto André Gros (1991–92)
Gustavo Jorge Laboissiére Loyola (1992–93)Hamar Franco (1992–93)
Pedro Sampaio Malan (1993–94)Fernando Henrique Cardoso

(1994–) Gustavo Jorge Labroissiére Loyola (1994–)
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during the 1950s. Import coverage fell 69 percent in 1951, 54 percent in
1954, and 56 percent in 1957 and hovered between l.18 and 2.79 months
(see Table 8.1). But the logic of trying to remain in power in a polarized,
unstable democracy weighed much more heavily on politicians’ minds
than competing for international capital—until import coverage fell
below 1 month in 1959 and foreign investment in Brazil virtually
ceased in the early 1960s (as is evident in Table 8.2). But that is getting
ahead of our story.

In 1946, immediately after the SUMOC was founded as a precursor
to a central bank, President Enrico Dutra had charged his minister of
finance, Pedro Luís Correia e Castro, with writing thorough-going
bank reform legislation that would provide for the establishment of a
genuinely independent central bank. As the debate over central bank
foundation became prolonged, it became clearer and clearer that
SUMOC was inadequate as a central banking institution.

The political debate over bank reform over the next nineteen years
was complex, reflecting many cleavages among and within economic
groups and political parties.17 There were at least eight alternative pro-
posals, hundreds of congressional amendments, and several special
study commissions.18 These proposals covered a broad banking reform
agenda. Debate centered on the specification of the public and private
sector roles in the financial market, the place of foreign capital, the
creation of a central bank and its relationship to the Banco do Brasil, the
power and composition of the National Monetary Council (CMN)
which would replace SUMOC, and the definition of selective credit
policy. Roughly speaking, international creditors, national bankers,
and the conservative National Democratic Union favored creation of a
central bank which would take over many Banco do Brasil functions,
although they disagreed on its balance of power with the National
Monetary Council and the related issue of the composition of the coun-
cil. The Workers’ Party, together with the industrialists’ association
Federacão das Industrias do Estado de São Paulo (Federation of Indus-
tries of the State of São Paulo or FIESP), favored turning the Banco do
Brasil into a central bank and having broad sectoral representation on
the CMN.

The original proposal was written by Finance Minister Correia e
Castro, who had earlier been a longtime employee of the Banco do
Brasil as well as, more briefly, a politician. He was determined to elabo-
rate and implement a plan to eradicate Brazil’s century-old inflationary
tendency, which had been aggravated by wartime shortages. Ideally,
Correia e Castro must have recognized, an independent central bank
would have increased the likelihood of success for an orthodox infla-
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tion-fighting strategy. But he was not successful. Several years later this
institutional lacuna was highlighted by a bilateral development com-
mission. Brazil’s inflation-fighting ability, the commissioners wrote, is
“weakened by the lack of an effective, independent and nonpolitical
body entrusted with the supervision of the banking system and the
coordination of monetary and credit policy.”19 Yet the political exigen-
cies of implementing even a short-term stabilization plan were such
that they left little political capital with which to try to accomplish insti-
tutional reform. The fragmentation and polarization of the national po-
litical environment was not conducive to the coalition building neces-
sary to overcome diverse opinions on banking reform.

A second banking reform proposal was introduced in Congress by
Daniel Faraco, then a Social Democratic Party deputy from Rio Grande
do Sul. Faraco was friend and admirer of two well-known Brazilian
proponents of orthodox economic policy at the time: Octavio Gouvêia
de Bulhões and Eugenio Gudin. In his proposal he called for the crea-
tion of a central bank to replace SUMOC and take over the Banco do
Brasil’s rediscounting and foreign exchange operations. Although he
proposed that the central bank be an independent policymaking entity,
Faraco also proposed creation of a National Monetary Council with
Ministry of Finance, private bank, and central bank representatives.
This reflected the recognition that a future central bank was unlikely to
be completely immune from political pressures and that it would be
necessary to try to counterbalance Banco do Brasil influence by increas-
ing the role of the Ministry of Finance and private bank representatives
in the formulation and implementation of monetary policy.20

There was considerable sectoral and party opposition to this pro-
posal, and an alternative was eventually offered by the Workers’ Party
deputy Camilo Nogueira da Gama in 1959. Despite his labor party affil-
iation Gama had worked under Minister of Finance Oswaldo Aranha,
helping to formulate and implement a monetary stabilization plan. His
bank reform proposal therefore reflected a compromise between the
Faraco position and the preferences of the more extreme members of
the Brazilian Workers’ Party. Gama’s proposal called for establishment
of a large, sectorally diverse National Monetary Council with guaran-
teed labor representation. In contrast to the Faraco proposal, the new
central bank would not have independent policymaking authority; it
would execute policy defined by the National Monetary Council. Fara-
cao responded with his second attempt at bank reform legislation, pro-
posing a similar balance of power between the National Monetary
Council and the central bank, but significantly narrowing the size and
scope of representation on the council.
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In 1962 a Workers’ Party deputy from São Paulo also submitted an
alternate proposal that responded to the attack on the Banco do Brasil
implied by the earlier proposals. He proposed that the Banco do Brasil
become the nation’s central bank. President João Goulart, in turn, com-
missioned a study of all preexisting reform proposals that concluded
that SUMOC should be granted the central banking functions held by
the Banco do Brasil at the time. The industry association of São Paulo
(FIESP) criticized the weakening of the Banco do Brasil implied in Gou-
lart’s proposal, and that proposal was soon met with a counter-pro-
posal by the Social Democratic Party deputy Jose Maria Alkmin, calling
again for the Banco do Brasil to become the nation’s central bank.

Creation of the Banco Central do Brasil, 1964

Central bank politics in the mid-1960s were no different from the poli-
tics of all other economic issues. Growing frustration was felt by the
Brazilian military and their political sympathizers. Resolution of the
debate over a hypothetical central bank came only when Brazil’s inter-
national financial situation reached crisis proportions, inducing a mili-
tary coup. Objectively, the need for international creditworthiness
mounted in the late 1950s. Import coverage fell below one month in
1959 for the first time since World War II, and remained below one
month on average in 1960, 1962, and 1963 (see Table 8.1). Meanwhile,
as Table 8.2 shows, foreign direct investment dipped significantly in
1963 and 1964. Foreign lending to Brazil was more erratic, but declined
significantly in 1960 only to reach a record high in 1961 and fall consis-
tently every year thereafter until after the central bank was created in
1965. Corrêa do Lago notes, “Foreign capitalists had, in effect, ceased to
be interested in investing in Brazil . . . since 1962.”21

The two-decade-long stalemate engendered by political polarization
and fragmentation only ended with the imposition of military govern-
ment in 1964. Once political debate within Brazil’s polarized party sys-
tem was circumscribed and power centralized, agreement on central
bank legislation was quickly reached. Humberto Castelo Branco’s fi-
nance minister, Bulhões, maneuvered to impede approval of the
Alkmin bank reform proposal and formed an extra-parliamentary five-
member commission to write central bank legislation. This proposal
was passed to a special congressional commission headed by the Social
Democratic Party deputy Ulysses Guimarâes. According to this legisla-
tion, approved in 1964 after relatively minor debate between the execu-
tive and the Congress, SUMOC was replaced by two new bodies: the
Central Bank of Brazil and the National Monetary Council.
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The Brazil central banking statute passed into law in 1964 achieved
an independence measure of .21 on the Cukierman et al. (1992) scale.
The statute sets forth a variety of central bank objectives, but does not
include price stability among them. The statute does explicitly refer to
the central bank as autonomous. Regarding the chief executive officer
of the central bank, the charter specifies legislative approval of the gov-
ernor’s appointment, with term length and dismissal at the uncondi-
tional discretion of political authorities. The statute provides for the
central bank to advise the government on monetary policy but does not
endow it with the capacity to influence the budget process or the direc-
tion of other government decisions. In the area of central bank financ-
ing of the government, the Brazilian central bank statute stipulates that
the executive branch may unilaterally decide on the terms and condi-
tions of loans and impose them on the central bank; there is no mention
of maximum maturities on loans.

The Brazilian Central Bank: From Creation
to Irrelevance

The central bank opened its doors in March 1965. But in the words of
one observer, it took “several years before it gathered the necessary
staff and operations from other institutions to actually function as a
central bank.”22 No sooner had this consolidation occurred than it was
undermined by the government’s centralizing response to intramili-
tary debate over economic policy. Although in the following years of
military rule, from 1968 until 1979, there were only two central bank
presidents, this reflected subservience rather than autonomy.23 Plan-
ning Minister Antonio Delfim Netto’s efforts to bring the central bank
into his personal political orbit were bolstered by growing access to
relatively inexpensive international credit.

The history of central bank authority in this period is closely tied to
the history of the National Monetary Council. The idea behind creation
of the National Monetary Council was to help insulate the central bank
from electoral and party pressures, regional demands, and government
officials’ salary requests. It was, in essence, meant to be a buffer be-
tween the Ministry of Finance and the central bank. The National Mon-
etary Council statute states the intent to strengthen the central bank by
creating a monetary authority that would prevent government inter-
ference in central bank affairs. The council was created with an eight-
member board: the governor of the central bank and three central bank
directors, the president of the National Bank of Economic Development
(BNDE), the minster of finance, as chair, and two private sector repre-
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sentatives named by the federal president for six-year terms. Although
the independence of the National Monetary Council, conceived as sim-
ilar to the U.S. Federal Reserve Board, was limited by the role of finance
minister as its chairperson, the intention was to preserve some inde-
pendence through the provision of staggered six-year terms of ap-
pointment for the four central bank representatives to the council. In
addition, the six-year terms of the two private sector representatives
were intended to give them more power than their government col-
leagues, who would be replaced whenever the personnel in the presi-
dent’s office changed.24 SUMOC had been composed entirely of gov-
ernment officials. The motive for adding private sector representatives
to SUMOC’s successor institution was to counterbalance the power of
expansion-oriented government representatives. Creation of the cen-
tral bank and the National Monetary Council and their activism was
applauded by the Fifth National Bankers Congress in Porto Alegre in
November 1964.25

The first serious blow to the newly created central bank came in 1967
with the change from one military president to another. There was a
month-long debate about whether incoming Arthur da Costa e Silva
should replace the central bank governor, even though the central bank
statute provided a four-year term. Supporters of leadership continuity
pointed out that replacing Denio Chagas Nogueira would abrogate the
central bank statute. Furthermore, argued Octavio Gouvêia de Bulhões
in a leading magazine, it would undermine “the very reason for central
bank existence . . . because it [the central bank] should function as a
symbol of continuity in government monetary policy for purposes of
external credibility, particularly with international financial organiza-
tions.”26 An adviser to the new Brazilian president responded that
“every government needs freedom to move in all areas.”27

Central bank supporters lost, and in late April 1967 Rui Aguiar da
Silva Lerma took the helm of the Banco Central do Brasil. In response
to criticisms about concentration of power in the central bank’s hands,
one of Lerma’s first moves was to announce a phase of “central bank
decentralization.” This was accomplished by restructuring the Na-
tional Monetary Council. Costa e Silva’s minister of finance, Delfim
Netto, had wanted to create a Development Council to coordinate gov-
ernment economic policy with industrialization plans. Instead, with
Costa e Silva’s backing, he began to try to transform the National Mon-
etary Council into a powerful government agency through which mon-
etary and financial policy would be formulated and implemented in
line with industrialization plans.

After forcing out the previous administration’s central bank head,
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the new administration also forced the resignation of the three central
bank directors previously sitting on the National Monetary Council.28

Not long after this reshuffling there was yet another key personnel
change; Delfim Netto removed central bank governor Rui Aguiar da
Silva Lerma in favor of Ernane Galvêas. In November 1967 Costa e
Silva decreed a change in the National Monetary Council statute and
expanded its membership, adding a fifth central bank representative.
This gave the central bank a majority on the National Monetary Coun-
cil, which was part of Delfim Netto’s plan to gain firm Ministry of Fi-
nance control of the council through the ministry’s power to nominate
the central bank governor. This legal change was followed by another,
reorienting the council’s mission toward the formulation of monetary
and credit policy in accord with “the real needs of the economy.”29 One
observer remarks that 1967 witnessed the “complete disfigurement” of
both the central bank and the National Monetary Council.30

Delfim Netto gradually expanded the representation of other gov-
ernment ministries and agencies on the National Monetary Council as
part of his goal to cement Ministry of Finance control over both public
and private financial institutions and all other economic agencies of the
government. By 1972 the National Monetary Council included the min-
isters of industry, agriculture, planning, and interior as well as the
presidents of the National Housing Bank and the National Bank of Eco-
nomic Development. The increase in size and government representa-
tion on the National Monetary Council was accompanied by an in-
crease in its scope.31 As minister of finance Delfim chaired the council
which, with its expanded jurisdiction and representation, provided
him an ideal entity through which to try to centralize economic control.
In a reversal of its original role of insulating the central bank from gov-
ernment pressures, under Costa e Silva the National Monetary Council
became an institution that facilitated government control of the central
bank and all other economic policymaking agencies.32

Delfim’s swift and immediate moves against the autonomy of the
National Monetary Council and the central bank must be understood
against the backdrop of a declining need for international credit-
worthiness and increasing uncertainty over presidential succession.
The 1964 coup was partly motivated by frustration with Brazil’s recur-
ring balance of payments problems and lack of access to new interna-
tional credit. The new economic policy of the military government, of
which central bank foundation was a part, helped lay the groundwork
for the successful renegotiation of Brazil’s short-term international
debts and for reestablishment of access to international credit. The cen-
tral bank’s efforts to consolidate its authority were aided by the interest
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and support of international creditors. The post-1967 years, in contrast,
were characterized by easy money, both from exports and from inter-
national financial markets awash with liquidity. An authoritative cen-
tral bank was not necessary to gain access to international financial
resources; private bankers were busy urging loans on any developing
country that would accept them. As it did in many other developing
countries, the growth of international liquidity and Euromarket activ-
ity beginning in the late 1960s undermined the ability of the central
bank in Brazil to build alliances with international creditors that would
allow it to increase its authority vis-à-vis domestic actors.

Since the late 1960s there has been virtually no change in Brazilian
central bank authority. Pressure for democratization created political
uncertainty in the 1970s. This together with the low need for interna-
tional creditworthiness due to high reserves, excess liquidity in inter-
national financial markets, and relatively manageable debt-to-export
ratios in the 1970s created little incentive for strengthening the central
bank. In the 1980s there were occasional public and private discussions,
often motivated by foreign exchange difficulties and IMF negotiations,
about the need for a more authoritative central bank. Despite the rise in
need for international creditworthiness in the 1980s and 1990s, relative
to the 1970s, Brazil’s endemic political instability continued and did not
provide political leaders sufficient political capital to allow them to
cede authority to the central bank. The fate of Finance Minister Fer-
nando Henrique Cardoso’s August 1993 call for a more independent
central bank is typical.33 Even before debate over creating a “central
bank or [a] Frankenstein” could take hold, the proposal was buried, at
least temporarily, in the political chaos of new and grander corruption
scandals plaguing Brazil’s political elite.34 As portfolio investment in
Brazil grows (Table 8.2) and short-term debt sky-rockets (Table 8.1), it
is not surprising that proposals to increase central bank independence
resurface every few months. Central bank reform was highlighted in
Cardoso’s campaign platform and was high on the agenda of his ad-
ministration’s legislative goals in early 1995.

Current debate about central bank independence in Brazil may chart
the future for South Korea. The growing importance of equity invest-
ment, particularly as a source of balance of payments financing, has
made Brazilian political elites increasingly sensitive to the need to com-
pete for international finance. As Brazilian democracy develops, politi-
cal elites are increasingly held accountable for their economic policy
decisions. Not only must policy respond to public opinion, which ap-
pears to be increasingly in favor of central bank independence, but ac-
countability creates incentives for political elites to delegate economic
policy responsibility.
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Conclusion

Brazilian central bank history emphasizes the importance of politi-
cians’ tenure security in coloring their evaluation of the costs and bene-
fits of signaling international creditworthiness via central bank inde-
pendence. Brazil, like South Korea, has had relatively strict regulation
of domestic and international financial transactions; this has also
mitigated the need to compete for international creditworthiness.
Nonetheless several years of relatively low import coverage occurred
in the late 1950s and early 1960s. These were not sufficient to bring
an end to the debate over creation of a central bank. It was not until
low import coverage persisted, foreign direct investment and foreign
lending declined, and a military coup occurred that a genuine Brazilian
central bank was created. Objective measures of the need for interna-
tional creditworthiness combined with an increase in politicians’
tenure security finally brought a halt to endless haggling over central
bank creation.

After the coup, political security allowed Brazil’s new military lead-
ers to take a longer-term view of the benefits associated with an inde-
pendent central bank. From a more secure political position than that of
previous civilian leaders, the military also perceived less political cost
in the loss of monetary policy flexibility associated with central bank
independence. Prior to the military coup of 1964, political uncertainty
lowered the value political elites placed on trying to improve Brazil’s
creditworthiness. In the phase of central bank creation, high levels of
political competition and a large number of legislative impediments
severely undermined the prospects of those favoring an independent
central bank. After the bank was created, however, lack of political
competition and the centralization of political power in a context of
relatively low objective need to compete for international capital and
creditworthiness had extremely negative consequences for central
bank independence.



Nine

Conclusion

THIS CONCLUDING chapter revisits the country histories in light of alter-
native theories about the politics of central bank independence, pre-
sents quantitative evidence constituting an indirect test of the signaling
model of central bank independence, and ends by evaluating these
findings in light of questions about the desirability and feasibility of
central bank independence.

Alternative Arguments

I have argued that in middle-income developing countries central bank
indepenence corresponds to politicians’ preferences. Politicians favor
sharing policy authority with central banks to the extent they give pri-
ority to building or protecting their nation’s attraction for creditors and
investors. Competing arguments include those based on the weight of
law, central bank governor leadership capabilities, and ideological
trends. Arguments based on sector strength and political institutions
are partially encompassed in the argument about international influ-
ence developed here.

It is equally clear in Brazil, as in Thailand, Mexico, and South Korea,
that behind central bank authority and ideology lie the strategic actions
of political elites. In 1967 Delfim Netto could force out a governor with
the leadership potential of Puey or Gómez because he wanted to and
felt little need to be concerned with the impact on international credit-
worthiness. The challenging questions concern how and to what extent
finance, politics, and law shape changing preferences of political lead-
ers with regard to central bank authority.

One problem with both the legal and the pure sectoral arguments is
that while they may explain broad cross-national differences in central
bank authority viewed as relatively unchanging over time, they do not
point to sufficient variation in explanatory factors to account for
change over time. As noted in previous chapters, central bank statutes
do not vary as much as de facto central bank authority does. For exam-
ple, Cukierman et al.’s (1992) legal measure of Brazilian central bank
independence does not change at all from 1964 through 1989, although
the bank’s de facto authority declined dramatically after 1967. The
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TABLE 9.1
Political Vulnerability Index for Central Banks

Country 1950–1971 1972–1989

Thailand .25 .11
Mexico .25 .67
South Korea N.A. .67
Brazil .50 1.00

Source: Alex Cukierman and Steven Webb, “Political In-
fluence on the Central Bank—International Evidence,”
paper prepared for the meeting of the American Political
Science Association, New York, August 31–September 4,
1994. N.A.–Not available.

place of the financial and industrial sectors in Brazil’s national produc-
tion profile also did not change sufficiently over time to account for the
variation in central bank authority. A similar misfit between sectoral
change and variation in central bank authority is apparent in Thailand,
Mexico, and South Korea.

The legal argument also appears inadequate in explaining static,
cross-national variation in central bank authority, at least in the
four country histories examined here. Average legal independence
for the period 1950–1989 yields .21 for Brazil, .27 for both Thailand
and South Korea, and .34 for Mexico, based on the Cukierman et al.
(1992) codings. Yet it is not clear from the histories that Korea deserves
a higher ranking than Brazil in terms of central bank authority. This
coding also obscures the serious decline in authority suffered by the
Banco de México in the 1970s. Thailand, moreover, appears to deserve
a higher ranking than South Korea. Quantitative political measures
of central bank independence fit the historical record much better than
do legal measures. Cukierman and Webb’s measure of central bank
political vulnerability calculates the fraction of political transitions
followed within six months by a change in the central bank gover-
norship.1 Their measures of political vulnerability, shown in Table
9.1, find the Bank of Thailand least vulnerable and the Bank of Brazil
most vulnerable.

The important point about sectoral arguments highlighted in all
four histories is that domestic financiers’ influence on central bank in-
dependence varies over time with the degree of leverage gained from
ties to international financiers in times of need for international credit-
worthiness and with the scope of sectors’ political access. The less
competitive the system, the less likely it is that there will be a strong
and consistent correspondence between a nation’s production profile
and a politician’s preferences about economic policy and economic
institutions.2 In Brazilian monetary policy the influence of private
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bankers, enshrined in law by the changes of 1964 and for a time al-
lowed to operate, swiftly eroded when military leaders of a different
stripe came to power in 1967. Delfim Netto was the architect of the
Brazilian central bank’s rapid decline after 1967. While he eventually
came to be seen as having very close ties to São Paulo industrialists, he
was able to undermine central bank authority rapidly and thoroughly
because he had the backing of a military regime and because the coun-
try had relatively little objective need for international creditworthi-
ness. Yet intense political competition in a context of fragmentation
and a weak party system hindered the success of central bank pro-
posals prior to 1964. In this setting, even the growing leverage gained
by proponents of central bank independence as Brazil’s international
financial situation deteriorated was insufficient to tilt the domestic po-
litical scales in their favor.

A purely sectoral argument is a poor predictor of change in central
bank authority in the other three country histories as well. As in Brazil
in 1967, in Korea after 1956 it was not sectoral demand from expansion-
oriented industry or labor that primarily induced political leaders to
encroach on central bank authority. In both the Brazilian and the Ko-
rean cases an increasingly authoritarian context and the low value of
competing for international creditworthiness created space for political
elites to pursue a state-centered, rapid industrialization policy that re-
quired central bank subordination. Strong expansion-oriented indus-
trialist groups later emerged in both countries, after central bank au-
thority had been undermined.

Later in Korean history partial political liberalization created the
opening for a central bank independence movement. The impetus came
not from a stronger domestic financial sector but from pro-democracy
forces seeking to limit arbitrary state power through every means possi-
ble. This movement failed in part because there was no incentive or
obvious opportunity to seek the support of international financiers. In
a fragmented, unstable party system still under strong authoritarian
sway, no Korean political party saw great benefit in pushing central
bank independence in the face of strong state opposition.

In Mexico a relatively sophisticated private financial sector devel-
oped in the 1950s and 1960s, earlier than in many other developing
countries. Yet the influence of this sector on the actions of political lead-
ers varied with the international financial context. Influence was large
when the need to compete for international creditworthiness was high
in the 1950s, 1980s, and 1990s and low when the world was awash with
petrodollars in the 1970s. Extreme presidentialism and semi-authori-
tarian one-party domination of national politics allowed the sudden
override of different groups’ preferred policies. This is evident both in
the case of the 1954 devaluation and the related rise in central bank
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authority and in the case of the 1972 embrace of expansionary policy
and the related decline in central bank authority.

Unlike Mexican political elites, Thai leaders had no reason to make
sudden populist appeals. Nonetheless Thai proponents of central bank
independence, whether private financiers, military men, or techno-
crats, have found that their fortunes wax and wane, albeit less sud-
denly and dramatically than in Mexico, with the leverage to be gained
from connections to international financiers when the need to compete
for international creditworthiness is high.

In all four countries there has been a long-term trend toward in-
creased industrial share of GNP and more sophisticated financial
markets. Over the long run financial sector development, including in-
ternationalization, will lead inevitably to greater central bank indepen-
dence for a variety of reasons. In addition to the need to compete for
international capital, increasingly sophisticated financial markets both
require and reinforce central bank independence. Financial markets re-
quire effective regulation and macroeconomic predictability. Financial
market actors recognize the importance of the international card in the
fight for central bank independence. They also dislike arbitrary power
and are likely to reward emerging markets where political systems
with a large number of institutionalized veto points protect central
bank independence.

Robust financial markets also eliminate the seignorage rationale for
central bank subordination. Both the Brazilian and the South Korean
country histories illustrate the role that subordinate central banks play
in financial repression, which helps to keep both demand for money
and government opportunity for seignorage income high.3 Both of
these countries also sustained relatively great restriction on interna-
tional financial transactions. This partially limited the potential for cap-
ital flight and mitigated concern over international creditworthiness in
comparison with countries with more open financial markets, such as
Mexico and Thailand.4 As Brazil and South Korea follow the global
trend toward financial market deregulation, we should see growing
pressure for central bank independence in those countries.

Regression Analysis of Central Bank Independence
and Private Investment

The investor-signaling argument developed here requires that politi-
cians believe that central bank independence is an effective signal, not
that it actually is one. Nonetheless the argument should be more con-
vincing if central bank independence and private investment are corre-
lated. While it is difficult to reliably separate domestic from foreign
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investment in developing countries, it is possible to test the impact of
central bank independence on private investment in general. Control-
ling for a series of economic and political variables that also affect
private investment in developing countries, we find some association
of de jure central bank independence with private investment.5 These
econometric results are consistent with an argument that politicians
are more likely to delegate authority to central banks the more they
make growth of private investment a priority. Although the data do
not allow us to distinguish between domestic and international finance
of investment, the signaling effect should apply to both domestic and
foreign investors.

The regression tested is a reduced-form specification of private in-
vestment:

ECONOMIC VARIABLES
PRIVGDP = f [EXPGRO(+), PUBIGDP(+), DEBTEXP(−), INFL(+),

INFLSQ(−),

POLITICAL VARIABLES
CBI(+), DEMOC(+), SCOPE (−)]

where PRIVGDP is private investment as a share of GDP, and the
first five variables are “economic”: EXPGRO is the expected growth
rate; PUBIGDP is the (lagged) rate of public sector investment as a
share of GDP; DEBTEXP is a measure of the expected debt burden, or
“overhang,” as deflated by exports; INFL is the (lagged) inflation rate;
INFLSQ is the square of INFL; DEMO is democracy; and SCOPE is the
level of public intervention in the economy. Table 9.2 provides detailed
explanations of the variables’ sources, actual construction, and lag
structure.

The rationales for the signs on the economic variables are straightfor-
ward extensions of traditional theory.6 Expectations of faster growth,
for example, should increase investment. We expect public investment
to have a positive effect on private investment; that is, we postulate
that the “crowding in” effect dominates in the developing world.7 We
also expect that higher ratios of external debt will lower private invest-
ment, primarily because a large debt burden acts as a sort of expected
“tax” on future output.8 The inflation variable is a proxy for macroeco-
nomic stability, a factor clearly important in determining the degree of
confidence investors attach to their expectations of future growth and
hence their need for additional capital stock. Moderate rates of infla-
tion, however, may actually enhance investment by raising short-term
profit expectations (since nominal wages often lag, particularly in de-
veloping economies); only when rates are high does the instability ef-
fect dominate and produce lessened investment. This suggests that the
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TABLE 9.2
Economic and Political Variables in the Investment Equation: Definitions and Sources

Private investment as a percentage of GDP. Taken from Guy P.PRIVGDP
Pfefferman and Andrea Madarassy, “Trends in Private Investment
in Thirty Developing Countries 1993: Statistics for 1970–91,” Inter-
national Financial Corporation Discussion Paper 16 (Washington,
D.C.: World Bank, 1992).

Expected growth rate. Calculated as the growth rate for the previousEXPGRO
year, following Joshua Greene and Delano Villanueva, “Private In-
vestment in Developing Countries: An Empirical Analysis,” IMF
Staff Papers, 38, 1 (March 1991), and Luis Serven and Andrés
Solimano, “Private Investment and Macroeconomic Adjustment:
A Survey,” World Bank Research Observer 7, 1 (1992). Growth rates
from World Bank, World Debt Tables (Washington, D.C.: World
Bank, various years).

Public investment as a percentage of GDP. Data from Guy P. Pfeffer-PUBIGDP
man and Andrea Madarassy, “Trends in Private Investment in
Thirty Developing Countries 1993: Statistics for 1970–91,” Inter-
national Financial Corporation Discussion Paper 16 (Washington,
D.C.: World Bank, 1992).

A measure of the debt overhang calculated as the ratio of total exter-DEBTEXP
nal debt to exports, with both measures from World Debt Tables.
Entered as a lag.

The natural log of the inflation rate. Calculated using the GDP deflatorINFL
from World Bank Tables, since this price index proxies the producer
price index most relevant to the investment decision more closely
than the Consumer Price Index–based rate. The variable is entered
as a lag because of adaptive expectations assumptions and to re-
duce any simultaneity problems.

The square of INFL.INFLSQ
An additive 10-point scale determined by quantitative ratings of com-DEMOC

petitiveness of political participation, competitiveness of executive
recruitment, openness of executive recruitment, and constraint on
chief executive. From Ted Robert Gurr, Polity II: Political Structures
and Regime Change, 1800–1896 (Ann Arbor: Inter-University Consor-
tium for Political and Social Research [magnetic tape], 1990).

A measure of the extent of government intervention in the economySCOPE
ranging from 1 (highest) to 9 (lowest). From Ted Robert Gurr, Polity
II: Political Structures and Regime Change, 1800–1896 (Ann Arbor:
Inter-University Consortium for Political and Social Research [mag-
netic tape], 1990).

Alex Cukierman, Steven B. Webb, and Bilin Neyapti, “Measuring theCBI
Independence of Central Banks,” World Bank Economic Review, 6, 3
(September 1992), and coding of post-1989 charters.
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inflation-investment relationship may be that of an inverted U—mod-
erate price hikes enhance investment while “excessive” inflation deters
investment. This is the specification used.9 We assume that more demo-
cratic political institutions are consistent with better economic perfor-
mance, partly because of the policy stability gained when more citizens
have access to the policymaking process.10 SCOPE allows us to control
for the level of government intervention in the economy. CBI is a
measure of aggregate legal central bank independence taken from
Cukierman et al. (1992).11 Although legal central bank independence is
an imperfect measure, it is the only one available for a broad sample of
developing countries.

The CBI variable we take from Cukierman et al. (1992) is a summary
measure across several periods for numerous countries in the develop-
ing and developed world. Unfortunately, the constraints posed by our
other variables (the private investment measure is only available from
1970, our growth measure begins in 1972, and our democracy and
scope measures end in 1986) mean that we can only use two of their
periods (1972–1979 and 1980–1989). There are twenty-one countries in
the developing world for which we could collect all the relevant data:
Argentina, Bolivia, Brazil, Chile, Colombia, Costa Rica, India, Indone-
sia, Kenya, Korea, Malaysia, Mexico, Morocco, Nigeria, Pakistan, Peru,
the Philippines, Thailand, Turkey, Uruguay, and Venezuela. For most
of these countries there is no variation in central bank independence
between the two subperiods. Thus data limitations only allow a strong
test for the cross-sectional impact of CBI. We use a random effects (RE)
regression technique which captures both cross-section and time ef-
fects and allows for time-invariant country-specific variables to be
tested and have an effect on the dependent variable.12

In Table 9.3 we report the regression results for the various random
effects runs.13 The first column includes just the economic variables.
Note that the base regression performs well, if not spectacularly so. The
second column introduces CBI with less than stellar results; the eco-
nomic variables remain the same (with INFL improving slightly) and
CBI is signed as expected but with a t-score of only 0.776. Columns (3),
(4), and (5) explore the political/institutional relations in a step-by-step
fashion. In column (3), we first add DEMOC to the regression; note that
the variable itself is significant at the .05 level, that growth, debt, and
public investment remain highly significant, and that the inflation vari-
ables are more or less the same as before. CBI obtains the expected sign
and its t-score improves, but only to slightly above one. Column (4)
then drops the DEMOC variable and introduces only SCOPE. We
should stress that the sign of this variable, SCOPE, is not really what is
at issue; more important is controlling for the level of government in-
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TABLE 9.3
Private Investment and Central Bank Independence

Dependent Variable = PRIVGDP

0.255EXPGRO 0.2430.2480.2540.240
(6.076)*** (6.032)*** (5.810)*** (5.736)***(6.857)***

0.1460.1340.2000.1940.192PUBIGDP
(1.910)* (1.999)** (1.273) (1.396)#(1.914)*

−0.550−0.552−0.574−0.637−0.668DEBTEXP
(−3.885)*** (−3.507)*** (−3.354)*** (−3.373)***(−4.121)***

0.6900.6610.8890.7300.599INFL
(1.300)# (1.599)# (1.088) (1.143)(1.085)

−0.125−0.116−0.135−0.118−0.105INFLSQ
(−1.828)* (−2.084)** (−1.703)* (−1.847)*(−1.653)*

0.1340.150CBI 0.056 0.072
(1.980)** (1.807)*(1.035)(0.776)

0.1690.163DEMOC
(2.129)**(2.043)**

SCOPE 0.5720.656
(1.506)#(1.832)*

0.306 0.3180.2970.3010.297Adjusted R2

246 245 216 216246Number of
observations

14.2*** 12.1*** 11.5*** 11.0***18.2***F-value

*** Significant at the two-tail 1 percent level.
** Significant at the two-tail 5 percent level.
* Significant at the two-tail 10 percent level.
# Significant at the two-tail 20 percent level.

tervention. CBI is positive and significant at the .05 level. Finally, we
turn to the full model in column (5). Again the economic variables are
more or less as before. Note that SCOPE falls slightly in significance
while CBI is positive and significant at the .10 level.14

Although not overwhelming, these results provide indirect quantita-
tive support for the investor signaling model of central bank indepen-
dence. The test is for legal independence, with all the limitations of
concept and measurement noted in previous chapters. Even though we
are unable to differentiate between domestic and foreign investors’ re-
sponses to central bank independence, the signaling effect should
apply to both. In fact the signaling effect should be stronger for foreign
investors to the extent that “complete” local information is costly for
them to obtain.
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Desirability of Central Bank Independence
in Developing Countries

What do the country experiences surveyed here suggest about the de-
sirability of central bank independence in developing countries, as
measured by its impact on growth, distribution, and democracy? Em-
pirical research has moved farthest in addressing questions about
growth, although almost all the research focuses on industrial coun-
tries. The one exception, noted in Chapter 1, is the 1993 study by
Cukierman and his colleagues finding a positive effect on growth in
developing countries, but no effect in industrial countries.15 The results
reported earlier in this chapter reinforce the Cukierman et al. (1993)
findings; for developing countries, the greater the central bank inde-
pendence, the higher the private investment. Controversy over how
best to quantitatively measure central bank independence suggests
that these results are probably sensitive to the measures used.

All four of the country histories examined here reveal periods of
high growth that do not necessarily coincide with periods of rising cen-
tral bank authority. Nor does the relationship appear more conclusive
if we evaluate the countries in static cross-national comparison. Mexico
and Thailand have had relatively more independent central banks, de
facto, than Brazil or Korea. Yet Korean growth has been consistently
higher than that of the other three countries.

Even if there is some uncertainty over the extent of the contribution
of central bank independence to growth in developing countries, un-
less there is reason to fear that the impact might be growth reducing,
the potential benefits may well outweigh the costs. The costs are more
likely to stem from the distributional consequences of central bank in-
dependence and its impact on employment.

One of the more common criticisms of central bank independence is
that it may lead to economic policy that is less employment-promoting
than the ideal policy of the median voter and/or that is not social-
welfare optimizing. This critique is related to the fact that central bank-
ers are likely to be more conservative than the average voter and are
not directly accountable to the electorate.

One of the problems in evaluating the distributional impact of cen-
tral bank independence stems from the mixed nature of wage bargain-
ing in most nations. The rationale for central bank independence is
stronger when pressure for employment-motivated inflationary mone-
tary policy is greater. The models that show strong pressure assume a
unionized labor force.16 But most countries have both union and non-
union labor forces. Under these circumstances Cukierman shows that
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there is also pressure, and therefore a strong rationale for central bank
independence, if the supply of nonunion labor does not correspond to
real wage rates or if the supply/demand dynamics of the unionized
and nonunionized sectors are more different than similar.17 The extent
to which these conditions fit the empirical reality of developing coun-
tries remains an open question. The latest monetary game theory does
little to resolve the debate over the strength of the rationale for central
bank independence.

Franzese finds empirical support in OECD countries for a slightly
different argument. He suggests that there is little inflation-fighting ra-
tionale for central bank independence in the context of centralized wage
bargaining systems such as Austria’s.18 The more decentralized the
wage bargaining system, the greater the inflation-fighting rationale for
central bank independence. These findings suggest that in countries,
such as Japan, with firm-level wage bargaining, inflation will be lower
to the extent the central bank is independent. This argument is hard to
extend to non-OECD countries. Consider the countries highlighted
here. Korea has enjoyed relatively low inflation rates under a dependent
central bank. But one could hardly imagine effective centralized wage
bargaining in the authoritarian political environment Korea has had for
most of the post–World War II era. Brazil and Mexico have suffered
high inflation under a dependent central bank with a relatively central-
ized wage bargaining system, which is supposedly a recipe for good
macroeconomic performance. Thailand is the only country of the four
that fits Franzese’s model: an independent central bank combined with
decentralized wage bargaining yields low inflation.

Like Franzese, Notermans and Garret imply that certain kinds of na-
tional labor institutions may facilitate high employment, low wages,
and little inflationary pressure.19 If such labor institutions can be found
and built, they could reduce the potential tension between full employ-
ment and national ability to attract and keep capital in a world of
integrated financial markets. Most work on this topic has focused on
advanced industrial countries, but its implications for developing
countries are great. The restructuring of Mexican corporatism, for ex-
ample, involving centralized wage bargaining with labor a visibly
weak and quiescent party to the negotiations, is part of an effort to
retain labor support for the ruling political party, the PRI, while doing
everything possible to build the confidence of domestic and interna-
tional creditors and investors.

The impact of central bank independence on employment in devel-
oping countries is an important area for future research. Nonetheless,
engaging in debate over the employment costs of central bank indepen-
dence could well be viewed as a luxury for those operating within the
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reference frame of an industrializing country. In 1995, the cost of a
history of macroeconomic instability in many middle-income industri-
alizing countries still greatly outweighed any possible employment
benefits from subordinating the central bank. Furthermore, financial
expertise is so thin in many of these countries that independent central
banks arguably provide a net social benefit simply as a training ground
for policy-oriented economists.20

Concern over the threat central bank independence may pose to
democratic accountability could also be somewhat misplaced in a de-
veloping country context.21 As the 1987–88 Korean central bank inde-
pendence movement illustrates, in an authoritarian political context
central bank independence is more likely to be democracy-enhancing
than democracy-detracting. Many also interpreted the increased legal
independence of the Mexican central bank, legislated in 1993, as a posi-
tive contribution to the slow process of political liberalization by reduc-
ing the authority of the Mexican presidency, one of the most powerful
in the world.

The concern more relevant to the developing country context is that
central bank independence can hinder policy coordination. This sug-
gests that provisions for, and institutionalization of, central bank in-
volvement in the budget process may be one of the most important
building blocks for a strong, effective, and welfare-enhancing central
bank in the developing country context.

Those who agree that the internationalization of finance lurks be-
hind central bank independence make a slightly different argument
about its implications for distribution and democracy. To the extent
that central bank independence is a function of the globalization of
financial markets, Freeman contends that it undermines local and na-
tional governments’ abilities to “control . . . [the] allocation of credit
within nation-states.” “This bears directly on governments’ capacity,”
Freeman continues, “to promote distributive justice and . . . promote
the welfare of particular groups.”22 As noted in Chapter 1, Epstein also
argues that independent central banks can thwart Keynesian-type eco-
nomic policies often favored by labor and some industrial sectors.23

These arguments suggest that national politicians are increasingly
caught between the demands of internationally mobile capital and the
exigencies of domestic politics. The pressures are more disparate the
stronger the national, expansion-oriented political coalitions.

The extent of the structural power of international capital and the
tension between international economic forces and national economic
policy has become a clear theme in the literature on comparative and
international political economy. But the empirical bias toward OECD
countries also limits the value of this debate for students of developing
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countries. A host of articles have proved that the structural power of
international capital to bring about convergence in national economic
policies and institutions is limited in an OECD country context.24 Al-
though data limitations confound researchers’ ability to replicate these
studies for non-OECD country samples, more research is needed. Stu-
dents of developing countries tend to be much less sanguine about the
ability of national institutions and policies to withstand the onslaught
of international capital.25

Although the structural power of international capital may have lit-
tle impact in OECD countries right now, could it not be that the future
of OECD countries will look increasingly like the present in non-OECD
countries? As independent national monetary policy becomes more
difficult to pursue, it is more and more likely that the economic impact
of individual central bank actions in OECD countries will pale beside
the role of exchange markets, exchange rate regimes, international
shocks, and internationally coordinated responses to them. This book
suggests several obvious areas for future work, including constructing
data allowing for more rigorous empirical testing in developing coun-
try samples of OECD-oriented political arguments about economic pol-
icy and institutions, and building formal models of the open-economy
politics of economic policy choice implied here. But the notion that the
future of the OECD may look like the present in the stylized small,
open economy directs our attention to the fundamental factors behind
growing capital account openness and the liquidity structure of inter-
national financial assets. Commenting on these trends, Pauly argues
that lack of control over finance is inevitably undermining the legiti-
macy of the nation-state and that a new basis for nationhood, exclusive
of economic control, must emerge.26

Feasibility of Central Bank Independence
in Developing Countries

If we assume that for the short and medium term, especially in middle-
income developing countries, central bank authority is desirable, what
do this book’s findings suggest about how it is best achieved? Legal
change should not be considered a panacea. Central bank authority
comes from financial markets and political leaders, not necessarily in-
dependently of each other. Because the risk to central bank indepen-
dence of overt involvement in politics is great, especially if political
instability is rising or polarization is high, the political burden must fall
disproportionately on proponents of central bank independence out-
side the institution itself. Yet the political realm is unpredictable. To the
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extent possible, the most effective strategy for securing central bank
independence is to focus first on financial market development.27

Conduct of monetary policy becomes very complex, even if central
banks are nominally independent, when “authorities are faced with
widespread risk and insolvency among financial institutions.”28 In fact,
it is difficult for the central bank to effectively conduct any of the func-
tions outlined in Chapter 1 if financial markets are not robust. In the
first and last instance central bank authority will respond to how effec-
tively the central bank conducts its primary tasks. Furthermore, the
more robust financial markets are, the easier it is for the central bank to
be open and transparent about its operations. It is less risky to provide
public information when the bank can “blame the markets” in the face
of complaints. Over time, public understanding of how and why the
central bank acts is also an important source of authority.

This book has focused on national politicians and the increasingly
international financial markets in recently industrialized countries. The
preceding chapters have evaluated the politics of central bank indepen-
dence in middle-income developing countries and have emphasized
the impact of financial markets on politicians’ decisions to share eco-
nomic policymaking authority with the central bank.
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